
OHIO TURNPIKE AND INFRASTRUCTURE COMMISSION
  682 PROSPECT STREET

BEREA, OHIO  44017

OPENING DATE

AUGUST 1, 2016

BID INVITATION NUMBER 4278

FOR FURNISHING PNEUMATIC TIRES

"C"   Jam Best One Fleet Service

ITEM # "A" "B" "C" "D" "E"

1 70.01$         63.00$         114.00$       74.01$         86.32$         

2 70.09$         62.00$         116.00$       117.34$       71.97$         

3 99.34$         83.00$         124.00$       103.34$       110.89$       

4 72.47$         82.00$         124.00$       77.47$         76.47$         

5 110.78$       114.00$       161.00$       103.32$       156.76$       

6 145.70$       166.00$       222.00$       149.70$       185.00$       

7 125.72$       143.00$       181.00$       185.00$       175.00$       

8 133.39$       151.00$       189.00$       137.39$       175.00$       

9 120.66$       147.00$       187.00$       124.66$       165.00$       

10 106.11$       116.00$       155.00$       110.11$       135.69$       

11 120.25$       134.00$       151.00$       124.25$       153.00$       

12 283.60$       277.00$       315.71$       NO BID 287.60$       

13 134.50$       235.00$       269.76$       NO BID 271.31$       

14 431.00$       485.00$       589.71$       375.00$       458.00$       

15 428.48$       350.00$       443.02$       275.00$       373.00$       

16 419.48$       395.00$       511.53$       325.00$       438.00$       

17 391.39$       563.00$       563.84$       365.00$       495.00$       

18 76.50$         66.00$         91.00$         52.00$         104.00$       

19 71.75$         62.00$         89.00$         60.00$         76.84$         

20 84.50$         73.00$         98.00$         77.00$         126.00$       

21 92.75$         80.00$         106.00$       70.00$         118.00$       

22 89.25$         77.00$         103.00$       81.00$         82.40$         

23 105.75$       91.00$         112.00$       100.00$       97.06$         

24 224.79$       290.00$       301.51$       199.00$       248.34$       

25 45.75$         38.00$         66.00$         38.00$         52.00$         

26 137.50$       128.00$       172.00$       148.00$       200.00$       

27 678.00$       630.00$       741.00$       468.00$       936.00$       

28 1,742.00$    1,200.00$    1,434.00$    645.00$       1,350.00$    

29 39.00$         25.00$         59.00$         18.00$         64.40$         

30 76.50$         64.00$         85.00$         44.00$         98.50$         

31 393.00$       350.00$       298.00$       290.00$       410.00$       

32 1,091.94$    854.00$       558.00$       625.00$       780.00$       

33 728.87$       538.00$       677.00$       415.00$       825.00$       

34 123.51$       121.00$       166.42$       68.00$         137.00$       

35 462.62$       838.00$       991.00$       270.00$       800.00$       

36 253.89$       284.00$       403.00$       190.00$       410.00$       

37 82.75$         NO BID NO BID 65.00$         160.35$       

38 538.65$       655.00$       775.00$       399.00$       650.00$       

TERMS NET NET NET NET NET

UNIT COST PER TIRE

BIDDERS

 "A"    Belle Tire

"E"   Smiley Tire & Retreading

"B"   Cap 360 LLC

"D"   North Gateway Tire Co., Inc.


