
OHIO TURNPIKE AND INFRASTRUCTURE COMMISSION
682 PROSPECT STREET

BEREA, OHIO 44017
***BID INVITATION NO. 4236 AWARDED TO: PROCUREMENT SECTION  

PERFECT SWEEP, INC.***
BID INVITATION NO. 4236

 
PAVEMENT SWEEPING SERVICE

 

 

GROUP I GROUP I GROUP II GROUP II GROUP II
BIDDER ITEM 1 RATES ITEM 2 RATES ITEM 1 RATES ITEM 2 RATES ITEM 3 RATES TERMS

A.H. Ross Corporation Hourly - 28.00$         Hourly - 28.00$         Hourly - 28.00$         Hourly - 28.00$         Hourly - 28.00$         NET
4730 W. Bancroft Street, Suite 1 Daily - 224.00$       Daily - 224.00$       Daily - 224.00$       Daily - 224.00$       Daily - 224.00$       
Toledo, Ohio 43615 Weekly - 1,120.00$    Weekly - 1,120.00$    Weekly - 1,120.00$    Weekly - 1,120.00$    Weekly - 1,120.00$    

Monthly - 4,480.00$    Monthly - 4,480.00$    Monthly - 4,480.00$    Monthly - 4,480.00$    Monthly - 4,480.00$    
  

Perfect Sweep, Inc. Hourly - 94.00$         Hourly - 94.00$         Hourly - 94.00$         Hourly - 94.00$         Hourly - 94.00$         1%
1202 Expressway Drive South Daily - 675.00$       Daily - 675.00$       Daily - 675.00$       Daily - 675.00$       Daily - 675.00$       
Toledo, Ohio 43608 Weekly - 3,150.00$    Weekly - 3,150.00$    Weekly - 3,150.00$    Weekly - 3,150.00$    Weekly - 3,150.00$    

Monthly - 12,600.00$  Monthly - 12,600.00$  Monthly - 12,600.00$  Monthly - 12,600.00$  Monthly - 12,600.00$  

DeAngelo Brothers, Inc. Hourly - 203.81$       Hourly - 203.81$       Hourly - 227.25$       Hourly - 227.25$       Hourly - 227.25$       NET
2080 South State Route 19 Daily - 1,630.48$    Daily - 1,630.48$    Daily - 1,818.00$    Daily - 1,818.00$    Daily - 1,818.00$    
Oak Harbor, Ohio 43449 Weekly - 8,152.40$    Weekly - 8,152.40$    Weekly - 9,112.40$    Weekly - 9,112.40$    Weekly - 9,112.40$    

Monthly - 32,129.60$  Monthly - 32,129.60$  Monthly - 36,040.00$  Monthly - 36,040.00$  Monthly - 36,040.00$  

Ever Brite, Inc. Hourly - NO BID Hourly - NO BID Hourly - 125.00$       Hourly - 125.00$       Hourly - 125.00$       2%
12546 Mahoning Avenue Daily - NO BID Daily - NO BID Daily - 1,000.00$    Daily - 1,000.00$    Daily - 1,000.00$    
North Jackson, Ohio 44451 Weekly - NO BID Weekly - NO BID Weekly - 5,000.00$    Weekly - 5,000.00$    Weekly - 5,000.00$    

Monthly - NO BID Monthly - NO BID Monthly - 20,000.00$  Monthly - 20,000.00$  Monthly - 20,000.00$  

Reilly Sweeping Inc. Hourly - NO BID Hourly - NO BID Hourly - 130.00$       Hourly - 130.00$       Hourly - 130.00$       NET
20350 Hannan Parkway Daily - NO BID Daily - NO BID Daily - 1,040.00$    Daily - 1,040.00$    Daily - 1,040.00$    
Walton Hills, Ohio 44146 Weekly - NO BID Weekly - NO BID Weekly - 5,200.00$    Weekly - 5,200.00$    Weekly - 5,200.00$    

Monthly - NO BID Monthly - NO BID Monthly - 20,800.00$  Monthly - 20,800.00$  Monthly - 20,800.00$  
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