
OHIO  TURNPIKE AND INFRASTRUCTURE COMMISSION 

682  PROSPECT  STREET 

BEREA, OHIO  44017 

PROCUREMENT SECTION 

 

BID  INVITATION  NO.  4305 

 

FOR  FURNISHING HOT WATER PRESSURE WASHER WITH UNDERCARRIAGE WASH UNIT 

 

OPENING DATE  -  AUGUST 29, 2017 

 

GROUP I  GROUP II 

BIDDER        TOTAL  TOTAL    TERMS  
   

Heatech Cleaning Systems & Equipment Inc.  Item 1:  $  7,826.24  Item 1:  No Bid   Net    

360 N. Main Street      Item 2 : $  8,400.00  Item 2 : No Bid 

Huron, Ohio 44839      Item 3 : $16,800.00 

 

Enzo’s Cleaning Solutions, LLC    Item 1 :  $   8,610.00  Item 1 :  $ 7,200.00   Net 

2003 Superior St., Suite A     Item 2 :  $   8,506.00  Item 2 :  $ 7,200.00 

Sandusky, Ohio 44870     Item 3 :  $ 17,012.00 

 

Crown Cleaning Systems & Supply, Inc.   Item 1 :  $   9,348.00  Item 1 :  $ 5,948.00   Net 

7770 Harvard Avenue      Item 2 :  $   9,348.00  Item 2 :  $ 5,948.00  

Cleveland, Ohio 44105     Item 3 :  $ 18,696.00 

 

All Spray       Item 1:  $  9,550.00  Item 1:  $ 7,860.00   Net 

121 S. Main Street      Item 2:  $  9,550.00  Item 2:  $ 7,860.00 

Swanton, Ohio 43558      Item 3:  $ 19,100.00  

 

Johnson Wash Systems, LLC     Item 1:  $ 12,594.00  Item 1:  $ 10,056.00   1% 

6132 Cottonwood Drive     Item 2:  $ 12,594.00  Item 2:  $ 10,056.00 

Whitmore Lake, Michigan 48189    Item 3:  $ 25,188.00 

 

Professional Electric Products Co. (PEPCO)   Item 1:  $ 15,716.92  Item 1:  No Bid   Net 

33210 Lakeland Blvd.      Item 2:  $ 15,716.92  Item 2:  No Bid 

Eastlake, Ohio 44095      Item 3:  $ 31,433.84 

 

***BID INVITATION NO. 4305 AWARDED TO ENZO’S CLEANING SOLUTIONS, LLC*** 

 


