
OHIO TURNPIKE AND INFRASTRUCTURE COMMISSION
682 PROSPECT STREET

BEREA, OHIO 44017
PROCUREMENT SECTION  

BID INVITATION NO. 4356
PAVEMENT SWEEPING SERVICE

 

GROUP I GROUP I GROUP I GROUP I
BIDDER ITEM 1 RATES ITEM 2 RATES ITEM 3 RATES ITEM 4 RATES TERMS

Perfect Sweep, Inc. Hourly - 110.00$         Hourly - 110.00$         Hourly - 110.00$         Hourly - 110.00$         1% - 10
1202 Expressway Drive South Daily - 880.00$         Daily - 880.00$         Daily - 880.00$         Daily - 880.00$         
Toledo, Ohio 43608 Weekly - 4,400.00$      Weekly - 4,400.00$      Weekly - 4,400.00$      Weekly - 4,400.00$      

Monthly - 17,600.00$    Monthly - 17,600.00$    Monthly - 17,600.00$    Monthly - 17,600.00$    

GROUP II GROUP II GROUP II GROUP II
ITEM 1 RATES ITEM 2 RATES ITEM 3 RATES ITEM 4 RATES

Hourly - 110.00$         Hourly - 110.00$         Hourly - 110.00$         Hourly - 110.00$         
Daily - 790.00$         Daily - 790.00$         Daily - 790.00$         Daily - 850.00$         
Weekly - 3,700.00$      Weekly - 3,700.00$      Weekly - 3,700.00$      Weekly - 3,900.00$      
Monthly - 15,000.00$    Monthly - 15,000.00$    Monthly - 15,000.00$    Monthly - 15,900.00$    

GROUP I GROUP I GROUP I GROUP I
BIDDER ITEM 1 RATES ITEM 2 RATES ITEM 3 RATES ITEM 4 RATES TERMS

 
Anthony Allega Cement Contractor Hourly - NO BID Hourly - NO BID Hourly - NO BID Hourly - NO BID 1% - 10
5585 Canal Road Daily - NO BID Daily - NO BID Daily - NO BID Daily - NO BID NET 20
Valley View, Ohio 44125 Weekly - NO BID Weekly - NO BID Weekly - NO BID Weekly - NO BID

Monthly - NO BID Monthly - NO BID Monthly - NO BID Monthly - NO BID

GROUP II GROUP II GROUP II GROUP II
ITEM 1 RATES ITEM 2 RATES ITEM 3 RATES ITEM 4 RATES

Hourly - 120.00$         Hourly - 120.00$         Hourly - 120.00$         Hourly - 120.00$         
Daily - 880.00$         Daily - 880.00$         Daily - 880.00$         Daily - 880.00$         
Weekly - 4,300.00$      Weekly - 4,300.00$      Weekly - 4,300.00$      Weekly - 4,300.00$      
Monthly - 17,000.00$    Monthly - 17,000.00$    Monthly - 17,000.00$    Monthly - 17,000.00$    
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OHIO TURNPIKE AND INFRASTRUCTURE COMMISSION
682 PROSPECT STREET

BEREA, OHIO 44017
 PROCUREMENT SECTION  

BID INVITATION NO. 4356
PAVEMENT SWEEPING SERVICE

 

GROUP I GROUP I GROUP I GROUP I
BIDDER ITEM 1 RATES ITEM 2 RATES ITEM 3 RATES ITEM 4 RATES TERMS

Reilly Sweeping Inc. Hourly - NO BID Hourly - NO BID Hourly - NO BID Hourly - NO BID NET
20350 Hannan Parkway Daily - NO BID Daily - NO BID Daily - NO BID Daily - NO BID
Walton Hills, Ohio 44146 Weekly - NO BID Weekly - NO BID Weekly - NO BID Weekly - NO BID

Monthly - NO BID Monthly - NO BID Monthly - NO BID Monthly - NO BID

GROUP II GROUP II GROUP II GROUP II
ITEM 1 RATES ITEM 2 RATES ITEM 3 RATES ITEM 4 RATES

Hourly - 124.00$         Hourly - 124.00$         Hourly - 124.00$         Hourly - 124.00$         
Daily - 992.00$         Daily - 992.00$         Daily - 992.00$         Daily - 992.00$         
Weekly - 4,960.00$      Weekly - 4,960.00$      Weekly - 4,960.00$      Weekly - 4,960.00$      
Monthly - 19,840.00$    Monthly - 19,840.00$    Monthly - 19,840.00$    Monthly - 19,840.00$    
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