
OHIO TURNPIKE AND INFRASTRUCTURE COMMISSION
682 PROSPECT STREET

BEREA, OHIO  44017

PROCUREMENT SECTION

INVITATION NUMBER  4386

FOR FURNISHING 
LAWN CARE SERVICES AT FOURTEEN (14) OHIO TURNPIKE SERVICE PLAZAS

OPENING  DATE  -  MARCH 1, 2021

ITEM 1 TOTAL ITEM 2 TOTAL
BIDDER MOWING FERTILIZATION

Ace Lawn Care & Landscaping, LLC GROUP A NO BID NO BID
2133 CR 181 GROUP B 13,200.00$         460.00$                
Green Springs, Ohio 44836 GROUP C 10,500.00$         490.00$                

GROUP D NO BID NO BID
GROUP E NO BID NO BID
GROUP F NO BID NO BID

Terms: Net GROUP G NO BID NO BID

ESK Landscaping, LLC GROUP A NO BID NO BID
15261 High Point Drive GROUP B NO BID NO BID
Strongsville, Ohio 44126 GROUP C 12,033.00$         500.00$                

GROUP D 9,009.00$           500.00$                
GROUP E 6,522.60$           500.00$                
GROUP F 8,133.30$           500.00$                

Terms: Net GROUP G 16,412.40$         500.00$                

Firelands Lawn & Landscape, Inc. GROUP A NO BID NO BID
248 Cleveland Road GROUP B NO BID 537.00$                
Norwalk, Ohio 44857 GROUP C 51,300.00$         594.00$                

GROUP D 39,180.00$         480.00$                
GROUP E NO BID 625.00$                
GROUP F NO BID NO BID

Terms: 2% GROUP G NO BID NO BID

Goodwill Industries of NW Ohio, Inc. GROUP A 14,250.00$         NO BID
1120 Madison Avenue GROUP B 13,890.00$         NO BID
Toledo, Ohio 43604 GROUP C 13,890.00$         NO BID

GROUP D NO BID NO BID
GROUP E NO BID NO BID
GROUP F NO BID NO BID

Terms: Net GROUP G NO BID NO BID

Hire a Vet Lawn Care, LLC GROUP A 30,000.00$         400.00$                
332 E. 7th Street GROUP B 15,000.00$         400.00$                
Port Clinton, Ohio 43452 GROUP C 13,500.00$         400.00$                

GROUP D 12,750.00$         400.00$                
GROUP E 30,000.00$         400.00$                
GROUP F 30,000.00$         400.00$                

Terms: 2% GROUP G 30,000.00$         400.00$                
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Rock Solid Landscape GROUP A 31,620.00$         207.99$                
13211 CR J GROUP B 36,817.50$         240.90$                
Wauseon, Ohio 43567 GROUP C NO BID NO BID

GROUP D NO BID NO BID
GROUP E NO BID NO BID
GROUP F NO BID NO BID

Terms: Net GROUP G NO BID NO BID

Rowser & Sons Lawn Maintenance GROUP A NO BID NO BID
1719 W. 20th Street GROUP B 12,226.80$         490.00$                
Lorain, Ohio 44052 GROUP C 9,960.00$           490.00$                

GROUP D 7,980.00$           490.00$                
GROUP E 5,700.00$           490.00$                
GROUP F NO BID NO BID

Terms: Net GROUP G NO BID NO BID

Todd's Enviroscapes, Inc. GROUP A NO BID NO BID
7727 Paris Avenue GROUP B NO BID NO BID
Louisville, Ohio 44641 GROUP C NO BID NO BID

GROUP D NO BID NO BID
GROUP E 11,610.00$         480.00$                
GROUP F 14,460.00$         415.00$                

Terms: Net GROUP G 16,275.00$         418.00$                

TTR Turf Control, LLC GROUP A 31,753.50$         500.00$                
3820 Homestead Road GROUP B 32,038.50$         500.00$                
Ravenna, Ohio 44266 GROUP C 23,347.50$         500.00$                

GROUP D 10,210.20$         500.00$                
GROUP E 7,798.50$           500.00$                
GROUP F 8,004.00$           500.00$                

Terms - 2% GROUP G 11,523.60$         500.00$                

**Awards as Follows**
Group A - Rock Solid Landscape, LLC 
Group B - Ace Lawn Care & Landscaping, LLC
Groups C, D, & E - Rowser & Sons Lawn Maintenance 
Group F - ESK Landscaping
Group G - Todd's Enviroscape 
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