
OHIO TURNPIKE AND INFRASTRUCTURE COMMISSION
682 PROSPECT STREET

BEREA, OHIO 44017
PROCUREMENT SECTION  

BID INVITATION NO. 4396
PAVEMENT SWEEPING SERVICE

 

GROUP I GROUP I GROUP I GROUP I
BIDDER ITEM 1 RATES ITEM 2 RATES ITEM 3 RATES ITEM 4 RATES TERMS

Progressive Sweeping Contractors, Inc. Hourly - 160.00$         Hourly - 145.00$         Hourly - 145.00$         Hourly - 160.00$         Net
5202 Enterprise Blvd. Daily - 982.00$         Daily - 925.00$         Daily - 925.00$         Daily - 982.00$         
Toledo, Ohio 43612 Weekly - 4,688.00$      Weekly - 4,400.00$      Weekly - 4,400.00$      Weekly - 4,688.00$      

Monthly - 18,755.00$    Monthly - 17,640.00$    Monthly - 17,640.00$    Monthly - 18,755.00$    

GROUP II GROUP II GROUP II GROUP II
ITEM 1 RATES ITEM 2 RATES ITEM 3 RATES ITEM 4 RATES

Hourly - 173.00$         Hourly -        no bid Hourly -       no bid Hourly -       no bid
Daily - 1,040.00$      Daily -        no bid Daily -       no bid Daily -       no bid
Weekly - 4,960.00$      Weekly -        no bid Weekly -       no bid Weekly -       no bid
Monthly - 19,845.00$    Monthly -        no bid Monthly -       no bid Monthly -       no bid

GROUP I GROUP I GROUP I GROUP I
BIDDER ITEM 1 RATES ITEM 2 RATES ITEM 3 RATES ITEM 4 RATES TERMS

 
Welshfield Trucking LLC Hourly - no bid Hourly - no bid Hourly - no bid Hourly - no bid Net
17917 Madison Rd. Daily - no bid Daily - no bid Daily - no bid Daily - no bid
Middlefield, Ohio 44062 Weekly - no bid Weekly - no bid Weekly - no bid Weekly - no bid

Monthly - no bid Monthly - no bid Monthly - no bid Monthly - no bid
       

GROUP II GROUP II GROUP II GROUP II
ITEM 1 RATES ITEM 2 RATES ITEM 3 RATES ITEM 4 RATES

Hourly - 111.00$         Hourly - 111.00$         Hourly - 111.00$         Hourly - 111.00$         
Daily - 888.00$         Daily - 888.00$         Daily - 888.00$         Daily - 888.00$         
Weekly - 4,400.00$      Weekly - 4,400.00$      Weekly - 4,400.00$      Weekly - 4,400.00$      
Monthly - 17,280.00$    Monthly - 17,280.00$    Monthly - 17,280.00$    Monthly - 17,280.00$    

OPENING DATE: NOVEMBER 4, 2021



GROUP I GROUP I GROUP I GROUP I
BIDDER ITEM 1 RATES ITEM 2 RATES ITEM 3 RATES ITEM 4 RATES TERMS

Perfect Sweep Inc. Hourly - 110.00$         Hourly - 110.00$         Hourly - 110.00$         Hourly - 110.00$         Net
1202 Expressway Dr. South Daily - 880.00$         Daily - 880.00$         Daily - 880.00$         Daily - 880.00$         
Toledo, Ohio 43608 Weekly - 4,200.00$      Weekly - 4,200.00$      Weekly - 4,200.00$      Weekly - 4,200.00$      

Monthly - 16,800.00$    Monthly - 16,800.00$    Monthly - 16,800.00$    Monthly - 16,800.00$    

GROUP II GROUP II GROUP II GROUP II
ITEM 1 RATES ITEM 2 RATES ITEM 3 RATES ITEM 4 RATES

Hourly - 110.00$         Hourly - 110.00$         Hourly - 110.00$         Hourly - 110.00$         
Daily - 790.00$         Daily - 790.00$         Daily - 790.00$         Daily - 790.00$         
Weekly - 3,600.00$      Weekly - 3,600.00$      Weekly - 3,600.00$      Weekly - 3,650.00$      
Monthly - 15,000.00$    Monthly - 15,000.00$    Monthly - 15,000.00$    Monthly - 15,000.00$    
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