
OHIO  TURNPIKE  COMMISSION 
682  PROSPECT  STREET 

BEREA, OHIO  44017 
PURCHASING SECTION 

 
BID  INVITATION  NO.  4089 

 
FOR FURNISHING 

CONCRETE CUTTING SAWS AND BLADES 
 

OPENING DATE   -   MARCH 11, 2008 
 
 

            UNIT PRICE EXTENDED TOTAL UNIT PRICE – ALT. 1 EXTENDED TOTAL PRICE          UNIT PRICE EXTENDED TOTAL  
            CONCRETE  PRICE CONCRETE DIESEL ENGINE  ALT. 1 – DIESEL ENGINE          DIAMOND  PRICE - DIAMOND 
BIDDER           CUTTING SAW CUTTING SAW              POWERED SAW         POWERED SAW                                      SAW BLADES SAW BLADES            TERMS 
 
Phillips Contractors Supply, LLC          $ 11,675.00       $ 58,375.00       $ 15,000.00       $ 75,000.00    $ 610.00       $ 3,050.00        Net 
1800 E. 30th Street 
Cleveland, Ohio 44114 
 
Hertz Equipment Rental Corporation       $ 11,676.65       $ 58,383.25       $ 15,001.12       $ 75,005.60    $ 654.26       $ 3,271.30        Net 
21913 Aurora Road 
Bedford Heights, Ohio 44146 
 
Ornamental Products Tool & Supply        $ 12,699.00       $ 63,495.00       $ 17,309.00       $ 85,195.00    $ 799.00       $ 3,995.00        Net 
5105 Pearl Road 
Cleveland, Ohio 44129 
 
Howard T. Moriarty Co., Inc.          $ 20,584.00       $102,920.00               $ 725.00       $ 3,625.00        Net 
143 Broadway 
Toledo, Ohio 43604 
 
National Diamond             NO BID          NO BID           NO BID            NO BID    $ 595.00       $ 2,975.00        Net 
3998 Fau Boulevard, Suite 100 
Boca Raton, Florida 33431 
 
 Item No. 1 of Bid Invitation No. 4089 was Awarded to Phillips Contractors Supply. 
 
 Item No. 2 of Bid Invitation No. 4089 was Awarded to National Diamond. 


