
 

OHIO TURNPIKE COMMISSION
  682 PROSPECT STREET

BEREA, OHIO  44017

OPENING DATE
OCTOBER 20, 2009

BID INVITATION NUMBER 4124 RE-BID

FOR FURNISHING PNEUMATIC TIRES

 A.    B & S Transport, Inc.

E.    Ziegler Tire & Supply Co. Inc.

ITEM # "A" "B" "C" "D" "E"

1 61.58$         79.00$         63.65$         62.29$         79.45$         
2 76.70$         62.00$         76.63$         89.68$         78.75$         
3 100.45$       149.05$       112.56$       137.58$       103.95$       
4 84.00$         74.25$         90.71$         103.98$       87.80$         
5 85.10$         121.35$       103.82$       110.31$       84.85$         
6 90.00$         89.30$         94.29$         106.70$       97.00$         
7 87.40$         99.35$         103.82$       114.31$       94.60$         
8 119.00$       174.95$       192.44$       187.79$       126.00$       
9 99.90$         103.65$       137.89$       116.98$       101.45$       
10 164.00$       NO BID 234.90$       180.00$       167.00$       
11 203.00$       NO BID 244.62$       205.00$       206.00$       
12 190.00$       NO BID 234.90$       207.00$       191.00$       
13 215.00$       NO BID 247.32$       223.00$       218.00$       
14 201.00$       199.95$       324.00$       220.00$       204.00$       
15 219.00$       NO BID 305.64$       180.00$       223.00$       
16 225.00$       NO BID 298.08$       185.00$       228.00$       
17 232.00$       236.35$       370.44$       278.00$       235.00$       
18 275.00$       254.85$       386.64$       270.00$       251.00$       
19 322.00$       NO BID 534.06$       362.00$       326.00$       
20 251.00$       NO BID 440.64$       280.00$       254.00$       
21 320.00$       NO BID 444.42$       282.00$       323.00$       
22 287.00$       NO BID 502.74$       300.00$       290.00$       
23 281.00$       NO BID 502.74$       315.00$       284.00$       
24 282.00$       NO BID 502.74$       375.00$       462.00$       
25 58.36$         NO BID NO BID 71.59$         60.00$         
26 97.70$         NO BID NO BID NO BID 50.00$         
27 166.31$       NO BID NO BID 105.33$       NO BID
28 198.00$       NO BID 243.54$       137.98$       201.00$       
29 65.96$         NO BID NO BID 79.78$         81.00$         
30 145.00$       153.45$       NO BID 125.00$       NO BID
31 NO BID NO BID NO BID 139.53$       NO BID
32 466.00$       490.00$       NO BID 475.20$       408.00$       
33 33.43$         24.00$         NO BID 20.33$         31.00$         
34 64.95$         60.00$         NO BID 53.80$         47.00$         
35 NO BID 80.00$         NO BID 88.00$         NO BID
36 92.81$         95.00$         NO BID 88.60$         NO BID
37 217.78$       111.75$       NO BID 120.86$       120.00$       
38 205.21$       685.00$       NO BID 260.40$       322.00$       
39 482.64$       305.00$       NO BID 338.20$       375.00$       
40 278.00$       272.35$       NO BID 273.20$       NO BID
41 702.59$       500.00$       NO BID 539.53$       530.00$       
42 1,750.00$    1,100.00$    NO BID 712.40$       530.00$       
43 535.00$       450.00$       NO BID 479.66$       580.00$       

TERMS NET NET NET NET NET

***Items 2, 33, 37 and 40 - Awarded to North Gateway Tire Company, Inc.
***Items 18, 34, 38 and 41- Awarded to Ziegler Tire & Supply
***Items 3, 6, 8, 12, 14, 19, 20, 27, 28, 30, 32, 36 and 43 - Awarded to B & S Transport
***Item 24 - Awarded to Tire Centers, LLC

 B.    North Gateway Tire Co., Inc.
C.    Tire Center Inc.
D.   Wingfoot CTS LLC

**Items 11, 13, 15, 16, 21 and 23 - Awarded to Wingoot CTS, LLC 


