
OHIO TURNPIKE COMMISSION
  682 PROSPECT STREET

BEREA, OHIO  44017

OPENING DATE
JULY 21, 2010

BID INVITATION NUMBER 4142

FOR FURNISHING PNEUMATIC TIRES

 A.    795 Tire Service

 

E.    Wingfoot Commercial Tire Systems

ITEM # "A" "B" "C" "D" "E" "F"

1 70.30$         73.73$         72.00$         69.00$         69.03$         NO BID
2 68.34$         84.30$         59.85$         76.00$         79.00$         77.50$         
3 137.57$       102.60$       146.00$       103.00$       112.00$       102.45$       
4 103.98$       83.80$         69.65$         75.00$         107.28$       75.35$         
5 108.66$       82.80$         124.65$       77.00$         89.00$         77.50$         
6 87.07$         94.99$         98.65$         99.20$         91.06$         108.25$       
7 118.66$       85.60$         107.00$       86.00$         109.00$       80.00$         
8 190.98$       129.69$       162.00$       130.00$       135.00$       149.13$       
9 106.60$       108.88$       106.00$       107.88$       117.00$       114.19$       
10 229.03$       195.82$       169.00$       161.00$       220.00$       162.00$       
11 252.85$       202.69$       179.00$       157.00$       245.00$       158.00$       
12 262.93$       221.09$       192.00$       188.00$       260.00$       189.00$       
13 261.81$       204.41$       199.00$       208.00$       270.00$       210.00$       
14 233.49$       210.68$       189.00$       202.00$       253.62$       204.00$       
15 288.16$       234.52$       237.00$       195.00$       204.00$       231.00$       
16 264.28$       249.96$       205.00$       196.00$       235.00$       256.46$       
17 340.80$       256.42$       215.00$       212.00$       245.00$       231.00$       
18 252.00$       241.50$       259.00$       250.00$       265.00$       267.00$       
19 433.29$       316.50$       367.00$       330.00$       475.00$       330.00$       
20 389.09$       244.50$       350.00$       268.00$       375.00$       275.00$       
21 442.15$       345.09$       355.00$       251.00$       315.00$       294.00$       
22 509.99$       262.50$       415.00$       281.00$       340.64$       276.00$       
23 442.93$       269.50$       420.00$       378.00$       360.40$       580.15$       
24 61.12$         88.93$         55.00$         65.00$         60.74$         61.18$         
25 NO BID 119.94$       65.00$         69.95$         NO BID 56.81$         
26 125.00$       172.16$       82.00$         98.50$         84.50$         70.00$         
27 82.86$         103.64$       67.00$         76.95$         NO BID 70.10$         
28 160.00$       172.27$       152.00$       139.00$       NO BID 110.00$       
29 NO BID NO BID 350.00$       279.00$       NO BID NO BID
30 NO BID 504.00$       485.00$       496.00$       NO BID 475.20$       
31 50.00$         36.29$         15.00$         19.95$         NO BID 22.00$         
32 80.00$         77.72$         42.00$         74.50$         NO BID 54.00$         
33 NO BID 95.73$         67.00$         82.50$         NO BID 67.00$         
34 130.00$       129.65$       140.00$       162.00$       NO BID 136.00$       
35 NO BID 259.81$       NO BID 149.95$       NO BID 478.45$       
36 325.00$       304.60$       300.00$       498.00$       NO BID 271.49$       
37 250.00$       306.37$       230.00$       226.00$       NO BID 114.19$       
38 465.00$       602.43$       459.00$       488.00$       NO BID 375.00$       
39 450.00$       1,326.02$    1,020.00$    579.50$       NO BID 792.67$       
40 500.00$       501.69$       453.00$       409.00$       NO BID 508.32$       

TERMS NET NET NET NET NET NET

 B.   B & S Transport, Inc.
C.    North Gateway Tire Co.
D.   Tire Distributors Inc.

F.    Ziegler Tire & Supply  


