BIDDER

E.M.M. / Black's Distributor
3546 Delphos Avenue
Dayton, Ohio 45417

Independence Business Supply, Inc.
4550 Hinckley Parkway
Cleveland, Ohio 44109

Environments 4 Business, LLC
515 Euclid Avenue, Suite 100
Cleveland, Ohio 44114

Continental Office Furniture
2601 Silver Drive
Columbus, Ohio 43211

Upbeat, Inc.

211 N. Lindbergh
St. Louis, Missouri 63141

OHIO TURNPIKE COMMISSION

682 PROSPECT STREET
BEREA, OHIO 44017
PURCHASING SECTION

BID INVITATION NO. 4159

FOR FURNISHING INTERIOR AND EXTERIOR SERVICE PLAZA FURNITURE

TOTAL
GROUP |

$46,806.00

$47,448.48

$48,245.92

$58,393.92

NO BID

**BID INVITATION NO. 4159 AWARDED AS FOLLOWS:

OPENING DATE: 2:00 P.M. (E.D.T.) MARCH 31, 2011

TOTAL
GROUP 1I

$61,638.24

$62,267.40

$63,938.48

$68,995.58

NO BID

TOTAL
GROUP I

NO BID

$95,212.64

$93,129.44

$106,244.16

NO BID

TOTAL TOTAL TOTAL TOTAL TOTAL
GROUP IV GROUP V GROUP VI GROUP VI GROUP VIii TERMS
$39,273.32 $18,720.00 $20,063.06 $1,290.00 $2,746.32 NET
$39,835.64 $19,710.72 $20,332.00 $2,374.80 $2,995.52 NET
$42,562.00 $19,340.64 $23,942.46 $1,425.12 NO BID NET
$49,356.96 $23,809.92 $22,415.18 $927.12 $3,451.84 NET
NO BID NO BID NO BID $1,364.16 NO BID NET

GROUPS |, I, IV, V, VI & VIIl - EIM.M. / BLACK'S D ISTRIBUTOR
GROUP Il - ENVIRONMENTS 4 BUSINESS
GROUP VII - CONTINENTAL OFFICE



