BIDDER

Gregory Industries, Inc.
4100 13th Street, S.W.
Canton, OH 44710

The Firelands Supply Company
18 South Norwalk Road
Norwalk, OH 44857

R.G. Steel Corp
8301 Mercer Street
Pulaski, PA 16143

Future Fence Company
23450 Regency Park Drive
Warren, MI 48089

Monroeville Industrial Moldings
75 Ontario Street
Norwalk, OH 44857

***BID INVITATION NO. 4175 AWARDED TO GREGORY INDUSTRIES***

GROUP |
ITEM 1

$48.10/ea.

$49.20/ea.

$52.15/ea.

$56.97/ea.

NO BID

GROUP |
ITEM 2

$0.45/ea.

$0.45/ea.

$0.46/ea.

$0.53/ea.

NO BID

OHIO TURNPIKE COMMISSION
682 PROSPECT STREET

BEREA, OHIO 44017

PURCHASING SECTION

BID INVITATION NO. 4175

FOR FURNISHING GUARDRAIL MATERIALS

OPENING DATE - DECEMBER 20, 2011

GROUP |
ITEM 3

$1.10/ea.

$1.10/ea.

$1.15/ea.

$1.46/ea.

NO BID

GROUP |
ITEM 4

$17.00/ea.

$25.00/ea.

$20.00/ea.

$20.94/ea.

NO BID

GROUP |
ITEM 5

$29.60/ea.

$29.25/ea.

$30.20/ea.

$33.72/ea.

NO BID

TOTAL
BID PRICE
GROUP |

$252,260.00

$254,750.00

$266,855.00

$295,568.20

NO BID

TOTAL
GROUP I BID PRICE
ITEM 1 GROUP 1l TERMS

$3.10/ea. $6,975.00 1/4%
$3.20/ea. $7,200.00 1/2%
$3.40/ea. $7,650.00 1/2%
$7.15/ea. $16,087.50 NET
$2.90/ea. $6,525.00 NET



