
 

OHIO TURNPIKE COMMISSION
  682 PROSPECT STREET

BEREA, OHIO  44017

OPENING DATE
JULY 3, 2007

BID INVITATION NUMBER 4071

FOR FURNISHING PNEUMATIC TIRES

 A.  Goodyear Tire & Rubber
 B.  North Gateway Tire Co., Inc.
C.  Ziegler Tire and Supply

ITEM # "A" "B" "C"

1 49.98$         51.55$         NO BID
2 62.14$         59.00$         NO BID
3 64.52$         56.00$         NO BID
4 83.62$         73.00$         NO BID
5 94.28$         97.00$         NO BID
6 79.24$         80.00$         NO BID
7 98.49$         94.00$         68.35$         
8 102.81$       120.00$       77.00$         
9 171.56$       160.15$       NO BID
10 114.97$       86.00$         NO BID
11 184.85$       183.75$       158.00$       
12 162.54$       177.15$       176.80$       
13 211.31$       201.60$       183.34$       
14 199.04$       207.95$       NO BID
15 184.97$       195.00$       NO BID
16 194.38$       219.00$       NO BID
17 202.38$       212.80$       NO BID
18 196.20$       225.00$       224.00$       
19 214.03$       245.00$       226.00$       
20 351.73$       351.00$       322.40$       
21 294.55$       275.00$       267.80$       
22 281.25$       291.00$       286.00$       
23 305.96$       309.00$       270.00$       
24 61.12$         55.75$         NO BID
25 91.06$         58.00$         NO BID
26 172.42$       75.00$         NO BID
27 142.24$       141.35$       NO BID
28 80.21$         64.10$         NO BID
29 NO BID 112.05$       NO BID
30 NO BID 378.20$       NO BID
31 550.80$       365.00$       NO BID
32 NO BID 28.50$         NO BID
33 NO BID 31.55$         NO BID
34 NO BID 85.00$         NO BID
35 NO BID 72.00$         NO BID
36 NO BID 82.00$         NO BID
37 NO BID 199.00$       NO BID
38 NO BID 219.00$       NO BID
39 NO BID 167.00$       NO BID
40 NO BID 336.90$       NO BID
41 NO BID 445.00$       NO BID
42 NO BID 336.80$       NO BID

TERMS NET NET NET

Invitation No. 4071 Items 7, 8, 11, 13, 20, 21, 23 have been awarded to Ziegler Tire and Supply on August 8, 2007

Invitation No. 4071 Items 2, 3, 12, 24, 25, 26, 28, 29, 30, 31, 32, 33, 34, 36, 38, 39, 40, 42 have been awarded to 
North Gateway Tire Co. , Inc. on August 8, 2007

Invitation No. 4071 Items 1, 4, 6, 14, 15, 16, 17, 18, 19, 22, 27 have been awarded to The Goodyear Tire & Rubber 
Company on August 1, 2007


