
 

OHIO  TURNPIKE AND INFRASTRUCTURE COMMISSION 
682  PROSPECT  STREET 

BEREA, OHIO  44017 

PROCUREMENT SECTION 

 

BID  INVITATION  NO.  4281 

 

A TWELVE-MONTH SERVICE CONTRACT FOR THE INSPECTION, TESTING AND REPAIR OF FIRE ALARM SYSTEMS, FIRE SPRINKLER SYSTEMS AND FIRE 

SUPPRESSION/EXTINGUISHING SYSTEMS LOCATED IN VARIOUS COMMISSION BUILDINGS 

 

OPENING DATE  - OCTOBER 31, 2016 

 

ITEM I    ITEM 1     ITEM 2 & 3      ITEM 2 & 3  

BIDDER    EXTENDED COST LABOR  RATE  PARTS  EXTENDED COST   LABOR RATE             PARTS           TERMS 
  

Gene Ptacek & Son Fire Equipment $ 5,760.00  Monday – Friday  - 30%  2. Facility Sprinkler  Monday – Friday  - 30%       Net 

7310 Associate Avenue      8:00 a.m. – 5:00 p.m.   Test/Inspection   8:00 a.m. – 5:00 p.m. 

Brooklyn, Ohio 44144      $  65.00/hour    $ 7,200.00   $ 65.00/hour 

         Monday – Friday   3. FM-200/FE-25 Test  Monday - Friday 

         5:00 p.m. – 8:00 a.m.   $ 8,580.00   5:00 p.m. – 8:00 p.m. 

        $  97.50/hour        $ 97.50/hour 

        Saturday, Sunday & Holidays      Saturday, Sunday & Holidays 

        $ 130.00/hour        $130.00/hour 

 

Environmental Controls Electrical  $ 5,880.00  Monday – Friday - 25%  2. Facility Sprinkler   Monday - Friday - 25%       Net 

227 West Bergey Street      8:00 a.m. – 5:00 p.m.   Test/Inspection   8:00 a.m. – 5:00 p.m. 

Wadsworth, Ohio 44281     $  65.00/hour    $ 7,440.00   $ 65.00/hour 

        Monday – Friday   3. FM-200/FE-25 Test  Monday – Friday  

        5:00 p.m. – 8:00 a.m.   $ 8,580.00   5:00 p.m. – 8:00 a.m.  

        $  97.50/hour        $ 97.50/hour 

         Saturday, Sunday & Holidays      Saturday, Sunday & Holidays 

        $ 130.00/hour        $130.00/hour 

 

 

  

***BID INVITATION NO. 4281 AWARDED TO GENE PTACEK & SON FIRE EQUIPMENT*** 
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S.A. Comunale Co., Inc.  $ 6,950.00  Monday – Friday - 20%  2. Facility Sprinkler  Monday – Friday - 20%              Net  

2900 Newpark Drive      8:00 a.m. – 5:00 p.m.   Test/Inspection   8:00 a.m. – 5:00 p.m. 

Barberton, Ohio 44203      $  85.00/hour    $ 8,730.00   $  85.00/hour 

        Monday – Friday   3. FM-200/FE-25Test  Monday – Friday  

        5:00 p.m. – 8:00 a.m.   $ 7,920.00   5:00 pm – 8:00 p.m. 

        $ 119.00/hour        $ 119.00/hour   

     Saturday, Sunday & Holidays      Saturday, Sunday & Holidays 

        $ 153.00/hour        $ 153.00/hour 
 

 

Atech Fire & Security, LLC  $ 7,200.00  Monday – Friday - 30%  1. Facility Sprinkler  Monday – Friday - 30%              Net  

600 Shoemaker Avenue, Unit 5     8:00 a.m. – 5:00 p.m.   Test/Inspection   8:00 a.m. – 5:00 p.m.  

Columbus, Ohio 43201      $  75.00/hour    $ 7,200.00   $ 75.00/hour 

        Monday – Friday   2. FM-200/FE-25Test  Monday – Friday 

        5:00 p.m. – 8:00 a.m.   $ 8,250.00   5:00 pm – 8:00 p.m. 

        $ 112.50/hour        $ 112.50/hour  

        Saturday, Sunday & Holidays      Saturday, Sunday & Holidays  

        $ 150.00/hour        $ 150.00/hour 
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Electronic Systems Consultants  $ 9,000.00  Monday – Friday +  25%  1. Facility Sprinkler  Monday - Friday + 25%           1%  

1450 Universal Road      8:00 a.m. – 5:00 p.m.   Test/Inspection   8:00 a.m. – 5:00 p.m. 

Columbus, Ohio 43207      $ 85.00/hour    $ 200.00   $   85.00/hour 

        Monday – Friday   2. FM-200/FE-25 Test  Monday - Friday 

        5:00 p.m. – 8:00 a.m.   $ 300.00   5:00 p.m. – 8:00 a.m.   

        $ 100.00/hour        $ 100.00/hour  

        Saturday, Sunday & Holidays      Saturday, Sunday & Holidays   

        $ 100.00/hour        $ 100.00/hour   

 

 

Image Audio and Secuirity LLC  $21,600.00  Monday – Friday - 1%  1. Facility Sprinkler  Monday - Friday + 5%                Net  

27801 Euclid Avenue, Suite 5602    8:00 a.m. – 5:00 p.m.   Test/Inspection   8:00 a.m. – 5:00 p.m. 

Euclid, Ohio 44132      $  65.00/hour    $ 33,960.00   $ 158.00/hour 

        Monday – Friday   2. FM-200/FE-25 Test  Monday - Friday 

        5:00 p.m. – 8:00 a.m.   $ 52,602.00   5:00 p.m. – 8:00 a.m. 

        $  97.50/hour        $ 158.00/hour 

      Saturday, Sunday & Holidays      Saturday, Sunday & Holidays 

        $  97.50/hour        $ 237.00/hour 
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Siemens Industry, Inc.   $ 26,189.00  Monday – Friday +  10%  1. Facility Sprinkler  Monday - Friday + 10%           Net  

5350 Transportation Blvd., Suite 9    8:00 a.m. – 5:00 p.m.   Test/Inspection   8:00 a.m. – 5:00 p.m. 

Garfield Heights, Ohio 44125     $ 106.00/hour    $ 13,094.50   $ 106.00/hour 

        Monday – Friday   2. FM-200/FE-25 Test  Monday - Friday 

        5:00 p.m. – 8:00 a.m.   $ 13,094.50   5:00 p.m. – 8:00 a.m.   

        $ 159.00/hour        $ 159.00/hour  

     Saturday, Sunday & Holidays      Saturday, Sunday & Holidays   

        $ 212.00/hour        $ 212.00/hour   

 

 

RWJ Wiring, Inc.    No Bid    Monday – Friday -  22%  NO BID   NO BID  NO BID           1.5%  

1287 Marquette Street, Suite 3      8:00 a.m. – 5:00 p.m.    

Cleveland, Ohio 44114      $   95.00/hour     

        Monday – Friday     

        5:00 p.m. – 8:00 a.m.         

        $ 127.00/hour          

      Saturday, Sunday & Holidays          

        $ 143.75/hour  
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