

**OHIO TURNPIKE AND INFRASTRUCTURE COMMISSION
682 PROSPECT STREET
BEREA, OHIO 44017
PROCUREMENT SECTION**

****Group I - Awarded to Perfect Sweep, Inc.
Group II - Awarded to Anthony Allega Cement Contractor, Inc.

**BID INVITATION NO. 4332
PAVEMENT SWEEPING SERVICE**

OPENING DATE: January 14, 2019

| <u>BIDDER</u> | <u>GROUP I ITEM 1</u> | <u>RATES</u> | <u>GROUP I ITEM 2</u> | <u>RATES</u> | <u>GROUP I ITEM 3</u> | <u>RATES</u> | <u>GROUP I ITEM 4</u> | <u>RATES</u> | <u>TERMS</u> |
|---|----------------------------|--------------|----------------------------|--------------|----------------------------|--------------|----------------------------|--------------|-------------------|
| Perfect Sweep, Inc. 1202 Expressway Drive South Toledo, Ohio 43608 | Hourly - | \$ 110.00 | Hourly - | \$ 110.00 | Hourly - | \$ 110.00 | Hourly - | \$ 110.00 | 1% - 10 NET 30 |
| | Daily - | \$ 880.00 | Daily - | \$ 880.00 | Daily - | \$ 880.00 | Daily - | \$ 880.00 | |
| | Weekly - | \$ 4,400.00 | Weekly - | \$ 4,400.00 | Weekly - | \$ 4,400.00 | Weekly - | \$ 4,400.00 | |
| | Monthly - | \$ 17,600.00 | Monthly - | \$ 17,600.00 | Monthly - | \$ 17,600.00 | Monthly - | \$ 17,600.00 | |
| | <u>GROUP II ITEM 1</u> | <u>RATES</u> | <u>GROUP II ITEM 2</u> | <u>RATES</u> | <u>GROUP II ITEM 3</u> | <u>RATES</u> | <u>GROUP II ITEM 4</u> | <u>RATES</u> | |
| | Hourly - | \$ 110.00 | Hourly - | \$ 110.00 | Hourly - | \$ 110.00 | Hourly - | \$ 110.00 | |
| | Daily - | \$ 880.00 | Daily - | \$ 880.00 | Daily - | \$ 880.00 | Daily - | \$ 880.00 | |
| | Weekly - | \$ 4,400.00 | Weekly - | \$ 4,400.00 | Weekly - | \$ 4,400.00 | Weekly - | \$ 4,400.00 | |
| | Monthly - | \$ 17,600.00 | Monthly - | \$ 17,600.00 | Monthly - | \$ 17,600.00 | Monthly - | \$ 17,600.00 | |
| <u>BIDDER</u> | <u>GROUP I ITEM 1</u> | <u>RATES</u> | <u>GROUP I ITEM 2</u> | <u>RATES</u> | <u>GROUP I ITEM 3</u> | <u>RATES</u> | <u>GROUP I ITEM 4</u> | <u>RATES</u> | <u>TERMS</u> |
| Reilly Sweeping Inc./dba SCA of Ohio 20350 Hannan Parkway Walton Hills, Ohio 44146 | Hourly - | NO BID | Hourly - | NO BID | Hourly - | NO BID | Hourly - | NO BID | NET |
| | Daily - | NO BID | Daily - | NO BID | Daily - | NO BID | Daily - | NO BID | |
| | Weekly - | NO BID | Weekly - | NO BID | Weekly - | NO BID | Weekly - | NO BID | |
| | Monthly - | NO BID | Monthly - | NO BID | Monthly - | NO BID | Monthly - | NO BID | |
| | <u>GROUP II ITEM 1</u> | <u>RATES</u> | <u>GROUP II ITEM 2</u> | <u>RATES</u> | <u>GROUP II ITEM 3</u> | <u>RATES</u> | <u>GROUP II ITEM 4</u> | <u>RATES</u> | |
| | Hourly - | \$ 119.48 | Hourly - | \$ 119.48 | Hourly - | \$ 119.48 | Hourly - | \$ 119.48 | |
| | Daily - | \$ 955.84 | Daily - | \$ 955.84 | Daily - | \$ 955.84 | Daily - | \$ 955.84 | |
| | Weekly - | \$ 4,779.20 | Weekly - | \$ 4,779.20 | Weekly - | \$ 4,779.20 | Weekly - | \$ 4,779.20 | |
| | Monthly - | \$ 19,116.80 | Monthly - | \$ 19,116.80 | Monthly - | \$ 19,116.80 | Monthly - | \$ 19,116.80 | |

**OHIO TURNPIKE AND INFRASTRUCTURE COMMISSION
682 PROSPECT STREET
BEREA, OHIO 44017
PROCUREMENT SECTION**

**BID INVITATION NO. 4332
PAVEMENT SWEEPING SERVICE**

OPENING DATE: JANUARY 14, 2019

| <u>BIDDER</u> | <u>GROUP I ITEM 1</u> | <u>RATES</u> | <u>GROUP I ITEM 2</u> | <u>RATES</u> | <u>GROUP I ITEM 3</u> | <u>RATES</u> | <u>GROUP I ITEM 4</u> | <u>RATES</u> | <u>TERMS</u> |
|---|-----------------------------------|---------------------|-----------------------------------|---------------------|-----------------------------------|---------------------|-----------------------------------|---------------------|---------------------|
| Anthony Allega Cement Contractor 5585 Canal Road Valley View, Ohio 44125 | Hourly - | NO BID | Hourly - | NO BID | Hourly - | NO BID | Hourly - | NO BID | 1% - 10 NET 20 |
| | Daily - | NO BID | Daily - | NO BID | Daily - | NO BID | Daily - | NO BID | |
| | Weekly - | NO BID | Weekly - | NO BID | Weekly - | NO BID | Weekly - | NO BID | |
| | Monthly - | NO BID | Monthly - | NO BID | Monthly - | NO BID | Monthly - | NO BID | |
| | <u>GROUP II ITEM 1</u> | <u>RATES</u> | <u>GROUP II ITEM 2</u> | <u>RATES</u> | <u>GROUP II ITEM 3</u> | <u>RATES</u> | <u>GROUP II ITEM 4</u> | <u>RATES</u> | |
| | Hourly - | \$ 120.00 | Hourly - | \$ 120.00 | Hourly - | \$ 120.00 | Hourly - | \$ 120.00 | |
| | Daily - | \$ 800.00 | Daily - | \$ 800.00 | Daily - | \$ 800.00 | Daily - | \$ 900.00 | |
| | Weekly - | \$ 3,800.00 | Weekly - | \$ 3,800.00 | Weekly - | \$ 3,800.00 | Weekly - | \$ 4,000.00 | |
| | Monthly - | \$ 15,200.00 | Monthly - | \$ 15,200.00 | Monthly - | \$ 15,200.00 | Monthly - | \$ 16,000.00 | |
| <u>BIDDER</u> | <u>GROUP I ITEM 1</u> | <u>RATES</u> | <u>GROUP I ITEM 2</u> | <u>RATES</u> | <u>GROUP I ITEM 3</u> | <u>RATES</u> | <u>GROUP I ITEM 4</u> | <u>RATES</u> | <u>TERMS</u> |
| Everbrite Inc. 12546 Mahoning Avenue North Jackson, Ohio 44451 | Hourly - | NO BID | Hourly - | NO BID | Hourly - | NO BID | Hourly - | NO BID | 1% - 10 |
| | Daily - | NO BID | Daily - | NO BID | Daily - | NO BID | Daily - | NO BID | |
| | Weekly - | NO BID | Weekly - | NO BID | Weekly - | NO BID | Weekly - | NO BID | |
| | Monthly - | NO BID | Monthly - | NO BID | Monthly - | NO BID | Monthly - | NO BID | |
| | <u>GROUP II ITEM 1</u> | <u>RATES</u> | <u>GROUP II ITEM 2</u> | <u>RATES</u> | <u>GROUP II ITEM 3</u> | <u>RATES</u> | <u>GROUP II ITEM 4</u> | <u>RATES</u> | |
| | Hourly - | \$ 120.00 | Hourly - | \$ 120.00 | Hourly - | \$ 120.00 | Hourly - | \$ 120.00 | |
| | Daily - | \$ 960.00 | Daily - | \$ 960.00 | Daily - | \$ 960.00 | Daily - | \$ 960.00 | |
| | Weekly - | \$ 4,800.00 | Weekly - | \$ 4,800.00 | Weekly - | \$ 4,800.00 | Weekly - | \$ 4,800.00 | |
| | Monthly - | \$ 19,200.00 | Monthly - | \$ 19,200.00 | Monthly - | \$ 19,200.00 | Monthly - | \$ 19,200.00 | |