OHIO TURNPIKE AND INFRASTRUCTURE COMMISSION
682 PROSPECT STREET
BEREA, OHIO 44017
PROCUREMENT SECTION
***INVITATION NO. 4309 AWARDED TO NDR FACILITIES***

BID INVITATION NO. 4309
PAVEMENT SWEEPING SERVICE

OPENING DATE: NOVEMBER 30, 2017

GROUP | GROUP | GROUP | GROUP |
BIDDER ITEM 1 RATES ITEM 2 RATES ITEM 3 RATES ITEM 4
NDR Facilities Hourly - $ 69.25 Hourly - $ 69.25 Hourly - $ 69.25  Hourly -
1926 N. Holland Sylvania Road #15 Daily - $ 554.00 Daily - $ 554.00 Daily - $ 554.00  Daily -
Toledo, Ohio 43615 Weekly - $ 2,770.00 Weekly - $ 2,770.00 Weekly - $ 2,770.00 Weekly -
Monthly - $ 11,080.00 Monthly - $ 11,080.00 Monthly - $ 11,080.00 Monthly -
GROUP II GROUP 1 GROUP 1 GROUP 1l
ITEM 1 RATES ITEM 2 RATES ITEM 3 RATES ITEM 4
Hourly - $ 69.25 Hourly - $ 69.25 Hourly - $ 69.25 Hourly -
Daily - $  554.00 Daily - $  554.00 Daily - $  554.00 Daily -
Weekly - $ 2,770.00 Weekly - $ 2,770.00 Weekly - $ 2,770.00 Weekly -
Monthly - $ 11,080.00 Monthly - $ 11,080.00 Monthly - $ 11,080.00 Monthly -
GROUP | GROUP | GROUP | GROUP |
ITEM 1 RATES ITEM 2 RATES ITEM 3 RATES ITEM 4
Perfect Sweep, Inc. Hourly - $ 100.00 Hourly - $ 100.00 Hourly - $ 100.00 Hourly -
1202 Expressway Drive South Daily - $ 800.00 Daily - $ 800.00 Daily - $ 800.00  Daily -
Toledo, Ohio 43608 Weekly - $ 3,800.00 Weekly - $ 3,800.00 Weekly - $ 3,800.00 Weekly -
Monthly - $ 15,200.00 Monthly - $ 15,200.00 Monthly - $ 15,200.00  Monthly -
GROUP 1 GROUP II GROUP II GROUP 1l
ITEM 1 RATES ITEM 2 RATES ITEM 3 RATES ITEM 4
Hourly - $ 100.00 Hourly - $ 100.00 Hourly - $ 100.00 Hourly -
Daily - $ 800.00 Daily - $ 800.00 Daily - $ 800.00  Daily -
Weekly - $ 3,800.00 Weekly - $ 3,800.00 Weekly - $ 3,800.00 Weekly-
Monthly - $ 15,200.00 Monthly - $ 15,200.00 Monthly - $ 15,200.00  Monthly -
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Progressive Sweeping Contractors
5202 Enterprise Blvd.
Toledo, Ohio 43612

DeAngelo Brothers LLC
2080 South State Route 19
Oak Harbor, Ohio 43449
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OHIO TURNPIKE AND INFRASTRUCTURE COMMISSION
682 PROSPECT STREET
BEREA, OHIO 44017
PROCUREMENT SECTION

BID INVITATION NO. 4309
PAVEMENT SWEEPING SERVICE

OPENING DATE: NOVEMBER 30, 2017

GROUP | GROUP |
RATES ITEM 3 RATES ITEM 4
138.00 Hourly - $ 138.00  Hourly -
880.00 Daily - $ 880.00  Daily -
4,200.00 Weekly - $ 4,200.00 Weekly -
16,800.00 Monthly - $ 16,800.00 Monthly -
GROUP I GROUP I
RATES ITEM 3 RATES ITEM 4
179.00 Hourly - $ 193.00  Hourly -
1,045.00 Daily - $ 1,100.00 Dailly -
4,985.00 Weekly - $ 5,250.00 Weekly -
19,940.00 Monthly - $ 21,000.00 Monthly -
GROUP | GROUP |
RATES ITEM 3 RATES ITEM 4
192.51 Hourly - $ 192.51 Hourly -
1,540.08 Daily - $ 1,540.08 Daily -
7,700.40 Weekly - $ 7,700.40 Weekly -
30,801.60 Monthly - $ 30,801.60  Monthly -
GROUP I GROUP I
RATES ITEM 3 RATES ITEM 4
192.51 Hourly - $ 192.51 Hourly -
1,540.08 Daily - $ 1,540.08 Daily -
7,700.40 Weekly - $ 7,700.40 Weekly -
30,801.60 Monthly - $ 30,801.60  Monthly -
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BIDDER

Everbrite Inc.
12546 Mahoning Avenue
North Jackson, Ohio 44451

BIDDER

Reilly Sweeping Inc.
20350 Hannan Parkway
Walton Hills, Ohio 44146
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OHIO TURNPIKE AND INFRASTRUCTURE COMMISSION

682 PROSPECT STREET
BEREA, OHIO 44017
PROCUREMENT SECTION

BID INVITATION NO. 4287
PAVEMENT SWEEPING SERVICE

OPENING DATE: JANUARY 18, 2017

GROUP |
RATES ITEM 3 RATES
NO BID Hourly - NO BID
NO BID Daily - NO BID
NO BID Weekly - NO BID
NO BID Monthly - NO BID
GROUP I
RATES ITEM 3 RATES
120.00 Hourly - $ 120.00
960.00 Daily - $ 960.00
4,800.00 Weekly - $ 4,800.00
19,200.00 Monthly - $ 19,200.00
GROUP |
RATES ITEM 3 RATES
NO BID Hourly - NO BID
NO BID Daily - NO BID
NO BID Weekly - NO BID
NO BID Monthly - NO BID
GROUP I
RATES ITEM 3 RATES
124.00 Hourly - $ 124.00
992.00 Daily - $ 992.00
4,960.00 Weekly - $ 4,960.00
19,840.00 Monthly - $ 19,840.00
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