BIDDER

Perfect Sweep, Inc.
1202 Expressway Drive South
Toledo, Ohio 43608

DeAngelo Brothers LLC
2080 South State Route 19
Oak Harbor, Ohio 43449

GROUP |
ITEM 1

Hourly -
Daily -

Weekly -
Monthly -

GROUP I
ITEM 1

Hourly -
Daily -
Weekly -
Monthly -

GROUP |
ITEM 1

Hourly -
Daily -
Weekly -
Monthly -

GROUP I
ITEM 1

Hourly -
Dalily -
Weekly -
Monthly -

GROUP |
RATES ITEM 2
$ 10000  Hourly-
$ 800.00 Daily -
$ 3,800.00 Weekly -
$ 15,200.00 Monthly -
GROUP 1
RATES ITEM 2
$ 10000  Hourly-
$ 800.00 Daily -
$ 3,800.00 Weekly -
$ 15,200.00 Monthly -
GROUP |
RATES ITEM 2
$ 24504  Hourly-
$ 1,960.32  Dalily-
$ 9,801.60 Weekly -
$ 39,206.40 Monthly -
GROUP 1
RATES ITEM 2
$ 266.43 Hourly -
$ 2,131.44 Daily -
$ 10,657.20 Weekly -
$ 42,628.80 Monthly -
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OHIO TURNPIKE AND INFRASTRUCTURE COMMISSION

682 PROSPECT STREET
BEREA, OHIO 44017
PROCUREMENT SECTION

BID INVITATION NO. 4287
PAVEMENT SWEEPING SERVICE

OPENING DATE: JANUARY 18, 2017

GROUP |
RATES ITEM 3 RATES
100.00 Hourly - $ 100.00
800.00 Daily - $ 800.00
3,800.00 Weekly - $ 3,800.00
15,200.00 Monthly - $ 15,200.00
GROUP I
RATES ITEM 3 RATES
100.00 Hourly - $ 100.00
800.00 Daily - $ 800.00
3,800.00 Weekly - $ 3,800.00
15,200.00 Monthly - $ 15,200.00
GROUP |
RATES ITEM 3 RATES
235.88 Hourly - $ 233.59
1,887.04 Daily - $ 1,868.72
9,435.20 Weekly - $ 9,343.60
37,740.80 Monthly - $ 37,374.40
GROUP 11
RATES ITEM 3 RATES
271.75 Hourly - $ 274.42
2,174.00 Daily - $ 2,195.36
10,870.00 Weekly - $ 10,976.80
43,480.00 Monthly - $ 43,907.20
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GROUP |
ITEM 4

Hourly -
Daily -

Weekly -
Monthly -

GROUP I
ITEM 4

Hourly -
Daily -

Weekly -
Monthly -

GROUP |
ITEM 4

Hourly -
Daily -

Weekly -
Monthly -

GROUP I
ITEM 4

Hourly -
Daily -

Weekly -
Monthly -
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RATES

100.00
800.00
3,800.00
15,200.00

RATES

100.00
800.00
3,800.00
15,200.00

RATES

229.01
1,832.08
9,160.40

36,641.60

RATES

277.08
2,216.64
11,083.20
44,332.80

TERMS

1%-10
NET 30

TERMS

NET



BIDDER

Reilly Sweeping Inc.
20350 Hannan Parkway
Walton Hills, Ohio 44146

GROUP |
ITEM 1

Hourly -
Daily -

Weekly -
Monthly -

GROUP I
ITEM 1

Hourly -
Daily -
Weekly -
Monthly -

GROUP |
RATES ITEM 2
NO BID Hourly -
NO BID Daily -
NO BID Weekly -
NO BID Monthly -
GROUP I
RATES ITEM 2
$ 118.00 Hourly -
$ 944.00 Daily -
$ 4,720.00 Weekly -
$ 18,800.00 Monthly -
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OHIO TURNPIKE AND INFRASTRUCTURE COMMISSION
682 PROSPECT STREET
BEREA, OHIO 44017
PROCUREMENT SECTION

BID INVITATION NO. 4287
PAVEMENT SWEEPING SERVICE

OPENING DATE: JANUARY 18, 2017

GROUP | GROUP |
RATES ITEM 3 RATES ITEM 4
NO BID Hourly - NO BID Hourly -
NO BID Daily - NO BID Daily -
NO BID Weekly - NO BID Weekly -
NO BID Monthly - NO BID Monthly -

GROUP I GROUP I
RATES ITEM 3 RATES ITEM 4

118.00 Hourly - $  118.00  Hourly -
944.00 Daily - $ 944.00 Daily -
4,720.00 Weekly - $ 4,720.00 Weekly -
18,800.00 Monthly - $ 18,800.00  Monthly -
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B BHH P

RATES

NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

RATES

118.00
944.00
4,720.00
18,800.00

TERMS

NET



