(Estimated Cost: $884,000.00)
OHIO TURNPIKE AND INFRASTRUCTURE COMMISSION
682 PROSPECT STREET
BEREA, OHIO 44017
BID INVITATION NO. 4247
FOR FURNISHING SODIUM CHLORIDE (ROCK SALT)
OPENING DATE: MAY 27, 2015

CARGILL INC. - DEICING TECHNOLOGY BUSINESS UNIT
24950 COUNTRY CLUB BLVD. #450
NORTH OLMSTED, OHIO 44070

DELIVERY TOTAL UNIT COST EXTENDED TOTAL
DESTINATION ESTIMATED (INCLUDES (BASED ON ESTIMATED
QUANTITY (TONS) FREIGHT PER TON) QUANTITY) TERMS

1 KUNKLE M.B. 1,000 $ 72.24 $ 72,240.00
2 SWANTON M.B. 700 $ 68.29 $ 47,803.00
3 INTERCHANGE 59 800 $ 71.39 $ 57,112.00
4 ELMORE M.B. 2,300 $ 68.52 $ 157,596.00
5 RIVER ROAD 600 $ 72.69 $ 43,614.00
6 CASTALIA M.B. 700 $ 73.45 $ 51,415.00
7 AMHERST M.B. 1,200 $ 74.38 $ 89,256.00
8 BOSTON M.B. 1,100 $ 68.91 $ 75,801.00
9 HIRAM M.B. 1,100 $ 67.97 $ 74,767.00
10 CANFIELD M.B. 900 $ 71.13 $ 64,017.00

COMBINED SUM FOR BONDING PURPOSES

©

733,621.00 NET

Page 1



OHIO TURNPIKE AND INFRASTRUCTURE COMMISSION
682 PROSPECT STREET
BEREA, OHIO 44017

BID INVITATION NO. 4247
FOR FURNISHING SODIUM CHLORIDE (ROCK SALT)
OPENING DATE: MAY 27, 2015

COMPASS MINERALS AMERICA INC.
9900 W. 109TH STREET, SUITE 100
OVERLAND PARK, KS 66210

DELIVERY TOTAL UNIT COST EXTENDED TOTAL
DESTINATION ESTIMATED (INCLUDES (BASED ON ESTIMATED
QUANTITY (TONS) FREIGHT PER TON) QUANTITY) TERMS

1 KUNKLE M.B. 1,000 $ 69.53 $ 69,530.00
2 SWANTON M.B. 700 $ 70.52 $ 49,364.00
3 INTERCHANGE 59 800 $ 69.34 $ 55,472.00
4 ELMORE M.B. 2,300 $ 66.18 $ 152,214.00
5 RIVER ROAD 600 $ 70.07 $ 42,042.00
6 CASTALIA M.B. 700 $ 71.04 $ 49,728.00
7 AMHERST M.B. 1,200 $ 72.14 $ 86,568.00
8 BOSTON M.B. 1,100 $ 66.79 $ 73,469.00
9 HIRAM M.B. 1,100 $ 65.69 $ 72,259.00
10 CANFIELD M.B. 900 $ 68.77 $ 61,893.00

«

COMBINED SUM FOR BONDING PURPOSES 712,539.00
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OHIO TURNPIKE AND INFRASTRUCTURE COMMISSION

682 PROSPECT STREET
BEREA, OHIO 44017

BID INVITATION NO. 4247
FOR FURNISHING SODIUM CHLORIDE (ROCK SALT)

OPENING DATE: MAY 27, 2015

THE DETROIT SALT COMPANY

12841 SANDERS STREET
DETROIT, MI 48217

DELIVERY TOTAL UNIT COST EXTENDED TOTAL
DESTINATION ESTIMATED (INCLUDES (BASED ON ESTIMATED
QUANTITY (TONS) FREIGHT PER TON) QUANTITY)
TERMS
1 KUNKLE M.B. 1,000 $ 72.23 $ 72,230.00
2 SWANTON M.B. 700 $ 68.45 $ 47,915.00
3 INTERCHANGE 59 800 $ 66.75 $ 53,400.00
4 ELMORE M.B. 2,300 $ 68.95 $ 158,585.00
5 RIVER ROAD 600 NO BID NO BID
6 CASTALIA M.B. 700 NO BID NO BID
7 AMHERST M.B. 1,200 NO BID NO BID
8 BOSTON M.B. 1,100 NO BID NO BID
9 HIRAM M.B. 1,100 NO BID NO BID
10 CANFIELD M.B. 900 NO BID NO BID
COMBINED SUM FOR BONDING PURPOSES $ 332,130.00 NET
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OHIO TURNPIKE AND INFRASTRUCTURE COMMISSION

MORTON SALT, INC.
123 N. WACKER DRIVE
CHICAGO, IL 60606-1743

682 PROSPECT STREET
BEREA, OHIO 44017

BID INVITATION NO. 4247
FOR FURNISHING SODIUM CHLORIDE (ROCK SALT)
OPENING DATE: MAY 27, 2015

DELIVERY TOTAL UNIT COST EXTENDED TOTAL
DESTINATION ESTIMATED (INCLUDES (BASED ON ESTIMATED
QUANTITY (TONS) FREIGHT PER TON) QUANTITY)
TERMS
1 KUNKLE M.B. 1,000 $ 81.79 $ 81,790.00
2 SWANTON M.B. 700 $ 71.84 $ 50,288.00
3 INTERCHANGE 59 800 $ 72.80 $ 58,240.00
4 ELMORE M.B. 2,300 $ 73.09 $ 168,107.00
5 RIVER ROAD 600 $ 73.80 $ 44,280.00
6 CASTALIA M.B. 700 $ 73.72 $ 51,604.00
7 AMHERST M.B. 1,200 $ 74.92 $ 89,904.00
8 BOSTON M.B. 1,100 $ 79.63 $ 87,593.00
9 HIRAM M.B. 1,100 $ 73.86 $ 81,246.00
10 CANFIELD M.B. 900 $ 75.28 $ 67,752.00
COMBINED SUM FOR BONDING PURPOSES $ 780,804.00 NET
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