
Adkins Sanitation Allstate Power Vac, Inc. Bear Environmental

2226 West Garrison Street 928 East Hazelwood Avenue 565 Metro Place S, Suite 300

Fremont, Ohio 43420 Rahway, New Jersey 07065 Dublin, Ohio 43017

Terms:  Net Terms: Net Terms:  Net

OHIO TURNPIKE AND INFRASTRUCTURE COMMISSION ITEM 1 EXTENSION ITEM 1 EXTENSION ITEM 1 EXTENSION

682 PROSPECT STREET A - $     0.17 /GAL. 2,550.00$       A - $     1.88 /GAL. 28,200.00$                 A - $ 1.55/GAL. 23,250.00$     

BEREA, OHIO 44017 B - $     0.22/GAL. 3,740.00$       B - $     1.30/GAL. 22,100.00$                 B - $ 1.35/GAL. 22,950.00$     

ITEM 2 EXTENSION ITEM 2 EXTENSION ITEM 2 EXTENSION

PROCUREMENT SECTION A - No Bid No Bid A - $ 2.95/GAL. 29,500.00$                 A - $ 1.55/GAL. 15,500.00$     

INVITATION NO. 4299 B - No Bid No Bid B - $ 2.95/GAL. 14,750.00$                 B - $ 1.55/GAL. 7,750.00$       

C - No Bid No Bid C - $ 3.65/GAL. 36,500.00$                 C - $ 1.35/GAL. 13,500.00$     

FOR FURNISHING REMOVAL, TRANSPORT AND DISPOSAL OF WASTEWATER D - No Bid No Bid D - $ 3.65/GAL 18,250.00$                 D - $ 1.35/GAL. 6,750.00$       

SLUDGE & FLOOR DRAIN/STORM WATER TREATMENT WASTE ITEM 3 EXTENSION

A - $  .15/GAL 21,750.00$     A - $  .90/GAL 130,500.00$               A - $  .60/GAL 87,000.00$     

OPENING DATE - JULY 28, 2017 AT 2:00 P.M. ITEM 4 EXTENSION

A - $ 250.00/HR  Service 15,000.00$     A - $ 310.00/HR  Service 18,600.00$                 A - $ 250.00/HR  Service 15,000.00$     

A - $ 250.00/HR  Drive 3,312.50$       A - $ 295.00/HR  Drive 18,290.00$                 A - $ 95.00/HR  Drive 5,462.50$       

A - Total 18,312.50$     A - Total 36,890.00$                 A - Total 20,462.50$     

B - $ 250.00/HR Service 15,000.00$     B - $ 310.00/HR Service 18,600.00$                 B - $ 250.00/HR Service 15,000.00$     

B - $ 250.00/HR Drive 7,750.00$       B - $ 295.00/HR Drive 8,555.00$                   B - $ 95.00/HR Drive 3,325.00$       

B - Total 22,750.00$     B - Total 27,155.00$                 B - Total 18,325.00$     

ITEM 5 EXTENSION

A - $ 250.00/HR  Service 40,000.00$     A - $ 310.00/HR  Service 49,600.00$                 A - $ 250.00/HR  Service 40,000.00$     

A - $ 250.00/HR  Drive 6,062.50$       A - $ 295.00/HR  Drive 35,547.50$                 A - $ 95.00/HR  Drive 10,877.50$     

A - Total 46,062.50$     A - Total 85,147.50$                 A - Total 50,877.50$     

B - $ 250.00/HR Service 70,000.00$     B - $ 310.00/HR Service 86,800.00$                 B - $ 250.00/HR Service 70,000.00$     

B - $ 250.00/HR Drive 25,625.00$     B - $ 295.00/HR Drive 31,712.50$                 B - $ 95.00/HR Drive 11,495.00$     

B - Total 95,625.00$     B - Total 118,512.50$               B - Total 81,495.00$     

ITEM 6 EXTENSION

A - $ 250.00/HR  Service 8,000.00$       A - $ 310.00/HR  Service 9,920.00$                   A - $ 250.00/HR  Service 8,000.00$       

A - $ 250.00/HR  Drive 2,875.00$       A - $ 295.00/HR  Drive 15,045.00$                 A - $ 95.00/HR  Drive 3,420.00$       

A - Total 10,875.00$     A - Total 24,965.00$                 A - Total 11,420.00$     

B - $ 250.00/HR Service 8,000.00$       B - $ 310.00/HR Service 9,920.00$                   B - $ 250.00/HR Service 8,000.00$       

B - $ 250.00/HR Drive 6,500.00$       B - $ 295.00/HR Drive 6,490.00$                   B - $ 95.00/HR Drive 2,090.00$       

B - Total 14,500.00$     B - Total 16,410.00$                 B - Total 10,090.00$     

A - $ 325.00/HR A - $ 79.00/HR A -  1.5 times item price

B - $ 325.00/HR B - $ 79.00/HR B -  1.5 times item price
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