
(Estimated Cost:  $296,470.00)
OHIO TURNPIKE COMMISSION

682 PROSPECT STREET
BEREA, OHIO 44017

PROCUREMENT SECTION

BID INVITATION NO. 4189

FOR FURNISHING INTERIOR AND EXTERIOR SERVICE PLAZA FURNITURE

OPENING DATE:  2:00 P.M. (E.D.T.) OCTOBER 2, 2012

TOTAL TOTAL TOTAL TOTAL TOTAL TOTAL TOTAL 
BIDDER GROUP I GROUP II GROUP III GROUP IV GROUP V GROUP VI GROUP VII GROUP VIII TERMS

Lowe's Home Centers, Inc. $20,326.80 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $26,112.50 NO BID NO BID NET
1605 Curtis Bridge Road
Wilkesboro, NC 28697

Independence Business Supply, Inc. $46,028.16 $49,103.42 $75,807.76 $41,534.24 $19,205.76 $34,765.50 $2,093.52 $1,826.52 NET
4550 Hinckley Parkway
Cleveland, Ohio 44109

E.M.M./Black's Distributor $46,700.16 $59,808.86 $72,989.84 $42,973.04 $19,185.12 NO BID $1,260.00 $2,468.12 NET
3546 Delphos Avenue
Dayton, Ohio 45417

A & M Outdoor Concepts, Inc. $20,792.64 $61,394.30 $75,636.40 $46,506.28 $21,890.64 $29,603.50 $1,388.16 $1,893.64 NET
1685 Universal Road
Columbus, Ohio 43207

Environments 4 Business $23,467.92 $56,804.36 $76,788.32 $46,432.04 $20,496.48 NO BID NO BID NO BID NET
3421 Ridgewood Road, Suite 150
Fairlawn, Ohio 44333

 

TOTAL


