

OHIO TURNPIKE COMMISSION

682 PROSPECT STREET
BEREA, OHIO 44017
PROCUREMENT DEPARTMENT
440-234-2081

BID INVITATION NO. 4192

FOR FURNISHING

TRASH, RECYCLABLE & TIRE DEBRIS REMOVAL AT THE OHIO TURNPIKE
COMMISSION'S EIGHT (8) MAINTENANCE BUILDINGS, ADMINISTRATION
BUILDING, STATE PATROL POST 90 AND VARIOUS TOLL PLAZAS

OPENING DATE:

2:00 P.M. (E.S.T.), NOVEMBER 30, 2012

SUBMITTED BY:

COMPANY NAME: BROWNING-FERRIS IND. OF OHIO, INC.
DBA - ALLIED WASTE SERVICES A REPUBLIC SERVICES CO.

CONTACT NAME: _____

STREET ADDRESS: 3870 HENDRICKS ROAD

CITY AND STATE: YOUNGSTOWN, OH ZIP: 44515

TELEPHONE NUMBER: _____

FAX NUMBER: _____

EMAIL: _____

ATTACHMENTS:

- Facilities Chart

Published and Copyrighted © 2012 by The Ohio Turnpike Commission

If you have received these Contract Documents from any entity other than the Ohio Turnpike Commission, you risk the receipt of inaccurate information and/or plans; and will not receive any addenda issued by the Commission. These documents are copyrighted by the Ohio Turnpike Commission. Any unauthorized electronic reproduction of these documents for the purpose of resale or bidding subscription services is expressly prohibited.

BID FORM
TRASH

Item	Facility Name	Milepost Location	Box Size (C.Y.)	Qty.	Approximate Pickups/Year	Box Rental Fee	Cost per Pickup
1	TP 2	2.7	4	1	12	-0-	67. ⁰⁰
2	TP 13	13.5	2	1	12	-0-	36. ⁰⁰
3	Kunkle M.B	16.0	20	1	12	-0-	320. ⁰⁰
4	TP 25	25.5	2	1	12	-0-	36. ⁰⁰
5	TP 34	34.9	2	1	12	-0-	36. ⁰⁰
6	TP 39	39.8	2	1	12	-0-	36. ⁰⁰
7	Swanton M.B.	48.3	30	1	12	-0-	300. ⁰⁰
8	TP 52	52.6	2	1	12	10. ⁷⁵	16. ²⁵
9	TP 59	59.5	2	1	12	10. ⁷⁵	16. ²⁵
10	TP 64	64.9	2	1	12	10. ⁷⁵	16. ²⁵
11	TP 71	71.7	2	1	12	10. ⁷⁵	16. ²⁵
12	Elmore M.B.	79.7	30	1	12	-0-	325. ⁰⁰
13	TP 81	81.8	2	1	12	10. ⁷⁵	16. ²⁵
14	TP 91	91.6	2	1	12	10. ⁷⁵	16. ²⁵
15	Castalia M.B.	106.7	30	1	12	-0-	295. ⁰⁰
16	TP 110	110.2	2	1	12	10. ⁷⁵	16. ²⁵
17	Post 90	118.6	6	1	12	17. ⁰⁰	43. ²⁵
18	TP 135	135.9	2	1	12	10. ⁷⁵	16. ²⁵
19	TP 140	140.6	2	1	12	10. ⁷⁵	16. ²⁵
20	Amherst M.B	141.0	30	1	12	-0-	375. ⁰⁰
21	TP 142	142.8	2	1	12	10. ⁷⁵	16. ²⁵
22	TP 145	145.5	2	1	12	10. ⁷⁵	16. ²⁵
23	TP 151	151.8	2	1	12	10. ⁷⁵	16. ²⁵

BID FORM
TRASH

Item	Facility Name	Milepost Location	Box Size (C.Y.)	Qty.	Approximate Pickups/Year	Box Rental Fee	Cost per Pickup
24	TP 152	152.2	2	1	12	10. ⁷⁵	16. ²⁵
25	Berea	159.4	6	2	50	-0-	37. ⁵⁰ per Container
26	TP 161	161.8	2	1	12	10. ⁷⁵	16. ²⁵
27	TP 173	173.2	2	1	12	10. ⁷⁵	16. ²⁵
28	Boston M.B.	173.9	40	1	12	-0-	430. ⁰⁰
29	TP 180	180.3	2	1	12	10. ⁷⁵	16. ²⁵
30	TP 187	187.2	2	1	12	10. ⁷⁵	16. ²⁵
31	TP 193	193.9	2	1	12	10. ⁵⁰	25. ⁰⁰
32	Hiram M.B.	198.6	40	1	16	-0-	425. ⁰⁰
33	TP 209	209.2	2	1	12	10. ⁰⁰	15. ⁰⁰
34	TP 215	215.0	2	1	12	10. ⁰⁰	15. ⁰⁰
35	TP 216	216.4	2	1	12	10. ⁰⁰	15. ⁰⁰
36	TP 218	218.7	2	1	12	10. ⁰⁰	15. ⁰⁰
37	Canfield M.B.	228.1	40	1	14	-0-	300. ⁰⁰
38	TP 232	232.9	2	1	12	10. ⁰⁰	15. ⁰⁰
39	TP 234	234.1	2	1	12	10. ⁰⁰	15. ⁰⁰
40	TP 239	239.1	2	1	12	10. ⁰⁰	15. ⁰⁰

RECYCLEABLE MATERIALS

Item	Facility Name	Milepost Location	Box Size (C.Y.)	Qty.	Approximate Pickups/Year	Box Rental Fee	Cost per Pickup
41	Elmore Recycle	79.7	6	1	12	No BID	
42	Ad Bldg Recycle	159.4	6	2	12	17. ⁰⁰	46. ²⁵ Both Containers
43	Hiram Recycle	198.6	6	1	12	No BID	

BID FORM

TIRE DEBRIS MATERIALS

Item	Facility Name	Milepost Location	Box Size (C.Y.)	Qty.	Approximate Pickups/Year	Box Rental Fee	Cost per Pickup
44	Kunkle Tire Debris	48.3	12	1	8	No Bid	No Bid
45	Swanton Tire Debris	78.7	12	1	8	No Bid	No Bid
46	Elmore Tire Debris	79.7	12	1	8	No Bid	No Bid
47	Castalia Tire Debris	106.7	12	1	8	No Bid	No Bid
48	Amherst Tire Debris	141.0	12	1	8	No Bid	No Bid
49	Boston Tire Debris	173.9	12	1	8	No Bid	No Bid
50	Hiram Tire Debris	198.6	12	1	8	-0-	375. ⁰⁰ w/2 ton limit,
51	Canfield Tire Debris	228.1	12	1	8	-0-	*275. ⁰⁰ w/2 ton limit,

over 2 ton is \$42.⁰⁰ per ton
over 2 ton is \$33.³⁹ per ton

Above prices shall be net thirty (30) days after removal and disposal of the trash, recyclables & tire debris covered by the Contract and receipt of invoice for same. Any term discount for payment within twenty (20) days after delivery, acceptance and receipt of invoice shall be as follows: 0 % of bid price (See "Discount Terms" in the Additional Terms, see page 4)

The materials as specified are to be removed during a regular week work day between the hours of 8:00 A.M. and 3:00 P.M., exclusive of holidays within the time stipulated in the Special Provisions.

PICK UP LOCATION

Locations are as identified in the schedule and as further detailed in the attached Facility List.

*On Advice of Ohio EPA, tire remnants may have to be directed to a tire monofill LF, price for monofill is \$375.⁰⁰ for haul plus \$100.⁰⁰/ton disposal. If classified as MSW Above pricing applies.

OHIO TURNPIKE COMMISSION

682 PROSPECT STREET
BEREA, OHIO 44017
PROCUREMENT DEPARTMENT
440-234-2081

BID INVITATION NO. 4192

FOR FURNISHING

TRASH, RECYCLABLE & TIRE DEBRIS REMOVAL AT THE OHIO TURNPIKE
COMMISSION'S EIGHT (8) MAINTENANCE BUILDINGS, ADMINISTRATION
BUILDING, STATE PATROL POST 90 AND VARIOUS TOLL PLAZAS

OPENING DATE:

2:00 P.M. (E.S.T.), NOVEMBER 30, 2012

SUBMITTED BY:

COMPANY NAME: WASTE MANAGEMENT OF OHIO

CONTACT NAME: _____

STREET ADDRESS: 6705 RICHMOND ROAD

CITY AND STATE: GLENWILLOW, OH ZIP: 44139

TELEPHONE NUMBER: _____

FAX NUMBER: _____

EMAIL: _____

ATTACHMENTS:

- Facilities Chart

Published and Copyrighted © 2012 by The Ohio Turnpike Commission

If you have received these Contract Documents from any entity other than the Ohio Turnpike Commission, you risk the receipt of inaccurate information and/or plans; and will not receive any addenda issued by the Commission. These documents are copyrighted by the Ohio Turnpike Commission. Any unauthorized electronic reproduction of these documents for the purpose of resale or bidding subscription services is expressly prohibited.

BID FORM
TRASH

Item	Facility Name	Milepost Location	Box Size (C.Y.)	Qty.	Approximate Pickups/Year	Box Rental Fee	Cost per Pickup
1	TP 2	2.7	4	1	12	Ø	No BID
2	TP 13	13.5	2	1	12	Ø	No BID
3	Kunkle M.B.	16.0	20	1	12	Ø	No BID
4	TP 25	25.5	2	1	12	Ø	No BID
5	TP 34	34.9	2	1	12	Ø	\$25.00
6	TP 39	39.8	2	1	12	Ø	\$25.00
7	Swanton M.B.	48.3	30	1	12	Ø	\$355.00
8	TP 52	52.6	2	1	12	Ø	\$25.00
9	TP 59	59.5	2	1	12	Ø	\$25.00
10	TP 64	64.9	2	1	12	Ø	\$25.00
11	TP 71	71.7	2	1	12	Ø	\$25.00
12	Elmore M.B.	79.7	30	1	12	Ø	\$325.00
13	TP 81	81.8	2	1	12	Ø	\$25.00
14	TP 91	91.6	2	1	12	Ø	\$25.00
15	Castalia M.B.	106.7	30	1	12	Ø	\$415.00
16	TP 110	110.2	2	1	12	Ø	\$25.00
17	Post 90	118.6	6	1	12	Ø	\$50.00
18	TP 135	135.9	2	1	12	Ø	No BID
19	TP 140	140.6	2	1	12	Ø	No BID
20	Amherst M.B.	141.0	30	1	12	Ø	No BID
21	TP 142	142.8	2	1	12	Ø	No BID
22	TP 145	145.5	2	1	12	Ø	\$25.00
23	TP 151	151.8	2	1	12	Ø	\$25.00

BID FORM
TRASH

Item	Facility Name	Milepost Location	Box Size (C.Y.)	Qty.	Approximate Pickups/Year	Box Rental Fee	Cost per Pickup
24	TP 152	152.2	2	1	12	Ø	\$ 25.00
25	Berea	159.4	6	2	50	Ø	\$ 50.00 (\$25.00 EACH)
26	TP 161	161.8	2	1	12	Ø	\$ 25.00
27	TP 173	173.2	2	1	12	Ø	\$ 25.00
28	Boston M.B.	173.9	40	1	12	Ø	\$ 420.00
29	TP 180	180.3	2	1	12	Ø	\$ 25.00
30	TP 187	187.2	2	1	12	Ø	\$ 25.00
31	TP 193	193.9	2	1	12	Ø	\$ 25.00
32	Hiram M.B.	198.6	40	1	16	Ø	\$ 485.00
33	TP 209	209.2	2	1	12	Ø	\$ 25.00
34	TP 215	215.0	2	1	12	Ø	\$ 25.00
35	TP 216	216.4	2	1	12	Ø	\$ 25.00
36	TP 218	218.7	2	1	12	Ø	\$ 25.00
37	Canfield M B	228.1	40	1	14	Ø	\$ 306.00
38	TP 232	232.9	2	1	12	Ø	\$ 25.00
39	TP 234	234.1	2	1	12	Ø	\$ 25.00
40	TP 239	239.1	2	1	12	Ø	\$ 25.00

RECYCLEABLE MATERIALS

Item	Facility Name	Milepost Location	Box Size (C.Y.)	Qty.	Approximate Pickups/Year	Box Rental Fee	Cost per Pickup
41	Elmore Recycle	79.7	6	1	12	Ø	\$ 30.00
42	Ad Bldg Recycle	159.4	6	2	12	Ø	(\$25.00 EACH) \$ 50.00
43	Hiram Recycle	198.6	6	1	12	Ø	\$ 40.00

BID FORM

TIRE DEBRIS MATERIALS

Item	Facility Name	Milepost Location	Box Size (C.Y.)	Qty.	Approximate Pickups/Year	Box Rental Fee	Cost per Pickup
44	Kunkle Tire Debris	48.3	12	1	8	Ø	NO BID
45	Swanton Tire Debris	78.7	12	1	8	Ø	\$750.00 Per Haul \$95.00 Per Ton
46	Elmore Tire Debris	79.7	12	1	8	Ø	\$620.00 Per Haul \$95.00 Per Ton
47	Castalia Tire Debris	106.7	12	1	8	Ø	\$535.00 Per Haul \$95.00 Per Ton
48	Amherst Tire Debris	141.0	12	1	8	Ø	NO BID
49	Boston Tire Debris	173.9	12	1	8	Ø	\$275.00 Per Haul \$95.00 Per Ton
50	Hiram Tire Debris	198.6	12	1	8	Ø	\$258.00 Per Haul \$95.00 Per Ton
51	Canfield Tire Debris	228.1	12	1	8	Ø	\$220.00 Per Haul \$95.00 Per Ton

Above prices shall be net thirty (30) days after removal and disposal of the trash, recyclables & tire debris covered by the Contract and receipt of invoice for same. Any term discount for payment within twenty (20) days after delivery, acceptance and receipt of invoice shall be as follows: N/A % of bid price. (See "Discount Terms" in the Additional Terms, see page 4.)

The materials as specified are to be removed during a regular week work day between the hours of 8:00 A.M. and 3:00 P.M., exclusive of holidays within the time stipulated in the Special Provisions.

PICK UP LOCATION

Locations are as identified in the schedule and as further detailed in the attached Facility List.

ALTERNATIVE PRICE FLAT RATE.

ITEM

44 Kunkle NO BID
 45 SWANTON \$845/haul \$95.00 per ton over 1 ton
 46 ELMORE \$715/haul \$95.00 per ton over 1 ton
 47 CASTALIA \$630/haul \$95.00 per ton over 1 ton
 48 AMHERST NO BID
 49 BOSTON \$370/haul \$95.00 per ton over 1 ton
 50 HIRAM \$353/haul \$95.00 per ton over 1 ton
 51 CANFIELD \$295.00/haul \$95.00 per ton over 1 ton

~~NO BID~~