(Estimated Cost: $ 1,400,000.00)
OHIO TURNPIKE AND INFRASTRUCTURE COMMISSION
682 PROSPECT STREET
BEREA, OHIO 44017

PROCUREMENT SECTION

INVITATION NUMBER 4207

FOR FURNISHING EIGHT (8) EACH CURRENT MODEL TRUCK CAB AND CHASSIS, 40,000 LB. GVWR AND FURNISHING AND INSTALLING
EIGHT (8) EACH DUMP BODIES, FRONT PLOWS, CENTRAL HYDRAULIC SYSTEMS AND LIGHTING SYSTEMS

OPENING DATE - SEPTEMBER 27, 2013

GROUP I GROUP I GROUP II

MAKE, YEAR & UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
BIDDER MODEL OFFERED 8- EACH 8—EACH TERMS
Hans Freightliner of Cleveland 2014 Freightliner M2-106 $ 77,290.00 NO BID NET
14520 Broadway Avenue
Cleveland, Ohio 44125 Additional Purchase Option:

Yes
Cleveland Freightliner, Inc. 2014/15 Freightliner M2-106 $ 78,391.00 NO BID NET
Dba/Valley Freightliner, Inc.
10901 Brookpark Road Additional Purchase Option:
Parma, Ohio 44130 Yes
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OHIO TURNPIKE AND INFRASTRUCTURE COMMISSION

PROCUREMENT SECTION

INVITATION NUMBER 4207

682 PROSPECT STREET
BEREA, OHIO 44017

FOR FURNISHING EIGHT (8) EACH CURRENT MODEL TRUCK CAB AND CHASSIS, 40,000 LB. GVWR AND FURNISHING AND INSTALLING

EIGHT (8) EACH DUMP BODIES, FRONT PLOWS, CENTRAL HYDRAULIC SYSTEMS AND LIGHTING SYSTEMS

BIDDER

Cleveland Peterbilt
8650 Brookpark Road
Cleveland, Ohio 44129

Kenworth of Richfield
2890 Brecksville Road
Richfield, Ohio 44286

OPENING DATE - SEPTEMBER 27, 2013

GROUP |
MAKE, YEAR &
MODEL OFFERED

2014 Peterbilt 348

Additional Purchase Option:
Yes

2014 Kenworth T470

Additional Purchase Option:
Yes

GROUP |
UNIT PRICE
8 - EACH

$ 84,390.00

$ 93,987.00
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GROUP Il

UNIT PRICE

8 —EACH TERMS
NO BID NET
NO BID NET



OHIO TURNPIKE AND INFRASTRUCTURE COMMISSION
682 PROSPECT STREET
BEREA, OHIO 44017
PROCUREMENT SECTION

INVITATION NUMBER 4207

FOR FURNISHING EIGHT (8) EACH CURRENT MODEL TRUCK CAB AND CHASSIS, 40,000 LB. GVWR AND FURNISHING AND INSTALLING
EIGHT (8) EACH DUMP BODIES, FRONT PLOWS, CENTRAL HYDRAULIC SYSTEMS AND LIGHTING SYSTEMS

OPENING DATE - SEPTEMBER 27, 2013

GROUP | GROUP | GROUP 11

MAKE, YEAR & UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
BIDDER MODEL OFFERED 8 - EACH 8 —EACH TERMS
R&R Inc. 2014 Mack GU432 $99,005.00 NO BID NET
Dba/Cleveland Mack Sales & Service
4847 Johnston Parkway Additional Purchase Option:
Cleveland, Ohio 44128 Yes
Bid #1
Concord Road Equipment Mfg., Inc. NO BID NO BID $77,346.01 NET
348 Chester Street
Painesville, Ohio 44077 Additional Purchase Option:

Yes

Hooklift Alternate Option:
Swaploader — SL-2418 HD Hooklift Hoist
$101,857.97
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OHIO TURNPIKE AND INFRASTRUCTURE COMMISSION

682 PROSPECT STREET
BEREA, OHIO 44017

PROCUREMENT SECTION

INVITATION NUMBER 4207

FOR FURNISHING EIGHT (8) EACH CURRENT MODEL TRUCK CAB AND CHASSIS, 40,000 LB. GVWR AND FURNISHING AND INSTALLING

EIGHT (8) EACH DUMP BODIES, FRONT PLOWS, CENTRAL HYDRAULIC SYSTEMS AND LIGHTING SYSTEMS

BIDDER

Bid #2

Concord Road Equipment Mfg., Inc.
348 Chester Street

Painesville, Ohio 44077

Henderson Products Inc.
2177 State Route 19
Bucyrus, Ohio 44820

OPENING DATE - SEPTEMBER 27, 2013

GROUP |
MAKE, YEAR &
MODEL OFFERED

NO BID

NO BID

GROUP |
UNIT PRICE
8 - EACH

NO BID

NO BID
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GROUP Il

UNIT PRICE

8 —EACH TERMS
$ 79,468.83 NET

Additional Purchase Option:
Yes

Hooklift Alternate Option:
Swaploader SL-2418 HD Hooklift Hoist
$104,085.13

$ 82,934.00 NET

Additional Purchase Option:
Yes

Hooklift Alternate Option:
Swaploader SL-2418 HD Hooklift Hoist
$94,118.00



FOR FURNISHING EIGHT (8) EACH CURRENT MODEL TRUCK CAB AND CHASSIS, 40,000 LB. GVWR AND FURNISHING AND INSTALLING

OHIO TURNPIKE AND INFRASTRUCTURE COMMISSION

682 PROSPECT STREET
BEREA, OHIO 44017

PROCUREMENT SECTION

INVITATION NUMBER 4207

EIGHT (8) EACH DUMP BODIES, FRONT PLOWS, CENTRAL HYDRAULIC SYSTEMS AND LIGHTING SYSTEMS

BIDDER

Cives Corporation
Dba/Viking Cives (USA)
14331 Mill Street
Harrisville, New York 13648

Air-flo Mfg., Co., Inc.
365 Upper Oakwood Avenue
Elmira Heights, New York 14903

OPENING DATE - SEPTEMBER 27, 2013

GROUP |
MAKE, YEAR &
MODEL OFFERED

NO BID

NO BID

GROUP |
UNIT PRICE
8 - EACH

NO BID

NO BID
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GROUP Il
UNIT PRICE

8 —EACH TERMS

$ 87,445.00 NET

Additional Purchase Option:
Yes

Hooklift Alternate Option:
Make Not Identified
$112,073.00

$ 90,266.00 NET

Additional Purchase Option:
Yes

Hooklift Alternate Option:
Swaploader SL-2418
$117,333.00



