
(Estimated Cost:  $ 220,000.00 ) 
OHIO TURNPIKE AND INFRASTRUCTURE COMMISSION 

682 PROSPECT STREET 
            BEREA, OHIO  44017 

PROCUREMENT SECTION 
INVITATION NUMBER  4208 

 
FOR FURNISHING ALL SERVICE AND MATERIALS FOR CLEANING OF ALL THE COMMISSION’S TOLL PLAZAS AND OHIO STATE HIGHWAY 

PATROL POSTS 89, 90 & 91 
 

OPENING  DATE  -  SEPTEMBER 27, 2013 
 
      GROUP I   GROUP I       GROUP II GROUP II  GROUP III GROUP III           
      MONTHLY   HOURLY    MONTHLY  HOURLY   MONTHLY  HOURLY           
BIDDER     RATE              RATE               RATE             RATE          RATE           RATE           TERMS 
 
 
A.H. Ross Corp.    $ 4,950.00  $18.00   $ 3,990.04 $18.00   $ 4,449.94 $18.00   5% 
4730 W. Bancroft Street, Suite 1 
Toledo, Ohio 43615 
 
Any Domestic Work, Inc.   $ 5,095.00  $12.85   $ 4,680.00  $12.85   $ 4,635.00 $12.85   Net 
dba/A.D.W., Inc.  
5735 Pearl Road 
Parma, Ohio 44129 
 
American Maintenance Services ,  Inc.  NO BID NO BID  $ 4,094.70 $18.00   $ 3,905.46 $18.00   Net 
20 Federal Place, Suite 2B 
Youngstown, Ohio 44503 
 
Anchor Cleaning Contractors, Inc.  NO BID NO BID  $4,125.00 $30.00   NO BID NO BID  1/2% 
1966 W. 52nd Street 
Cleveland, Ohio 44102 
 
D.J. & D Cleaning Services, Inc.  NO BID NO BID  $ 4,221.00 $35.00   $4,152.00 $35.00   1% 
2240 Hunting Valley Lane 
Streetsboro, Ohio 44241 
 
**GROUP I – AWARDED TO:  A.D.W., INC. 
GROUPS II & III – AWARDED TO:  AMERICAN MAINTENANCE SVCS.** 
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