BIDDER

The Firelands Supply Company
18 South Norwalk Road
Norwalk, OH 44857

Gregory Industries, Inc.
4100 13th Street, S.W.
Canton, OH 44710

R.G. Steel Corp
8301 Mercer Street
Pulaski, PA 16143

E.M.M. / Black's Distributor
3546 Delphos Avenue
Dayton, Ohio 45417

Monroeville Industrial Moldings
75 Ontario Street
Norwalk, Ohio 44857

GROUP |
ITEM 1

$47.90/ea.

$48.70/ea.

$49.00/ea.

$52.00/ea.

NO BID

OHIO TURNPIKE AND INFRASTRUCTURE COMMISSION
682 PROSPECT STREET
BEREA, OHIO 44017
PROCUREMENT SECTION

FOR FURNISHING GUARDRAIL MATERIALS

BID INVITATION NO. 4225

GROUP |
ITEM 2

$0.54/ea.

$0.51/ea.

$0.50/ea.

$0.51/ea.

NO BID

OPENING DATE - JULY 24, 2014

GROUP |
ITEM 3

$1.33/ea.

$1.25/ea.

$1.25/ea.

$1.42/ea.

NO BID

GROUP |
ITEM 4

$29.50/ea.

$28.95/ea.

$29.00/ea.

$32.00/ea.

NO BID

TOTAL
BID PRICE
GROUP |

$160,116.00

$160,225.00

$160,750.00

$172,164.00

NO BID

***Group | Awarded to: The Firelands Supply Company***
***Group Il Awarded to: R.G. Steel Corp.***
Via Resolution No. 53-2014 on August 18, 2014

TOTAL
GROUP Il BID PRICE
ITEM 1 GROUP I

$3.95/ea. $11,850.00

$5.30/ea. $15,900.00

$3.50/ea. $10,500.00

$3.24/ea.

$9,720.00

$3.55/ea.  $10,650.00

TERMS

NET

NET

NET

NET

NET
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