OHIO TURNPIKE AND INFRASTRUCTURE COMMISSION
682 PROSPECT STREET
BEREA, OHIO 44017

OPENING DATE
AUGUST 15, 2014

BID INVITATION NUMBER 4228

FOR FURNISHING PNEUMATIC TIRES

BIDDERS
"A" Belle Tire Distributors
"B" Bob Sumerel Tire Co.
"C" Goodyear Commercial Tire &Service Centers
"D" North Gateway Tire Co., Inc.
"E" Ziegler Tire & Supply
| UNIT COST PER TIRE
ITEM # "A" "B" "c" "D" "E"
1 $ 94.75 $ 94.90 NO BID $ 106.42 $ 95.28
2 $ 68.88 $ 63.92 NO BID $ 78.43 $ 64.62
3 $ 104.34 $ 104.34 $ 116.33 $ 103.34 $ 104.34
4 $ 77.47 $ 86.51 $ 80.53 NO BID $ 86.51
5 $ 118.32 $ 17351 $ 123.01 $ 120.00 $ 167.77
6 $ 131.10 $ 145.00 $ 136.30 $ 169.41 $ 17041
7 $ 115.78 $ 136.00 $ 120.37 $ 152.35 $ 204.80
8 $ 194.75 $ 199.00 $ 179.91 $ 226.00 $ 198.87
9 $ 11111 $ 11011 $ 14212 $ 11594 $ 11111
10 $ 125.66 $ 124.66 $ 160.35 $ 124.66 $ 125.66
11 $ 272.36 $ 280.36 $ 256.00 $ 265.00 $ 245.73
12 $ 166.00 $ 235.06 $ 236.00 $ 235.00 $ 224.07
13 $ 410.00 $ 477.89 $ T777.72 $ 555.00 $ 478.89
14 $ 299.00 $ 334.62 $ 377.04 $ 375.00 $ 348.90
15 $ 363.50 $  424.90 $ 433.44 $ 435.00 $ 413.40
16 $ 376.00 $ 577.58 $ 630.32 $  440.00 $ 471.95
17 $ 93.36 $ 116.00 NO BID $ 72.00 NO BID
18 $ 79.97 $ 64.00 $ 83.84 $ 70.00 NO BID
19 $ 83.30 $ 72.00 $ 96.42 $ 78.00 NO BID
20 $ 110.88 $ 107.00 NO BID $ 95.00 NO BID
21 $ 118.45 $ 108.00 NO BID $ 98.00 NO BID
22 $ 146.33 $ 122.00 $ 223.78 $ 113.00 NO BID
23 $ 194.09 $ 253.42 $ 294.96 $ 275.00 $ 255.42
24 $ 178.41 $ 149.00 NO BID $ 150.00 $ 184.90
25 $ 673.82 $ 645.00 NO BID $ 550.00 $ 624.17
26 $ 1,172.61 $ 859.00 NO BID $ 775.00 $ 1,486.80
27 $ 21.76 $ 40.00 NO BID $ 20.00 NO BID
28 $ 58.06 $ 75.00 NO BID $ 50.00 NO BID
29 $ 358.36 $ 319.00 NO BID $ 295.00 $ 594.21
30 $ 884.55 $ 815.00 NO BID $ 725.00 NO BID
31 $ 540.85 $  540.00 NO BID $  485.00 NO BID
32 $ 83.45 $ 99.00 NO BID $ 80.00 NO BID
33 $ 345.70 $ 365.00 NO BID $ 325.00 NO BID
34 $ 21321 $  245.00 NO BID $ 210.00 NO BID
35 $ 75.45 $ 70.00 NO BID $ 65.00 NO BID
36 $ 435.76 $  485.00 NO BID $  446.00 $ 43450
TERMS NET NET NET NET NET
*»**Bid Invitation No. 4228 Awarded as follows:
Belle Tire Distributors - Items 1, 4,5, 6, 7, 11, 12, 13, 14, 15, 16 & 23
Ziegler Tire & Supply - Iltems 2, 8 & 36
North Gateway Tire Co. - Iltems 3, 17, 20, 21, 22, 25, 29, 30, 31, 32, 33,34 & 35

Bob Sumerel Tire Co. - Items 9, 18, 19, 24, 26, 27,28 & 10
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