OHIO TURNPIKE AND INFRASTRUCTURE COMMISSION
682 PROSPECT STREET
BEREA, OHIO 44017
PROCUREMENT SECTION

A TWELVE-MONTH SERVICE CONTRACT FOR THE INSPECTION, TESTING AND REPAIR OF FIRE ALARM SYSTEMS, FIRE SPRINKLER SYSTEMS AND FIRE

BID INVITATION NO. 4235

SUPPRESSION/EXTINGUISHING SYSTEMS LOCATED IN VARIOUS COMMISSION BUILDINGS

OPENING DATE - OCTOBER 31, 2014

GROUP |
LABOR RATE

GROUP |
BIDDER EXTENDED COST
S.A. Comunale Co., Inc. $ 4,800.00
135 Alpha Drive
Highland Heights, Ohio 44143
Gene Ptacek & Son Fire Equipment $5,760.00

7310 Associate Avenue
Brooklyn, Ohio 44144

Monday — Friday

8:00 a.m. —5:00 p.m.

$ 70.00/hour
Monday — Friday

5:00 p.m. - 8:00 a.m.

$ 105.00/hour
Saturday, Sunday &
Holidays

$ 140.00/hour

Monday — Friday

8:00 a.m. - 5:00 p.m.

$ 65.00/hour
Monday — Friday

5:00 p.m. - 8:00 a.m.

$ 97.50/hour
Saturday, Sunday &
Holidays

$ 130.00/hour

PARTS

-20%

- 30%

GROUP II
EXTENDED COST

Facility Sprinkler
Test/Inspection
$6,960.00
FM-200/FE-25 Test
$7,920.00

Facility Sprinkler
Test/Inspection

$ 7,200.00
FM-200/FE-25 Test
$ 8,580.00

GROUP II
LABOR RATE

PARTS

Monday - Friday

8:00 a.m. —5:00 p.m.

$ 75.00/hour
Monday — Friday

5:00 p.m. - 8:00 a.m.

$ 112.50/hour
Saturday, Sunday &
Holidays
$150.00/hour

Monday — Friday

8:00 a.m. - 5:00 p.m.

$ 65.00/hour
Monday - Friday

5:00 p.m. — 8:00 p.m.

$ 97.50/hour
Saturday, Sunday &
Holidays
$130.00/hour

-20%

- 30%

***BID INVITATION NO. 4235 AWARDED AS FOLLOWS: GROUP I - GENE PTACEK & SON FIRE EQUIPMENT
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GROUP Il - ATECH FIRE & SECURITY, LLC

Net



OHIO TURNPIKE AND INFRASTRUCTURE COMMISSION
682 PROSPECT STREET
BEREA, OHIO 44017
PROCUREMENT SECTION

BID INVITATION NO. 4235

A TWELVE-MONTH SERVICE CONTRACT FOR THE INSPECTION, TESTING AND REPAIR OF FIRE ALARM SYSTEMS, FIRE SPRINKLER SYSTEMS AND FIRE
SUPPRESSION/EXTINGUISHING SYSTEMS LOCATED IN VARIOUS COMMISSION BUILDINGS

OPENING DATE - OCTOBER 31, 2014

GROUP | GROUP | GROUP Il GROUP Il

BIDDER EXTENDED COST LABOR RATE PARTS EXTENDED COST LABOR RATE PARTS TERMS
Atech Fire & Security, LLC $ 7,200.00 Monday — Friday - 25% Facility Sprinkler Monday — Friday - 25% Net
600 Shoemaker Avenue, Unit 5 8:00 a.m. —5:00 p.m. Test/Inspection 8:00 a.m. —5:00 p.m.
Columbus, Ohio 43201 $ 60.00/hour $7,200.00 $ 60.00/hour

Monday — Friday FM-200/FE-25Test Monday — Friday

5:00 p.m. - 8:00 a.m. $ 8,250.00 5:00 pm —8:00 p.m.

$ 90.00/hour $ 90.00/hour

Saturday, Sunday & Saturday, Sunday &

Holidays Holidays

$ 120.00/hour $120.00/hour
SimplexGrinnell LP $14,928.00 Monday — Friday -37% Facility Sprinkler Monday - Friday -37% Net

3661 Briarfield Blvd., Suite 101
Maumee, Ohio 43537

8:00 a.m. —5:00 p.m.

$ 123.00/hour
Monday — Friday

5:00 p.m. - 8:00 a.m.

Test/Inspection
$ 3,696.00

FM-200/FE-25 Test

$28,512.00

8:00 a.m. —5:00 p.m.

$107.00/hour
Monday - Friday

5:00 p.m. - 8:00 a.m.

$ 185.00/hour $161.00/hour
Saturday, Sunday & Saturday, Sunday &
Holidays Holidays

$ 185.00/hour $161.00/hour
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OHIO TURNPIKE AND INFRASTRUCTURE COMMISSION

A TWELVE-MONTH SERVICE CONTRACT FOR THE INSPECTION, TESTING AND REPAIR OF FIRE ALARM SYSTEMS, FIRE SPRINKLER SYSTEMS AND FIRE

682 PROSPECT STREET
BEREA, OHIO 44017
PROCUREMENT SECTION

BID INVITATION NO. 4235

SUPPRESSION/EXTINGUISHING SYSTEMS LOCATED IN VARIOUS COMMISSION BUILDINGS

OPENING DATE - OCTOBER 31, 2014

GROUP |
LABOR RATE

GROUP |
BIDDER EXTENDED COST
RWJ Wiring, Inc. $15,360.00
1287 Marquette Street
Cleveland, Ohio 44114
Xentry Systems Integration $16,800.00

771 Dearborn Park Lane, Suite N
Columbus, Ohio 43085

Monday — Friday

8:00 a.m. —5:00 p.m.

$ 126.00/hour
Monday — Friday

5:00 p.m. - 8:00 a.m.

$ 142.00/hour
Saturday, Sunday &
Holidays

$ 252.00/hour

Monday — Friday

8:00 a.m. —5:00 p.m.

$ 105.00/hour
Monday — Friday

5:00 p.m. - 8:00 a.m.

$ 157.50/hour
Saturday, Sunday &
Holidays

$ 210.00/hour

GROUP II

PARTS EXTENDED COST

+ 5% NO BID

- 20% Facility Sprinkler
Test/Inspection
$ 5,400.00
FM-200/FE-25 Test
$20,460.00
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GROUP II

LABOR RATE PARTS TERMS
NO BID NO BID 5%
Monday - Friday - 20% 1%
8:00 a.m. —5:00 p.m.

$ 105.00/hour

Monday - Friday
5:00 p.m. —8:00 a.m.
$ 157.50/hour
Saturday, Sunday &
Holidays

$ 210.00/hour




	BIDDER    EXTENDED COST LABOR  RATE  PARTS  EXTENDED COST   LABOR RATE             PARTS           TERMS
	Monday – Friday   FM-200/FE-25 Test  Monday – Friday
	BIDDER    EXTENDED COST LABOR  RATE  PARTS  EXTENDED COST   LABOR RATE             PARTS         TERMS
	600 Shoemaker Avenue, Unit 5     8:00 a.m. – 5:00 p.m.   Test/Inspection   8:00 a.m. – 5:00 p.m.
	Columbus, Ohio 43201      $  60.00/hour    $ 7,200.00   $ 60.00/hour
	Monday – Friday   FM-200/FE-25Test  Monday – Friday
	5:00 p.m. – 8:00 a.m.   $ 8,250.00   5:00 pm – 8:00 p.m.
	$  90.00/hour        $ 90.00/hour
	Saturday, Sunday &       Saturday, Sunday &
	Holidays        Holidays
	$ 120.00/hour        $120.00/hour
	SimplexGrinnell LP   $14,928.00  Monday – Friday - 37%  Facility Sprinkler  Monday - Friday - 37%                  Net

	BIDDER    EXTENDED COST LABOR  RATE  PARTS  EXTENDED COST   LABOR RATE             PARTS       TERMS
	RWJ Wiring, Inc.   $15,360.00  Monday – Friday +  5%  NO BID   NO BID  NO BID           5%
	Xentry Systems Integration  $16,800.00  Monday – Friday - 20%  Facility Sprinkler  Monday - Friday - 20%                1%


