## INFRASTRUCTURE COMMISSION

682 PROSPECT STREET BEREA, OHIO 44017
PROCUREMENT DEPARTMENT
440-234-2081

BID INVITATION NO. 4238

#### FOR FURNISHING:

TRASH, RECYCLABLE & TIRE DEBRIS REMOVAL AT THE OHIO TURNPIKE AND INFRASTRUCTURE COMMISSION'S EIGHT (8) MAINTENANCE BUILDINGS, ADMINISTRATION BUILDING, STATE PATROL POST 90 AND VARIOUS TOLL PLAZAS

#### **OPENING DATE:**

2:00 P.M. (ESI), JANUARY 9, 2015

SUBMITTED BY:
COMPANY NAME: Archbold Refuse Service, Inc.
CONTACT NAME: Michele L Ryder
STREET ADDRESS: 200 Taylor Parkway
CITY AND STATE: Archbold OH ZIP: 43502
TELEPHONE NUMBER: 419-445-5391
FAX NUMBER: 419-445-8378
EMAIL:michele@arsrefuse.com

#### ATTACHMENTS:

Facilities Map

Published and Copyrighted © 2014 by The Ohio Turnpike and Infrastructure Commission

If you have received these Contract Documents from any entity other than the Ohio Turnpike Commission, you risk the receipt of inaccurate information and/or plans; and will not receive any addenda issued by the Commission These documents are copyrighted by the Ohio Turnpike Commission Any unauthorized electronic reproduction of these documents for the purpose of resale or bidding subscription services is expressly prohibited

Item	Facility Name	Milepost Location	Box Size (C.Y.)	Qty	Approximate Pickups/Year	Box Rental Fee	Cost per Pickup
1	TP 2	27	4	1	18	\$0.00	\$60.00
2	TP 13	13 5	2	1	6	\$0.00	\$40.00
3	Kunkle M B	16 0	20	1	12	\$30.00	150.00 haul/47.78 to
4	TP 25	25 5	2	1	6	\$0.00	\$75.00
5	TP 34	34 9	2	1	6	\$0.00	\$75.00
6	TP 39	39 8	2	1	6	\$30.00	\$40.00
7	Swanton M B	48 3	30	1	12	\$0.00	150.00 haul/47.78 to
8	TP 52	52 6	2	1	6	\$0.00	\$40.00
9	TP 59	59 5	4	1	18		
10	TP 64	64 9	4	1	18		
11	TP 71	71 7	4	1	18	•	
12	Elmore M B	79 7	30	1	12		
13	TP 81	81 8	2	1	6	The state of the s	
14	TP 91	91 6	2	1	6		
15	Castalia M B	106 7	30	1	12		
16	TP 110	110 2	2	1	18		
17	Post 90	118 6	6	1	18		
18	TP 135	135 9	2	1	6		
19	TP 140	140 6	2	1	6		
20	Amherst M B	141 0	30	1	12	till Applingsgrupper have kropped om synstem and men ukreine en egente telepe	
21	TP 142	142 8	2	1	12		
22	TP 145	145 5	2	1	12		
23	TP 151	151 8	2	1	12		

Item	Facility Name	Milepost Location	Box Size (C,Y.)	Qty.	Approximate Pickups/Year	Box Rental Fee	Cost per Pickup
24	TP 152	152 2	2	1	6		
25	Berea	159 4	6	2	36		
26	TP 161	161 8	2	1	18		
27	TP 173	173 2	2	1	18		aga ga gal al la della della anna anna della
28	Boston M B	173 9	40	1	12		
29	TP 180	180 3	2	1	18		
30	TP 187	187 2	2	1	18		
31	TP 193	193 9	2	1	6		<u>.</u>
32	Hiram M B	198 6	40	1	12		
33	TP 209	209 2	2	1	18	- trans of the plant	VI
34	TP 215	215 0	2	1	18		ng na 1860 na 1861 na 1861 na
35	TP 216	216 4	2	1	6		
36	TP 218	218 7	2	1	18		
37	Canfield M B	228 1	40	1	12		***************************************
38	TP 232	232 9	2	1	18		- Committee of the control and address and a single of the control and a single of the
39	TP 234	234 1	2	1	6	7/	
40	TP 239	239 1	2	1	18		

ltem	Facility Name	Milepost Location	Box Size (C.Y.)	Qty	Approximate Pickups/Year	Box Rental Fee	Cost per Pickup
41	Elmore Recycle	79 7	6	1	12		
42	Ad Bldg Recycle	159 4	6	2	18		
43	Hiram Recycle	198 6	6	1	12		

	TIRE DEBRIS MATERIALS												
ltem	Facility Name	Milepost Location	Box Size (C.Y.)	Qty.	Approximate Pickups/Year	Box Rental Fee	Cost per Pickup						
44	Kunkle Tire Debris	48 3	12	1	6	\$30.00	150.00 haul/47.78						
45	Swanton Tire Debris	78 7	12	1	6	\$30.00	150.00 haul/47.78						
46	Elmore Tire Debris	79 7	12	1	6								
47	Castalia Tire Debris	106 7	12	1	6								
48	Amherst Tire Debris	141 0	12	1	6								
49	Boston Tire Debris	173 9	12	1	6								
50	Hiram Tire Debris	198 6	12	1	6								
51	Canfield Tire Debris	228 1	12	1	6								

Above prices shall be net thirty (30) days after removal and disposal of the trash, recyclables & tire debris covered by the Contract and receipt of invoice for same. Any term discount for payment within twenty (20) days after delivery, acceptance and receipt of invoice shall be as follows: \_\_\_\_\_0 \_\_\_% of bid price (See "Discount Ierms" in the Additional Ierms, see page 4.)

The materials as specified are to be removed during a regular week work day between the hours of 8:00 A M and 3:00 P.M, exclusive of holidays within the time stipulated in the Special Provisions.

#### PICK UP LOCATION

Locations are as identified in the schedule and as further detailed in the attached Facility List

# **INFRASTRUCTURE COMMISSION**

682 PROSPECT STREET

PROCUREMENT DEPARTMENT

440-234-2081

BID INVITATION NO. 4238

#### FOR FURNISHING:

TRASH, RECYCLABLE & TIRE DEBRIS REMOVAL AT THE OHIO TURNPIKE AND INFRASTRUCTURE COMMISSION'S EIGHT (8) MAINTENANCE BUILDINGS, ADMINISTRATION BUILDING, STATE PATROL POST 90 AND VARIOUS TOLL PLAZAS

#### **OPENING DATE:**

2:00 P.M. (E.S.T.), JANUARY 9, 2015

SUBMITTED BY:
COMPANY NAME: Kimble Recycling & Desposal
CONTACT NAME: Larry Hellene
STREET ADDRESS: 3596 State Route 39 NW
CITY AND STATE: Dover, Ohio ZIP: 44623
TELEPHONE NUMBER: 330-340-9139
FAX NUMBER:
EMAIL: ahelline@Kimble.Companies.com
EMAIL:CTIETHTE & THIMBLE COUNTRY CONT

#### **ATTACHMENTS:**

• Facilities Map

Published and Copyrighted © 2014 by The Ohio Turnpike and Infrastructure Commission

If you have received these Contract Documents from any entity other than the Ohio Turnpike Commission, you risk the receipt of inaccurate information and/or plans; and will not receive any addenda issued by the Commission. These documents are copyrighted by the Ohio Turnpike Commission. Any unauthorized electronic reproduction of these documents for the purpose of resale or bidding subscription services is expressly prohibited.

Item	Facility Name	Milepost Location	Box Size (C.Y.)	Qty.	Approximate Pickups/Year	Box Rental Fee	Cost per Pickup
1	TP 2	2.7	4	1	18		
2	TP 13	13.5	2	1	6		
3	Kunkle M.B.	16 0	20	1	12		
4	TP 25	25.5	2	1	6		
5	TP 34	34.9	2	1	6		
6	TP 39	39.8	2	1	6	<del></del>	1-0
7	Swanton M.B.	48.3	30	1	12		
8	TP 52	52 6	2	1	6		
9	TP 59	59.5	4	1	18		
10	TP 64	64 9	4	1	18	7,000	
11	TP 71	71.7	4	1	18	S &	
12	Elmore M.B.	79.7	30	1	12		
13	TP 81	81.8	2	1	6	<b>7</b>	
14	TP 91	91.6	2	1	6		
15	Castalia M.B	106.7	30	1	12		
16	TP 110	110.2	2	1	18		······································
17	Post 90	118 6	6	1	18		
18	TP 135	135.9	2	1	6		
19	TP 140	140.6	2	1	6		
20	Amherst M.B.	141.0	30	1	12		
21	TP 142	142.8	2	1	12		
22	TP 145	145 5	2	1	12		14.
23	TP 151	151.8	2	1	12		

Item	Facility Name	Milepost Location	Box Size (C.Y.)	Qty.	Approximate Pickups/Year	Box Rental Fee	Cost per Pickup
24	TP 152	152.2	2	1	6		
25	Berea	159.4	6	2	36	10	2.5
26	TP 161	161.8	2	1	18	10	25
27	TP 173	173.2	2	1	18	10	25
28	Boston M.B.	173.9	40	1	12	95	425
29	TP 180	180.3	2	1	18	10	25
30	TP 187	187.2	2	1	18	10	25
31	TP 193	193 9	2	1	6	/ D	25
32	Hiram M.B	198.6	40	1	12	95	480
33	TP 209	209.2	2	1	18		
34	TP 215	215.0	2	1	18		
35	TP 216	216.4	2	1	6		
36	TP 218	218 7	2	1	18		
37	Canfield M B	228.1	40	1	12	95	480
38	TP 232	232.9	2	1	18		
39	TP 234	234.1	2	1	6		
40	TP 239	239.1	2	1	18		

Item	Facility Name	Milepost Location	Box Size (C.Y.)	Qty.	Approximate Pickups/Year	Box Rental Fee	Cost per Pickup
41	Elmore Recycle	79.7	6	1	12		
42	Ad Bldg Recycle	159.4	6	2	18	10	25=
43	Hiram Recycle	198.6	6	1	12	10	25=

	TIRE DEBRIS MATERIALS											
ltem	Facility Name	Milepost Location	Box Size (C.Y.)	Qty.	Approximate Pickups/Year	Box Rental Fee	Cost per Pickup					
44	Kunkle Tire Debris	48 3	12	1	6							
45	Swanton Tire Debris	78.7	12	1	6	10-10-0						
46	Elmore Tire Debris	79.7	12	1	6							
47	Castalia Tire Debris	106.7	12	1	6	· · ·						
48	Amherst Tire Debris	141.0	12	1	6	·····						
49	Boston Tire Debris	173.9	12	1	6	95	420					
50	Hiram Tire Debris	198.6	12	1	6	95	480					
51	Canfield Tire Debris	228.1	12	1	6	95	420					

Above prices shall be net thirty (30) days after removal and disposal of the trash, recyclables & tire debris covered by the Contract and receipt of invoice for same. Any term discount for payment within twenty (20) days after delivery, acceptance and receipt of invoice shall be as follows:

"Discount Terms" in the Additional Terms, see page 4)

The materials as specified are to be removed during a regular week work day between the hours of 8:00 A.M. and 3:00 P.M., exclusive of holidays within the time stipulated in the Special Provisions.

### **PICK UP LOCATION**

Locations are as identified in the schedule and as further detailed in the attached Facility List.

## **INFRASTRUCTURE COMMISSION**

682 PROSPECT STREET BEREA, OHIO 44017
PROCUREMENT DEPARTMENT
440-234-2081

BID INVITATION NO. 4238

#### FOR FURNISHING:

TRASH, RECYCLABLE & TIRE DEBRIS REMOVAL AT THE OHIO TURNPIKE AND INFRASTRUCTURE COMMISSION'S EIGHT (8) MAINTENANCE BUILDINGS, ADMINISTRATION BUILDING, STATE PATROL POST 90 AND VARIOUS TOLL PLAZAS

#### **OPENING DATE:**

2:00 P.M. (E.S.T.), JANUARY 9, 2015

SUBMITTED BY:
COMPANY NAME: POZZIGO COUSTA SOUD WASTE USTRU
CONTACT NAME: WILLIAM G. STEINER, II
STREET ADDRESS: 3588 MOGAQUE PORO
CITY AND STATE: VENT, OHO ZIP: 44240
TELEPHONE NUMBER: 330-678-8808
FAX NUMBER: 330-678-9405
EMAIL: BSTEINER @ PORTAGE CO. COM

#### ATTACHMENTS:

• Facilities Map

Published and Copyrighted © 2014 by The Ohio Turnpike and Infrastructure Commission

If you have received these Contract Documents from any entity other than the Ohio Turnpike Commission, you risk the receipt of inaccurate information and/or plans; and will not receive any addenda issued by the Commission. These documents are copyrighted by the Ohio Turnpike Commission. Any unauthorized electronic reproduction of these documents for the purpose of resale or bidding subscription services is expressly

ltem	Facility Name	Milepost Location	Box Size (C.Y.)	Qty.	Approximate Pickups/Year	Box Rental Fee	Cost per Pickup
1	TP 2	27	4	1	18		
2	TP 13	13.5	2	1	6		
3	Kunkle M.B	16 0	20	1	12		·
4	TP 25	25 5	2	1	6		10-1 - 1 - 1 - 1 - 1 - 1 - 1 - 1 - 1 - 1
5	TP 34	34.9	2	1	6		
6	TP 39	39.8	2	1	6		
7	Swanton M.B.	48.3	30	1 -	12		
8	TP 52	52 6	2	1	6		
9	TP 59	59.5	4	1	18		
10	TP 64	64.9	4	1	18		
11	TP 71	71 7	4	1	18		
12	Elmore M B	79.7	30	1	12		
13	TP 81	81.8	2	1	6		
14	TP 91	91 6	2	1	6		
15	Castalia M.B	106.7	30	1	12	19104	
16	TP 110	110.2	2	1	18		
17	Post 90	118.6	6	1	18		
18	TP 135	135 9	2	1	6		
19	TP 140	140.6	2	1	6		
20	Amherst M B	141 0	30	1	12		
21	TP 142	142.8	2	1	12		
22	TP 145	145 5	2	1	12		
23	TP 151	151 8	2	1	12		

Item	Facility Name	Milepost Location	Box Size (C.Y.)	Qty.	Approximate Pickups/Year	Box Rental Fee	Cost per Pickup
24	TP 152	152 2	2	1	6		
25	Berea	159.4	6	2	36		
26	TP 161	161.8	2	1	18		
27	TP 173	173.2	2	1	18		
28	Boston M B.	173.9	40	1	12		***************************************
29	TP 180	180 3	2	1	18		
30	TP 187	187.2	2	1	18		
31	TP 193	193.9	2	1	6		
32	Hiram M.B.	198.6	40	1	12		
33	TP 209	209.2	2	1	18		
34	TP 215	215 0	2	1	18		
35	TP 216	216 4	2	1	6		
36	TP 218	218.7	2	1	18		
37	Canfield M B	228.1	40	1	12		
38	TP 232	232.9	2	1	18		*** **********************************
39	TP 234	234.1	2	1	6		
40	TP 239	239 1	2	1	18		

Item	Facility Name	Milepost Location	Box Size (C.Y.)	Qty.	Approximate Pickups/Year	Box Rental Fee	Cost per Pickup
41	Elmore Recycle	79.7	6	1	12		<del>.</del>
42	Ad Bldg Recycle	159.4	6	2	18		
43	Hiram Recycle	198.6	6	1	12	351 Marill	

TIRE DEBRIS MATERIALS										
Item	Facility Name	Milepost Location	Box Size (C.Y.)	Qty.	Approximate Pickups/Year	Box Rental Fee	Cost per Pickup			
44	Kunkle Tire Debris	48 3	12	1	6		*1.0			
45	Swanton Tire Debris	78.7	12	1	6					
46	Elmore Tire Debris	79.7	12	1	6	7.7.2	· · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · ·			
47	Castalia Tire Debris	106.7	12	1	6					
48	Amherst Tire Debris	141.0	12	1	6					
49	Boston Tire Debris	173 9	12	1	6					
50	Hiram Tire Debris	198.6	12	1	6	7, 7, 7	*****			
51	Canfield Tire Debris	228.1	12	1	6					

Above prices shall be net thirty (30) days after removal and disposal of the trash, recyclables & tire debris covered by the Contract and receipt of invoice for same. Any term discount for payment within twenty (20) days after delivery, acceptance and receipt of invoice shall be as follows: \_\_\_\_\_\_\_\_% of bid price. (See "Discount Terms" in the Additional Terms, see page 4.)

The materials as specified are to be removed during a regular week work day between the hours of 8:00 A.M. and 3:00 P.M., exclusive of holidays within the time stipulated in the Special Provisions.

### PICK UP LOCATION

Locations are as identified in the schedule and as further detailed in the attached Facility List.

# INFRASTRUCTURE COMMISSION

682 PROSPECT STREET

BEREA, OHIO 44017

PROCUREMENT DEPARTMENT
440-234-2081

BID INVITATION NO. 4238

### FOR FURNISHING:

TRASH, RECYCLABLE & TIRE DEBRIS REMOVAL AT THE OHIO TURNPIKE AND INFRASTRUCTURE COMMISSION'S EIGHT (8) MAINTENANCE BUILDINGS, ADMINISTRATION BUILDING, STATE PATROL POST 90 AND VARIOUS TOLL PLAZAS

### OPENING DATE:

2:00 P.M (EST), JANUARY 9, 2015

SUBMITTED BY:	
COMPANY NAME: REPUBLIC SERVICEL, OUIO/L	vest Pa Are
CONTACT NAME: DAVID R. JEVIN	
STREET ADDRESS: 82730 FAIRWEU CENTSE DRIVE	
CITY AND STATE: FAIRVIEW PARK, OUTO ZIP:	44126
TELEPHONE NUMBER: 440 - 414 - 2313	
FAX NUMBER: 440 - 7/6 - 8056	
EMAIL: DIRVIN @ REPUBLIC SERVICE. COM	

#### ATTACHMENTS:

Facilities Map

Published and Copyrighted © 2014 by The Ohio Turnpike and Infrastructure Commission

If you have received these Contract Documents from any entity other than the Ohio Turnpike Commission, you risk the receipt of inaccurate information and/or plans; and will not receive any addenda issued by the Commission. These documents are copyrighted by the Ohio Turnpike Commission. Any unauthorized electronic reproduction of these documents for the purpose of resale or bidding subscription services is expressly prohibited.

Item	Facility Name	Milepost Location	Box Size (C.Y.)	Qty.	Approximate Pickups/Year	Box Rental Fee	Cost per Pickup
1	TP 2	2.7	4	1	18	0	6700
2	TP 13	13 5	2	1	6	B	3600
3	Kunkle M B.	16.0	20	1	12	.6	32000
4	TP 25	25.5	2	·1	6	0	36 00
5	TP 34	34.9	2	1	6	Ø	36 -
6	TP 39	39.8	2	1	6	8	36
7	Swanton M B	48.3	30	1	12	0	300. 00
8	TP 52	52.6	2	1	6	10.75	16.25
9	TP 59	59.5	4	1	18	13,00	32.00
10	TP 64	64.9	4	1	18	13.00	32.00
11	TP 71	71.7	4	1	18	13.06	32.00
12	Elmore M.B.	79.7	30	1	12	0	325, <sup>cz</sup>
13	TP 81	81.8	2	1	6	10.75	16.25
14	TP 91	91.6	2	1	6	10.75	16.25
15	Castalia M B.	106.7	30	1	12	0	295.66
16	TP 110	110.2	2	1	18	10.35	16,25
17	Post 90	118 6	6	1	18	1700	43,25
18	TP 135	135.9	2	1	6	10.75	16,25
19	TP 140	140.6	2	1	6	10.75	16.25
20	Amherst M.B.	141 0	30	1	12	0	375 0
21	TP 142	142 8	2	1	12	10,75	375, 06 16,25 16,25 16,25
22	TP 145	145.5	2	1	12	10.75	16.25
23	TP 151	151.8	2	1	12	10,75	16,25

Item	Facility Name	Milepost Location	Box Size (C.Y.)	Qty.	Approximate Pickups/Year	Box Rental Fee	Cost per Pickup
24	TP 152	152 2	2	1	6	10.75	16.25
25	Berea	159.4	6	2	36	6-	37.50/com
26	TP 161	161 8	2	1	18	10.75	16,25
27	TP 173	173.2	2	1	18	10.75	16.25
28	Boston M.B.	173.9	40	1	12	-8-	430.00
29	TP 180	180 3	2	1	18	10.25	11. 25
30	TP 187	187 2	2	1	18	10.75	16,25
31	TP 193	193 9	2	1	6	10.75	16.25
32	Hiram M B.	198.6	40	1	12	-6-	42500
33	TP 209	209 2	2	1	18	10,00	15.00
34	TP 215	215.0	2	1	18	10.00	15.00
35	TP 216	216.4	2	1	6	10.00	15.00
36	TP 218	218.7	2	1	18	10.00	15.00
37	Canfield M.B.	228 1	40	1	12	8	300. <sup>5</sup>
38	TP 232	232.9	2	1	18	10.00	15. 2
39	TP 234	234.1	2	1	6	10.20	
40	TP 239	239 1	2	1	18	10.00	15,00

Item	Facility Name	Milepost Location	Box Size (C.Y.)	Qty.	Approximate Pickups/Year	Box Rental Fee	Cost per Pickup
41	Elmore Recycle	79.7	6	1	12	No	BD
42	Ad Bldg Recycle	159 4	6	2	18	17.0° EACH	25.= EAC
43	Hiram Recycle	198.6	6	1	12	No	B/D

TIRE DEBRIS MATERIALS											
Item	Facility Name	Milepost Location	Box Size (C Y.)	Qty.	Approximate Pickups/Year	Box Rental Fee	Cost per Pickup				
44	Kunkle Tire Debris	48.3	12	1	6	No	BIN				
45	Swanton Tire Debris	78 7	12	1	6	No	RID				
46	Elmore Tire Debris	79.7	12	1	6	No	RID				
47	Castalia Tire Debris	106.7	12	1	6	No	RID				
48	Amherst Tire Debris	141.0	12	1	6	No	BID				
49	Boston Tire Debris	173 9	12	1	6	No	BD				
50	Hiram Tire Debris	198.6	12	1	6	$\mathcal{N}_{v}$	810				
51	Canfield Tire Debris	228.1	12	1	6	No	B1D				

The materials as specified are to be removed during a regular week work day between the hours of 8:00 A M and 3:00 P M., exclusive of holidays within the time stipulated in the Special Provisions.

### PICK UP LOCATION

Locations are as identified in the schedule and as further detailed in the attached Facility List

# INFRASTRUCTURE COMMISSION

682 PROSPECT STREET BEREA, OHIO 44017
PROCUREMENT DEPARTMENT
440-234-2081

BID INVITATION NO. 4238

#### FOR FURNISHING:

TRASH, RECYCLABLE & TIRE DEBRIS REMOVAL AT THE OHIO TURNPIKE AND INFRASTRUCTURE COMMISSION'S EIGHT (8) MAINTENANCE BUILDINGS, ADMINISTRATION BUILDING, STATE PATROL POST 90 AND VARIOUS TOLL PLAZAS.

### **OPENING DATE:**

2:00 P M. (E.S T.), JANUARY 9, 2015

SUBMITTED BY:	
COMPANY NAME: WASTE MANAGE MENT OF	Otto INC.
CONTACT NAME: DON DURDELLA	
STREET ADDRESS: 10237 CUTS RD	
CITY AND STATE: CHARDON OH	ZIP: 44024
IELEPHONE NUMBER: 440-796-1447	
FAX NUMBER: 866-750-7094	
EMAIL: DDURDELL @ WM. COM	

#### ATTACHMENTS:

Facilities Map

Published and Copyrighted © 2014 by The Ohio Turnpike and Infrastructure Commission
If you have received these Contract Documents from any entity other than the Ohio Turnpike Commission, you risk the receipt of inaccurate Commission Any unauthorized electronic reproduction of these documents for the purpose of resale or bidding subscription services is expressly

Item	Facility Name	Milepost Location	Box Size (C.Y.)	Qty	Approximate Pickups/Year	Box Rental Fee	Cost per Pickup
1	TP 2	27	4	1	18	Ø	NO PID
2	TP 13	13 5	2	1	6	Ø	No Bid
3	Kunkle M B	16.0	20	1	12	Ø	NO BID
4	TP 25	25.5	2	1	6	Ø	NO BIO
5	TP 34	34.9	2	1	6	Ø	\$ 25.75
6	TP 39	39.8	2	1	6	Ø	b 25 75
7	Swanton M.B.	48.3	30	1	12	Ø	\$ 365-65
8	TP 52	52.6	2	1	6	Ø	\$ 25.75
9	TP 59	59.5	4	1	18	Ø	\$ 25 75
10	TP 64	64 9	4	1	18	Ø	\$ 25.75
11	TP 71	71.7	4	1	18	Ø	\$ 25.75
12	Elmore M.B	79.7	30	1	12	Ø	\$ 334.75
13	TP 81	81 8	2	1	6	Ó	\$ 25.75
14	TP 91	91.6	2	1	6	Ø	\$ 25.5
15	Castalia M B	106 7	30	1	12	Ø	\$ 427.45
16	TP 110	110.2	2	1	18	Ø	\$ 25 75
17	Post 90	118.6	6	1	18	Ó	\$ 57.50
18	TP 135	135 9	2	1	6	Ø	NO BID
19	TP 140	140 6	2	1	6	Ø	No BID
20	Amherst M.B.	141 0	30	1	12	Ø	NO 810
21	TP 142	142.8	2	1	12	Ø	NO RIA
22	TP 145	145.5	2	1	12	Ø.	NO BID \$ 25.75
23	TP 151	151 8	2	1	12	Ø	\$ 25 75

Item	Facility Name	Milepost Location	Box Size (C.Y.)	Qty.	Approximate Pickups/Year	Box Rental Fee	Cost per Pickup
24	TP 152	152.2	2	1	6	Ø	\$ 25 75
25	Berea	159.4	6	2	36	Ø	\$ 51.50(25:
26	TP 161	161.8	2	1	18	Ø	\$ 25.75
27	TP 173	173.2	2	1	18	Ø	\$ 25.75
28	Boston M.B	173.9	40	1	12	Ø	\$ 432 60
29	TP 180	180 3	2	1	18	Ø.	\$ 25.75
30	TP 187	187 2	2	1	18	Ø	\$ 25.75
31	TP 193	193.9	2	1	6	Ø	\$ 25.75
32	Hiram M B	198.6	40	1	12	Ø	\$ 499.55
33	TP 209	209 2	2	1	18	Ø	\$ 25.75
34	TP 215	215 0	2	1	18	Ø	\$ 25 35
35	TP 216	216 4	2	1	6	Ø	\$ 25.75
36	TP 218	218 7	2	1	18	Ø	\$ 25.75
37	Canfield M.B.	228.1	40	1	12	Ø	\$ 31500
38	TP 232	232 9	2	1	18	Ø	\$ 25 75
39	TP 234	234 1	2	1	6	Ø	\$ 25.75
40	TP 239	239 1	2	1	18	$\varnothing$	\$ 25.75

Item	Facility Name	Milepost Location	Box Size (C.Y.)	Qty.	Approximate Pickups/Year	Box Rental Fee	Cost per Pickup
41	Elmore Recycle	79 7	6	1	12	Ø	\$ 30.90
42	Ad Bldg Recycle	159 4	6	2	18	Ø	\$ 51 5/25
43	Hiram Recycle	198 6	6	1	12	Ø	\$ 41.20

TIRE DEBRIS MATERIALS							
Item	Facility Name	Milepost Location	Box Size (C.Y.)	Qty.	Approximate Pickups/Year	Box Rental Fee	Cost per Pickup
44	Kunkle Tire Debris	48 3	12	1	6	Ø	NO BID
45	Swanton Tire Debris	78 7	12	1	6	Ø	\$ 870.35 HAVE
46	Elmore Tire Debris	79.7	12	1	6	Ø	\$ 648.90 HAUL \$ 97.80 OVE 17
47	Castalia Tire Debris	106.7	12	1	6	Ø	\$ 648.90 HAUL
48	Amherst Tire Debris	141.0	12	1	6	Ø	NO BID
49	Boston Tire Debris	173 9	12	1	6	Ø	\$ 381.10 HAUL \$ 97.80 OVE
50	Hiram Tire Debris	198 6	12	1	6	Ø	\$ 265. 75 HAVE
51	Canfield Tire Debris	228 1	12	1	6	Ø	\$ 97.80 NOPER \$ 200 00 HAUL \$ 97.80 POLTO

Above prices shall be net thirty (30) days after removal and disposal of the trash, recyclables & tire debris covered by the Contract and receipt of invoice for same. Any term discount for payment within twenty (20) days after delivery, acceptance and receipt of invoice shall be as follows:

"Discount Terms" in the Additional Terms, see page 4.)

The materials as specified are to be removed during a regular week work day between the hours of 8:00 A.M. and 3:00 P.M., exclusive of holidays within the time stipulated in the Special Provisions

### PICK UP LOCATION

Locations are as identified in the schedule and as further detailed in the attached Facility List