OHIO TURNPIKE AND INFRASTRUCTURE COMMISSION
682 PROSPECT STREET
BEREA, OHIO 44017
PROCUREMENT SECTION

INVITATION NUMBER 4361

FOR FURNISHING
LAWN CARE SERVICES AT FOURTEEN (14) OHIO TURNPIKE SERVICE PLAZAS

OPENING DATE - FEBRUARY 13, 2020

ITEM1TOTAL ITEM2 TOTAL
BIDDER MOWING FERTILIZATION
Ace Lawn Care, LLC GROUP A NO BID NO BID
2133 CR 181 GROUPB % 21,720.00 $ 610.00
Green Springs, Ohio 44836 GROUPC $  19,050.00 $ 750.00
GROUP D NO BID NO BID
GROUP E NO BID NO BID
GROUP F NO BID NO BID
GROUP G NO BID NO BID
Asturi Landscape Group LLC GROUPA $  45,930.00 $ 500.00
32860 Pin Oak Parkway GROUPB $ 22,080.00 $ 500.00
Avon Lake, Ohio 44012 GROUPC $ 19,890.00 $ 500.00
GROUPD % 13,350.00 $ 500.00
GROUPE $ 8,100.00 $ 500.00
GROUPF % 8,280.00 $ 500.00
GROUP G NO BID $ 500.00
Civil Construction Services, Inc. GROUPA $ 48,801.90 $ 550.00
4262 E. 160th Street GROUPB % 56,040.00 $ 570.00
Cleveland, Ohio 44128 GROUPC $ 49,260.00 $ 562.00
GROUPD % 36,090.00 $ 570.00
GROUPE $ 23,640.00 $ 560.00
GROUPF $ 30,030.00 $ 560.00
GROUPG % 38,040.00 $ 541.00
Clapper & Company GROUP A NO BID NO BID
2751 Wisemill Circle GROUP B NO BID NO BID
Canton, Ohio 44721 GROUP C NO BID NO BID
GROUP D NO BID NO BID
GROUPE $ 8,100.00 $ 280.00
GROUPF $ 8,250.00 $ 270.00
GROUPG % 12,000.00 $ 280.00
Goodwill Industries of NW Ohio, Inc. GROUPA $ 14,250.00 $ 560.00
1120 Madison Avenue GROUPB $ 13,890.00 $ 560.00
Toledo, Ohio 43604 GROUP C NO BID NO BID
GROUP D NO BID NO BID
GROUP E NO BID NO BID
GROUP F NO BID NO BID
GROUP G NO BID NO BID
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OHilson-3 Corporation GROUPA $  54,000.00 NO BID
3311 Idlewood Avenue GROUPB $ 54,000.00 NO BID
Youngstown, Ohio 44511 GROUPC $  54,000.00 NO BID
GROUPD 3 54,000.00 NO BID
GROUPE $ 54,000.00 NO BID
GROUPF 3 54,000.00 NO BID
GROUPG $ 54,000.00 NO BID
Rock Solid Landscape GROUPA $  14,250.00 $ 292.70
13211 CRJ GROUPB $ 13,850.10 $ 328.50
Wauseon, Ohio 43567 GROUP C NO BID NO BID
GROUP D NO BID NO BID
GROUP E NO BID NO BID
GROUP F NO BID NO BID
GROUP G NO BID NO BID
Todd's Enviroscapes, Inc. GROUP A NO BID NO BID
7727 Paris Avenue GROUP B NO BID NO BID
Louisville, Ohio 44641 GROUP C NO BID NO BID
GROUP D NO BID NO BID
GROUPE $ 12,450.00 $ 328.00
GROUPF % 15,270.00 $ 270.00
GROUPG % 19,200.00 $ 324.00
TTR Turf Control, LLC GROUPA $ 13,612.20 $ 270.00
3820 Homestead Road GROUPB $ 13,227.90 $ 270.00
Ravenna, Ohio 44266 GROUPC $ 10,653.00 $ 270.00
GROUPD $ 8,282.40 $ 270.00
GROUPE $ 5,892.30 $ 270.00
GROUPF % 8,271.00 $ 270.00
GROUPG % 10,825.20 $ 270.00
Turfscape, Inc. GROUP A NO BID NO BID
8490 Tower Drive GROUP B NO BID NO BID
Twinsburg, Ohio 44087 GROUP C NO BID NO BID
GROUP D NO BID NO BID
GROUPE $ 8,250.00 $ 270.00
GROUPF % 12,600.00 $ 265.00
GROUP G NO BID NO BID
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