

OHIO TURNPIKE AND INFRASTRUCTURE COMMISSION
682 PROSPECT STREET
BEREA, OHIO 44017
PROCUREMENT SECTION

BID INVITATION NO. 4387

JANITORIAL SERVICES AT EIGHT (8) OHIO TURNPIKE AND INFRASTRUCTURE COMMISSION MAINTENANCE BUILDINGS

OPENING DATE: MARCH 4, 2021

<u>BIDDER</u>	ITEM 1 PER VISIT <u>KUNKLE</u>	ITEM 2 PER VISIT <u>SWANTON</u>	ITEM 3 PER VISIT <u>ELMORE</u>	ITEM 4 PER VISIT <u>CASTALIA</u>	ITEM 5 PER VISIT <u>AMHERST</u>	ITEM 6 PER VISIT <u>BOSTON</u>	ITEM 7 PER VISIT <u>HIRAM</u>	ITEM 8 PER VISIT <u>CANFIELD</u>	TOTAL PER VISIT/ PER LOCATION
Any Domestic Work Inc. dba/ A.D.W. Inc. 5735 Pearl Road Parma, Ohio 44129	\$ 54.00	NO BID	\$ 75.00	\$ 54.00	\$ 54.00	\$ 54.00	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 291.00
American Maintenance Services, Inc. 20 Federal Place, Suite 203 Youngstown, Ohio 44503	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 98.00	\$ 80.00	\$ 98.00	\$ 80.00	\$ 356.00
AP Cleaning Company, LLC dba/ Alpha Omega Cleaning Co. 8568 Catarina Place Poland, Ohio 44514	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 60.00	\$ 60.00	\$ 60.00	\$ 60.00	\$ 240.00
Environment Control of Beachwood, Inc. 897 E. Aurora Road Twinsburg, Ohio 44087	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 132.00	\$ 120.00	\$ 182.00	\$ 120.00	\$ 554.00
J & R Property Management Group, LLc P.O. Box 21153 South Euclid, Ohio 44121	\$ 350.00	\$ 350.00	\$ 350.00	\$ 350.00	\$ 350.00	\$ 350.00	\$ 350.00	\$ 350.00	\$ 2,800.00

OHIO TURNPIKE AND INFRASTRUCTURE COMMISSION
 682 PROSPECT STREET
 BEREA, OHIO 44017
 PROCUREMENT SECTION

BID INVITATION NO. 4387

JANITORIAL SERVICES AT EIGHT (8) OHIO TURNPIKE AND INFRASTRUCTURE COMMISSION MAINTENANCE BUILDINGS

OPENING DATE: MARCH 4, 2021

<u>BIDDER</u>	ITEM 1 PER VISIT <u>KUNKLE</u>	ITEM 2 PER VISIT <u>SWANTON</u>	ITEM 3 PER VISIT <u>ELMORE</u>	ITEM 4 PER VISIT <u>CASTALIA</u>	ITEM 5 PER VISIT <u>AMHERST</u>	ITEM 6 PER VISIT <u>BOSTON</u>	ITEM 7 PER VISIT <u>HIRAM</u>	ITEM 8 PER VISIT <u>CANFIELD</u>	TOTAL PER VISIT/ PER LOCATION
King General Cleaning P.O. Box 6355 Youngstown, Ohio 44501	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 122.00	NO BID	\$ 119.00	\$ 118.00	\$ 359.00
Quality Cleaning Service of NW Ohio 861 N. Fulton Street Wauseon, Ohio 43567	\$ 87.50	\$ 75.50	\$ 113.50	\$ 91.25	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 367.75
Shining Company LLC 3739 Wynds Drive Columbus, Ohio 43232	\$ 90.00	\$ 90.00	\$ 90.00	\$ 90.00	\$ 90.00	\$ 90.00	\$ 90.00	\$ 90.00	\$ 720.00
VPL Solutions 211 2nd St. N.W. Barberton, Ohio 44203	\$ 95.00	\$ 95.00	\$ 95.00	\$ 95.00	\$ 100.00	\$ 100.00	\$ 100.00	\$ 100.00	\$ 780.00