BID INVITATION NO. 4388

FOR FURNISHING
ENGINE AND EQUIPMENT OILS AND LUBRICANTS

OPENING DATE: 2:00 P.M. (EASTERN TIME), JUNE 4, 2021

**Bid Invitation No. 4388 Awarded to Englefield Oil Company**

GROUP I: BULK OIL

ITEM OTIC EST.

No. PART NO. ITEM DESCRIPTION QTY.
1 90120  5W-20 Syn. Engine Oil 1,650
2 90148 15W-40 Diesel Engine Oil 5,000
3 90156  AW32 Hydraulic Fluid 2,700
4 90679  AutomaticTransmission Fluid 800

TOTAL BID GROUP |

GROUP II: PACKAGED OIL, LUBRICANTS, ETC.

ITEM OoTIC EST.
No. PART NO. ITEM DESCRIPTION QTy.
| 90184 15W-40 Natural Gas Engine Oil (5-Gallon 150
Bucket)
) 90114 15W-40 Natural Gas Engine Oil (55-Gallon 20
Drum)

3 90655 AW46 Hydraulic Fluid (5-Gallon Bucket) 80

4 90115  AW46 Hydraulic Fluid (55-Gallon Drum) 550
5 90185  Heat Transfer Oil (55-Gallon Drum) 440
6 90600  Sullair Compressor Hyd. Fluid 40

7 71670  Universal Hydraulic Fluid 60

8 90157  CAT 10W Hydraulic Fluid 200
9 90158  CAT 30W Hydraulic Fluid 100
10 90682  80W-140 Syn. Gear Oil 256
11 90121  0W-40 Syn. Engine Oil 100
12 90450  Truck Coolant 310
13 90446  Dex-Cool Coolant 40

14 90441 Multi Vehicle Coolant 150
15 90858 00 Central Lube System Grease 240
16 90853  No. 2 Multi-Purpose Grease 240
17 90852  No. 2 Multi-Purpose Grease 360

TOTAL BID GROUP Il

UNIT

Quart

Gallon

Gallon
Gallon
Gallon
Gallon
Gallon
Gallon
Gallon
Gallon
Quart
Gallon
Gallon
Gallon
LBS

LBS
Cartridges

Englefield Oil Company
447 James Parkway
Heath, Ohio 43056

MAKE AND MODEL

Driver One
Driver One
Driver One
Driver One

MAKE AND MODEL

Shell Mysella

Shell Mysella
Driver One
Driver One

Shell Heat Transfer
Corena
Driver One
Driver One
Driver One
Driver One
Pennzoil Platinum
Rotella Ultra
Shell Dex-Cool
Shell Multi-Vehicle
Gadus S2 V220 00
Gadus S3 V220C 2
Gadus S3 vV220C 2

O P h P

&

@ P PH P

P P P DA AD AL

UNIT  EXTENDED
PRICE TOTAL
205 $ 3,177.50
183 $ 9,150.00
141 $ 3,807.00
220 $ 1,760.00
$ 17,894.50
UNIT  EXTENDED
PRICE TOTAL
520 $  780.00
18.32 $  4,030.40
6.35 $  508.00
535 § 2,942.50
17.98 § 7,911.20
31.93 § 1,277.20
857 $  514.20
3.04 $  608.00
351 $  351.00
629 $ 1,610.24
633 $  633.00
784 $ 243040
6.60 $  264.00
181 $§ 27150
297 $ 71280
315 $§  756.00
322 $ 1,159.20
$ 26,759.64

Rowleys Wholesale
3600 Wilder Road
Bay City, MI 48706

MAKE AND MODEL

Service Pro
Purus

Purus
Wolfs Head

MAKE AND MODEL

NO BID

NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

©hHh PP

UNIT
PRICE

UNIT
PRICE

2.60
2.62

2.20
4.55

©hH P PP

N P P PP DN P DLD AP

EXTENDED
TOTAL

4,030.00
13,100.00

5,940.00
3,640.00

26,710.00

EXTENDED
TOTAL



BID INVITATION NO. 4388

FOR FURNISHING

ENGINE AND EQUIPMENT OILS AND LUBRICANTS

OPENING DATE: 2:00 P.M. (EASTERN TIME), JUNE 4, 2021

**Bid Invitation No. 4388 Awarded to Englefield Oil Company**

ITEM OoTIC

No.

A wN -

PART NO.

GROUP I: BULK OIL

ITEM DESCRIPTION

EST.
QTY.

GROUP llI: MISCELLANEOUS ENGINE OIL, LUBRICANTS, ETC.

90192
90920
90106
90108
90910

PRICE LIST MANUFACTURER:
PRICE LIST TITLE:
PRICE LIST EFFECTIVE DATE:
PRICE LIST DISCOUNT OFFERED (+/-):

Diesel Fuel Conditioner
Brake Parts Cleaner
Carb Cleaner

Starting Fluid
Multi-Purpose Lubricant

100
374
48
48
300

TOTAL BID GROUP Il

Gallon
Each
Each
Each
Each

Driver One, Shell, Johnsens, Diesel Guard

Master List
6/14/2021
6% over cost

Englefield Oil Company
447 James Parkway
Heath, Ohio 43056

MAKE AND MODEL

Diesel Supreme
Johnsens
Johnsens
Johnsens
Johnsens

6P D APA L

UNIT EXTENDED
PRICE TOTAL
19.88 § 1,988.00
1.92 § 718.08
169 § 81.12
169 § 81.12
165 $ 495.00
$ 3,363.32

Rowleys Wholesale
3600 Wilder Road
Bay City, MI 48706

MAKE AND MODEL

NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

UNIT EXTENDED
PRICE TOTAL

PP AP PP
1

$ -

NOT LISTED
NOT LISTED
NOT LISTED
NOT LISTED



BID INVITATION NO. 4388
FOR FURNISHING
ENGINE AND EQUIPMENT OILS AND LUBRICANTS
|
OPENING DATE: 2:00 P.M. (EASTERN TIME), JUNE 4, 2021
Shrader Tire & Oil, Inc.
2045 Sylvania Avenue
Toledo, Ohio 43613
GROUP I: BULK OIL
ITEM OTIC EST. UNIT EXTENDED
No. PART NO. ITEM DESCRIPTION QTY. UNIT MAKE AND MODEL PRICE TOTAL
1 90120 | 5W-20 Syn. Engine Oil 1,550 Quarts HAV PRO DS $ 6.49 | $ 10,059.50
2 90148 | 15W-40 Diesel Engine Oil 5,000 Quarts Chevron Delo SDE $ 495 | $ 24,750.00
3 90156  AW32 Hydraulic Fluid 2,700 Quarts Chevron Rando HDZ $ 458 | $ 12,366.00
4 90679 | AutomaticTransmission Fluid 800 Quarts NO BID -
TOTAL BID GROUP | $ 47,175.50
GROUP II: PACKAGED OIL, LUBRICANTS, ETC.
ITEM OTIC EST. UNIT EXTENDED
No. PART NO. ITEM DESCRIPTION QTY. UNIT MAKE AND MODEL PRICE TOTAL
15W-40 Natural Gas Engine Oil (5-Gallon
1 184 1
0184 b eket) 30 Quart CHV HDAX 5200 $ 433|$  649.50
15W-40 Natural Gas Engine Oil (55-Gallon
2 2014 prum) 220 Gallon CHV HDAX 5200 $ 1848 $ 406560
3 90655 | AW46 Hydraulic Fluid (5-Gallon Bucket) 80 Gallon Chevron Rando HD $ 1240 % 992.00
4 90115 AW46 Hydraulic Fluid (55-Gallon Drum) 550 Gallon Chevron Rando HD $ 1164 | $ 6,402.00
5 90185  Heat Transfer Oil (55-Gallon Drum) 440 Gallon CHV RegalR& O $ 18.05|% 7,942.00
6 90600 Sullair Compressor Hyd. Fluid 40 Gallon Chevron Rando HDZ 46 $ 1844 | $ 737.60
7 71670 | Universal Hydraulic Fluid 60 Gallon Chevron THF 1000 $ 1373 % 823.80
8 90157 |CAT 10W Hydraulic Fluid 200 Gallon Chevron Delo Torgforce 10 | $ 1282 | $§ 2,564.00
9 90158 CAT 30W Hydraulic Fluid 100 Gallon Chevron Delo Torgforce 30 | $ 12.82 | $ 1,282.00
10 90682  |80W-140 Syn. Gear Oil 256 Gallon Chevron Delo Syn Gear XDV, $ 533 | % 1,364.48
11 90121  |0W-40 Syn. Engine Oil 100 Quart NO BID $ -
12 90450 | Truck Coolant 310 Gallon NO BID $ -
13 90446  Dex-Cool Coolant 40 Gallon Havoline EXT Life $ 919§ 367.60
14 90441 | Multi Vehicle Coolant 150 Gallon Havoline Univ A/F Cool. $ 9.70 | $ 1,455.00
15 90858 00 Central Lube System Grease 240 LBS Chevron Multifak EP00 $ 28793 688.80
16 90853 No. 2 Multi-Purpose Grease 240 LBS Shell Gadus S3Vv220C2 | $ 345 | $ 828.00
17 90852  |No. 2 Multi-Purpose Grease 360 Cartridges Shell Gadus S3Vv220C2 | $ 3.75 % 1,350.00
TOTAL BID GROUP i $ 31,512.38




BID INVITATION NO. 4388

FOR FURNISHING

ENGINE AND EQUIPMENT OILS AND LUBRICANTS

OPENING DATE: 2:00 P.M. (EASTERN TIME), JUNE 4, 2021
Shrader Tire & Oil, Inc.
2045 Sylvania Avenue
Toledo, Ohio 43613
GROUP I: BULK OIL
ITEM OTIC EST. UNIT EXTENDED
No. PART NO. ITEM DESCRIPTION QTY. UNIT MAKE AND MODEL PRICE TOTAL
GROUP lll: MISCELLANEOUS ENGINE OIL, LUBRICANTS, ETC.
1 90192 | Diesel Fuel Conditioner 100 Gallon Power Diesel Fuel Suppleme| $ 9.24 | $ 924.00
2 90920 |Brake Parts Cleaner 374 Each CRC Brakeleen $ 253 1% 946.22
3 90106  Carb Cleaner 48 Each Gumout Carb/chock cleaner | $ 277 | $ 132.96
4 90108  Starting Fluid 48 Each Pyroil Starting Fluid $ 149 | § 71.52
5 90910  Multi-Purpose Lubricant 300 Each CRC Multi-Purpose Lube $ 284 | $ 852.00
TOTAL BID GROUP Il $ 2,926.70
\ \
PRICE LIST MANUFACTURER: Chevron

PRICE LIST TITLE:

Shader Tire & Qil

PRICE LIST EFFECTIVE DATE:

Not Listed

PRICE LIST DISCOUNT OFFERED (+/-):

Not Listed
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