
OHIO TURNPIKE AND INFRASTRUCTURE COMMISSION
682 PROSPECT STREET

BEREA, OHIO 44017
PROCUREMENT SECTION  

BID INVITATION NO. 4444
PAVEMENT SWEEPING SERVICE

 

GROUP I GROUP I GROUP I GROUP I
BIDDER ITEM 1 RATES ITEM 2 RATES ITEM 3 RATES ITEM 4 RATES TERMS

Perfect Sweep Inc. Hourly - 140.00$         Hourly - 140.00$         Hourly - 140.00$         Hourly - 140.00$         1%
1202 Expressway Dr. South Daily - 925.00$         Daily - 925.00$         Daily - 925.00$         Daily - 925.00$         
Toledo, Ohio 43608 Weekly - 4,500.00$      Weekly - 4,500.00$      Weekly - 4,500.00$      Weekly - 4,500.00$      

Monthly - 17,500.00$    Monthly - 17,500.00$    Monthly - 17,500.00$    Monthly - 17,500.00$    

GROUP II GROUP II GROUP II GROUP II
ITEM 1 RATES ITEM 2 RATES ITEM 3 RATES ITEM 4 RATES

Hourly - 140.00$         Hourly - 140.00$         Hourly - 140.00$         Hourly - 140.00$         
Daily - 900.00$         Daily - 900.00$         Daily - 900.00$         Daily - 900.00$         
Weekly - 4,500.00$      Weekly - 4,500.00$      Weekly - 4,500.00$      Weekly - 4,500.00$      
Monthly - 17,500.00$    Monthly - 17,500.00$    Monthly - 17,500.00$    Monthly - 17,500.00$    

GROUP I GROUP I GROUP I GROUP I
BIDDER ITEM 1 RATES ITEM 2 RATES ITEM 3 RATES ITEM 4 RATES TERMS

SCA of OH, LLC Hourly - 138.50$         Hourly - 138.50$         Hourly - 138.50$         Hourly - 138.50$         Net
4141 Rockside Road, Suite 100 Daily - 1,108.00$      Daily - 1,108.00$      Daily - 1,108.00$      Daily - 1,108.00$      
Seven Hills, Ohio 44131 Weekly - 5,540.00$      Weekly - 5,540.00$      Weekly - 5,540.00$      Weekly - 5,540.00$      

Monthly - 22,160.00$    Monthly - 22,160.00$    Monthly - 22,160.00$    Monthly - 22,160.00$    

GROUP II GROUP II GROUP II GROUP II
ITEM 1 RATES ITEM 2 RATES ITEM 3 RATES ITEM 4 RATES

Hourly - 138.50$         Hourly - 138.50$         Hourly - 138.50$         Hourly - 138.50$         
Daily - 1,108.00$      Daily - 1,108.00$      Daily - 1,108.00$      Daily - 1,108.00$      
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Weekly - 5,540.00$      Weekly - 5,540.00$      Weekly - 5,540.00$      Weekly - 5,540.00$      
Monthly - 22,160.00$    Monthly - 22,160.00$    Monthly - 22,160.00$    Monthly - 22,160.00$    

GROUP I GROUP I GROUP I GROUP I
BIDDER ITEM 1 RATES ITEM 2 RATES ITEM 3 RATES ITEM 4 RATES TERMS

Everbrite Inc. Hourly - no bid Hourly - no bid Hourly - no bid Hourly - no bid Net
12456 Mahoning Ave. Daily - no bid Daily - no bid Daily - no bid Daily - no bid 
North Jackson,Ohio 44451 Weekly - no bid Weekly - no bid Weekly - no bid Weekly - no bid 

Monthly - no bid Monthly - no bid Monthly - no bid Monthly - no bid 

GROUP II GROUP II GROUP II GROUP II
ITEM 1 RATES ITEM 2 RATES ITEM 3 RATES ITEM 4 RATES

Hourly - 170.00$         Hourly - 170.00$         Hourly - 170.00$         Hourly - 170.00$         
Daily - 1,200.00$      Daily - 1,200.00$      Daily - 1,200.00$      Daily - 1,200.00$      
Weekly - 5,800.00$      Weekly - 5,800.00$      Weekly - 5,800.00$      Weekly - 5,800.00$      
Monthly - 22,400.00$    Monthly - 22,400.00$    Monthly - 22,400.00$    Monthly - 22,400.00$    

GROUP I GROUP I GROUP I GROUP I
BIDDER ITEM 1 RATES ITEM 2 RATES ITEM 3 RATES ITEM 4 RATES TERMS

His Way Investments LLC Hourly - 326.00$         Hourly - 298.00$         Hourly - 270.00$         Hourly - 241.00$         Net
42208 Albrecht Rd. Suite #1 Daily - 2,608.00$      Daily - 2,384.00$      Daily - 2,160.00$      Daily - 1,928.00$      
Elyria, Ohio 44035 Weekly - 13,040.00$    Weekly - 11,920.00$    Weekly - 10,800.00$    Weekly - 9,640.00$      

Monthly - 52,160.00$    Monthly - 47,680.00$    Monthly - 43,200.00$    Monthly - 38,560.00$    

GROUP II GROUP II GROUP II GROUP II
ITEM 1 RATES ITEM 2 RATES ITEM 3 RATES ITEM 4 RATES

Hourly - 135.00$         Hourly - 153.00$         Hourly - 171.00$         Hourly - 189.00$         
Daily - 1,080.00$      Daily - 1,224.00$      Daily - 1,368.00$      Daily - 1,512.00$      
Weekly - 5,400.00$      Weekly - 6,120.00$      Weekly - 6,840.00$      Weekly - 7,560.00$      
Monthly - 21,600.00$    Monthly - 24,480.00$    Monthly - 27,360.00$    Monthly - 30,240.00$    
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