

OHIO TURNPIKE AND INFRASTRUCTURE COMMISSION
682 PROSPECT STREET
BEREA, OHIO 44017
PROCUREMENT SECTION

BID INVITATION NO. 4483

JANITORIAL SERVICES AT EIGHT (8) OHIO TURNPIKE AND INFRASTRUCTURE COMMISSION MAINTENANCE BUILDINGS

OPENING DATE: JULY 17, 2025

<u>BIDDER</u>	ITEM 1 PER VISIT <u>KUNKLE</u>	ITEM 2 PER VISIT <u>SWANTON</u>	ITEM 3 PER VISIT <u>ELMORE</u>	ITEM 4 PER VISIT <u>CASTALIA</u>	ITEM 5 PER VISIT <u>AMHERST</u>	ITEM 6 PER VISIT <u>BOSTON</u>	ITEM 7 PER VIST <u>HIRAM</u>	ITEM 8 PER VISIT <u>CANFIELD</u>	TOTAL PER VISIT/ <u>PER LOCATION</u>	TERMS
Any Domestic Work, Inc. 6683 State Road Parma, Ohio 44134	\$74.00	\$74.00	\$90.00	\$74.00	\$74.00	\$74.00	\$90.00	\$74.00	\$624.00	N/A
Commercial Cleaning Enterprises, Inc. P.O. Box 37 Ontario, Ohio 44862	\$1,219.70	\$1,219.70	\$2,588.35	\$1,219.70	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$6,247.45	Net
King General Cleaning 3343 Ridgeway St. Pittsburgh, PA 15213	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$91.00	\$96.00	\$85.00	\$272.00	Net
Quality Cleaning Service of Northwest Ohio 861 N Fulton St. Wauseon, Ohio 43567	\$54.00	\$54.00	\$81.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$189.00	Net
Rowser and Son's Lawn Maintenance LLC 1719 W. 20th St. Lorain, Ohio 44052	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$50.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$50.00	Net

BID INVITATION NO. 4483 AWARDED TO ANY DOMESTIC WORK INC. ITEMS 4 & 6-8
BID INVITATION NO. 4483 AWARDED TO QUALITY CLEANING OF NORTHWEST OHIO ITEMS 1-3
BID INVITATION NO. 4483 AWARDED TO ROWSER AND SON'S LAWN MAINTENANCE LLC ITEM 5