
 

BID INVITATION NO. 4485

FOR FURNISHING
ENGINE AND EQUIPMENT OILS AND LUBRICANTS

OPENING DATE:  2:00 P.M. (EASTERN TIME), SEPTEMBER 18, 2025

Englefield Oil Company
1935 James Parkway
Heath, Ohio 43056

ITEM OTIC EST. UNIT EXTENDED
No. PART NO. ITEM DESCRIPTION QTY. UNIT MAKE AND MODEL PRICE TOTAL

1 90150 5W-30 Syn. Engine Oil 800 Quarts D1 Syn 5W30 Dexos 2.99$        2,392.00$      
2 90148 15W-40 Diesel Engine Oil 5,000 Quarts D1 HD 15W40 2.39$        11,950.00$    
3 90156 AW32 Hydraulic Fluid 3,000 Quarts D1 AW 32 1.69$        5,070.00$      
4 90679 AutomaticTransmission Fluid 800 Quarts D1 MV ATF 3.24$        2,592.00$      

22,004.00$    

ITEM OTIC EST. UNIT EXTENDED
No. PART NO. ITEM DESCRIPTION QTY. UNIT MAKE AND MODEL PRICE TOTAL

1 90184 15W-40 Natural Gas Engine Oil (55-Gallon 
Drum) 1100 Quart

Shell Mysella S5 N 1540 6.01$        6,611.00$      
2 90655 AW46 Hydraulic Fluid (5-Gallon Bucket) 40 Gallon D1 AW 46 9.00$        360.00$         
3 90115 AW46 Hydraulic Fluid (55-Gallon Drum) 220 Gallon D1 AW 46 8.53$        1,876.60$      
4 90185 Heat Transfer Oil (55-Gallon Drum) 440 Gallon Heat Transfer Oil 14.20$      6,248.00$      
5 90600 Sullair Compressor Hyd. Fluid 40 Gallon Corena S2 R46 43.65$      1,746.00$      
6 71670 Universal Hydraulic Fluid 40 Gallon D1 Tractor Hydraulic 10.89$      435.60$         
7 90157 CAT 10W Hydraulic Fluid 240 Quart D1 10 Wt 4.04$        969.60$         
8 90158 CAT 30W Hydraulic Fluid 50 Quart D1 30 Wt 4.27$        213.50$         
9 90682 80W-140 Syn. Gear Oil 120 Quart Shell Spirax S6 80W140 13.50$      1,620.00$      
10 90121 0W-40 Syn. Engine Oil 120 Quart Pennzoil Ultra Platinum 0W40 6.89$        826.80$         
11 90450 Truck Coolant 260 Gallon Rotella ELC NF 5050 9.43$        2,451.80$      
12 90446 Dex-Cool Coolant 20 Gallon Shell Dex-Cool AF 5050 8.18$        163.60$         
13 90441 Multi Vehicle Coolant 40 Quart Shell Multi-Vehicle AF 5050 8.36$        334.40$         
14 90858 00 Central Lube System Grease 840 LBS Shell Gadus S2 V220 00 4.82$        4,048.80$      
15 90852 No. 2 Multi-Purpose Grease 400 Cartridges Shell Gadus S3 V220 C2 5.35$        2,140.00$      

GROUP I:  BULK OIL

GROUP II:  PACKAGED OIL, LUBRICANTS, ETC.

TOTAL BID GROUP I

1



BID INVITATION NO. 4485

FOR FURNISHING
ENGINE AND EQUIPMENT OILS AND LUBRICANTS

OPENING DATE:  2:00 P.M. (EASTERN TIME), SEPTEMBER 18, 2025

Englefield Oil Company
1935 James Parkway
Heath, Ohio 43056

ITEM OTIC EST. UNIT EXTENDED
No. PART NO. ITEM DESCRIPTION QTY. UNIT MAKE AND MODEL PRICE TOTAL

GROUP I:  BULK OIL

30,045.70$    

1 90192 Diesel Fuel Conditioner 100 Gallon Diesel Supreme Plus Winter 38.75$      3,875.00$      
2 90920 Brake Parts Cleaner 400 Each Johnsons Non Chlor Brake 3.29$        1,316.00$      
3 90106 Carb Cleaner 24 Each Johnsons Carb Cleaner 3.29$        78.96$           
4 90108 Starting Fluid 24 Each Johnsons Starting Fluid 2.99$        71.76$           
5 90910 Multi-Purpose Lubricant 200 Each Johnsons Penetrating Fluid 2.99$        598.00$         

5,939.72$      

TERMS - NET

PRICE LIST TITLE:  ------------------------------------------------------------------
PRICE LIST EFFECTIVE DATE:  -------------------------------------------------

Not Listed

Not Listed
6% Over Cost 

Not Listed

PRICE LIST DISCOUNT OFFERED (+/-):  -------------------------------------

TOTAL BID GROUP II

PRICE LIST MANUFACTURER:    ------------------------------------------------

GROUP III: MISCELLANEOUS ENGINE OIL, LUBRICANTS, ETC.

TOTAL BID GROUP III
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BID INVITATION NO. 4485

FOR FURNISHING
ENGINE AND EQUIPMENT OILS AND LUBRICANTS

OPENING DATE:  2:00 P.M. (EASTERN TIME), AUGUST 18, 2025

Safety-Kleen Systems, Inc.
42 Longwater Drive
Norwell, MA 02061

ITEM OTIC EST. UNIT EXTENDED
No. PART NO. ITEM DESCRIPTION QTY. UNIT MAKE AND MODEL PRICE TOTAL

1 90150 5W-30 Syn. Engine Oil 800 Quarts Gallon Performance Plus 7.50$     
2 90148 15W-40 Diesel Engine Oil 5,000 Quarts Gallon Performance Plus 8.75$     
3 90156 AW32 Hydraulic Fluid 3,000 Quarts Gallon Performance Plus 6.80$     
4 90679 AutomaticTransmission Fluid 800 Quarts Gallon Performance Plus 8.75$     

ITEM OTIC EST. UNIT EXTENDED
No. PART NO. ITEM DESCRIPTION QTY. UNIT MAKE AND MODEL PRICE TOTAL

1 90184 15W-40 Natural Gas Engine Oil (55-Gallon 
Drum) 1100 Quart Drum Performance Plus 687.00$     

2 90655 AW46 Hydraulic Fluid (5-Gallon Bucket) 40 Gallon 5-Gallon Pail Performance Plus 41.03$        
3 90115 AW46 Hydraulic Fluid (55-Gallon Drum) 220 Gallon Drum Performance Plus 433.07$     
4 90185 Heat Transfer Oil (55-Gallon Drum) 440 Gallon NO BID 
5 90600 Sullair Compressor Hyd. Fluid 40 Gallon NO BID 
6 71670 Universal Hydraulic Fluid 40 Gallon 9.43$     377.20$    
7 90157 CAT 10W Hydraulic Fluid 240 Quart NO BID 
8 90158 CAT 30W Hydraulic Fluid 50 Quart NO BID 
9 90682 80W-140 Syn. Gear Oil 120 Quart Drum 925.91$     
10 90121 0W-40 Syn. Engine Oil 120 Quart Drum 1,274.09$  
11 90450 Truck Coolant 260 Gallon Drum 375.19$     
12 90446 Dex-Cool Coolant 20 Gallon 4.73$     94.60$   
13 90441 Multi Vehicle Coolant 40 Quart Gallon 4.54$     
14 90858 00 Central Lube System Grease 840 LBS NO BID 

GROUP I:  BULK OIL

TOTAL BID GROUP I

GROUP II:  PACKAGED OIL, LUBRICANTS, ETC.



15 90852 No. 2 Multi-Purpose Grease 400 Cartridges 10 Tubes Performance Plus 45.27$        

1 90192 Diesel Fuel Conditioner 100 Gallon NO BID
2 90920 Brake Parts Cleaner 400 Each NO BID
3 90106 Carb Cleaner 24 Each NO BID
4 90108 Starting Fluid 24 Each NO BID
5 90910 Multi-Purpose Lubricant 200 Each NO BID

TERMS - NET

TOTAL BID GROUP II

PRICE LIST EFFECTIVE DATE:  
PRICE LIST DISCOUNT OFFERED (+/-):  0.1 

GROUP III: MISCELLANEOUS ENGINE OIL, LUBRICANTS, ETC.

TOTAL BID GROUP III

PRICE LIST MANUFACTURER:   Performance Plus 
PRICE LIST TITLE:  N/A

****BID INVITATION NO. 4485 AWARDED TO ENGLEFIELD OIL COMPANY**** 
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