
OHIO TURNPIKE AND INFRASTRUCTURE COMMISSION
682 PROSPECT STREET

BEREA, OHIO 44017
PROCUREMENT SECTION  

BID INVITATION NO. 4489
PAVEMENT SWEEPING SERVICE

 

GROUP I GROUP I GROUP I GROUP I
BIDDER ITEM 1 RATES ITEM 2 RATES ITEM 3 RATES ITEM 4 RATES TERMS

Everbrite, Inc. Hourly - NO BID Hourly - NO BID Hourly - NO BID Hourly - NO BID 2%
12546 Mahoning Ave. P.O. Box 393 Daily - NO BID Daily - NO BID Daily - NO BID Daily - NO BID
North Jackson, Ohio 44451 Weekly - NO BID Weekly - NO BID Weekly - NO BID Weekly - NO BID

Monthly - NO BID Monthly - NO BID Monthly - NO BID Monthly - NO BID

GROUP II GROUP II GROUP II GROUP II
ITEM 1 RATES ITEM 2 RATES ITEM 3 RATES ITEM 4 RATES

Hourly - 165.00$         Hourly - 165.00$         Hourly - 165.00$         Hourly - 165.00$         
Daily - 1,280.00$      Daily - 1,280.00$      Daily - 1,280.00$      Daily - 1,280.00$      
Weekly - 6,200.00$      Weekly - 6,200.00$      Weekly - 6,200.00$      Weekly - 6,200.00$      
Monthly - 24,000.00$    Monthly - 24,000.00$    Monthly - 24,000.00$    Monthly - 24,000.00$    

GROUP I GROUP I GROUP I GROUP I
ITEM 1 RATES ITEM 2 RATES ITEM 3 RATES ITEM 4 RATES TERMS

Perfect Sweep Inc. Hourly - 135.00$         Hourly - 135.00$         Hourly - 135.00$         Hourly - 135.00$         1%
1202 Expressway Dr. South Daily - 880.00$         Daily - 880.00$         Daily - 880.00$         Daily - 880.00$         
Toledo, Ohio 43608 Weekly - 4,250.00$      Weekly - 4,250.00$      Weekly - 4,250.00$      Weekly - 4,250.00$      

Monthly - 17,300.00$    Monthly - 17,300.00$    Monthly - 17,300.00$    Monthly - 17,300.00$    

GROUP II GROUP II GROUP II GROUP II
ITEM 1 RATES ITEM 2 RATES ITEM 3 RATES ITEM 4 RATES

Hourly - 135.00$         Hourly - 135.00$         Hourly - 135.00$         Hourly - 135.00$         
Daily - 880.00$         Daily - 880.00$         Daily - 880.00$         Daily - 880.00$         
Weekly - 4,250.00$      Weekly - 4,250.00$      Weekly - 4,250.00$      Weekly - 4,250.00$      
Monthly - 17,300.00$    Monthly - 17,300.00$    Monthly - 17,300.00$    Monthly - 17,300.00$    

OPENING DATE: NOVEMBER 17, 2025



GROUP I GROUP I GROUP I GROUP I
ITEM 1 RATES ITEM 2 RATES ITEM 3 RATES ITEM 4 RATES TERMS

Reilly Sweeping LLC Hourly - 180.00$         Hourly - 180.00$         Hourly - 180.00$         Hourly - 180.00$         Net
4141 Rockside Road, Suite 100 Daily - 1,440.00$      Daily - 1,440.00$      Daily - 1,440.00$      Daily - 1,440.00$      
Seven Hills, Ohio 44131 Weekly - 7,200.00$      Weekly - 7,200.00$      Weekly - 7,200.00$      Weekly - 7,200.00$      

Monthly - 28,800.00$    Monthly - 28,800.00$    Monthly - 28,800.00$    Monthly - 28,800.00$    

GROUP II GROUP II GROUP II GROUP II
ITEM 1 RATES ITEM 2 RATES ITEM 3 RATES ITEM 4 RATES

Hourly - 180.00$         Hourly - 180.00$         Hourly - 180.00$         Hourly - 180.00$         
Daily - 1,440.00$      Daily - 1,440.00$      Daily - 1,440.00$      Daily - 1,440.00$      
Weekly - 7,200.00$      Weekly - 7,200.00$      Weekly - 7,200.00$      Weekly - 7,200.00$      
Monthly - 28,800.00$    Monthly - 28,800.00$    Monthly - 28,800.00$    Monthly - 28,800.00$    
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