OHIO TURNPIKE AND INFRASTRUCTURE COMMISSION
682 PROSPECT STREET, BEREA, OHIO 44017
DEPARTMENT OF CONTRACTS ADMINISTRATION
440-234-2081
purchasing(@ohioturnpike.org

BID INVITATION NO.: 4454 - REBID

ISSUED: MAY 1, 2024

FOR FURNISHING
WASTE CONTAINER SERVICE

OPENING DATE: 2:00 PM (EASTERN TIME) on MAY 15, 2024

LOCATION: MICROSOFT TEAMS LINK:

Bid Invitation No. 4454 - REBID - Click to Join

SUBMITTED BY:

COMPANY NAME: _A .\ b /:YZQ_QQ G e P U e
CONTACT NAME:

STREET ADDRESS: 200 ’\‘a.k_-f lor &.ﬁ&g Lep ‘}:

CITY AND STATE: _AcchYenf | o +H— 2P _Y >0
TELEPHONE NUMBER:

EMAIL:




BID SCHEDULE

Scheduled Service
Item OTIC Location - Material _CQ%:_?J’ Service Frequency (fc?rt—;—é——;i%y) % 5 m::t—mgﬁ b
1 Toll Plaza 2 - Trash 4 Cu. Yd. Every Other Week
2 Toll Plaza 4 — Trash (vew PLAZ4) 4 Cu. Yd. Every Other Week | ( , 5 = ] %55"6 ), (p20 .00
3 Toll Plaza 13 - Trash 2 Cu. Yd. Every Other Week | & | < K< 0° ), 068 .00
4 Kunkle M.B. - Recycling 6 Cu. Yd. Every Other Week ( ols] =¥ “ =2 (,02D .20
5 Toll Plaza 25 - Trash 96 Gal. Tote | Every Other Week 9 T & 38 = WU20.0D
6 Toll Plaza 34 — Trash 2 Cu. Yd. Every Other Week &2 B’ Ge° | 08 .60
7 Toll Plaza 39 — Trash 96 Gal. Tote | Every Other Week 9 e 2" U2o.02
8 Swanton M.B. - Recycling 6 Cu. Yd. Every Other Week (op™ =3 8 = < | 620 2©
9 Toll Plaza 49 — Trash (W&l pL4A24) 4 Cu. Yd. Every Other Week
10 Toll Plaza 52 — Trash 2 Cu. Yd. Every Other Week
11 Toll Plaza 59 — Trash 2 Cu. Yd. Every Other Week
12 Toll Plaza 64 — Trash 2 Cu. Yd. Every Other Week
13 Toll Plaza 71 — Trash 2 Cu. Yd. Every Other Week
14 Elmore M.B. — Recycling 6 Cu. Yd. Every Other Week
15 Toll Plaza 81 — Trash 96 Gal. Tote Every Other Week
16 Toll Plaza 91 — Trash 2 Cu. Yd. Every Other Week
17 Castalia M.B. — Recycling 6 Cu. Yd. Every Other Week
18 Toll Plaza 110 — Trash 2 Cu.Yd, | Every Other Week
19 | Toll Plaza 118/Post 90 — Trash 6Cu.Yd. | EveryOther Week
20 Toll Plaza 135 — Trash 96 Gal. Tote 1/Month




BID SCHEDULE

Scheduled Service

Item OTIC Location - Material Cogfi;:_ie_ner Service Frequency (fcf:(rtei;zrtl:rilgtla( gn[y) M?pnethr;ons}'?)te (12 moAr:-‘:rTsu: I'VII::I:W?\: Rate)

21 Toll Plaza 140 — Trash 2 Cu. Yd. 1/Month

22 Ambherst M.B. — Recycling 6 Cu. Yd. Every Other Week
23 Toll Plaza 142 — Trash 2 Cu. Yd, Every Qther Week
24 Toll Plaza 145 — Trash 2 Cu. Yd. Every Other Week
25 Toll Plaza 151 — Trash 2 Cu. Yd. Every Other Week
26 Toll Plaza 152 - Trash 2 Cu. Yd. Every Cther Week
27 Berea — Trash #1 6 Cu. Yd. Every Other Week
28 Berea - Trash #2 & Cu. Yd. Every Other Week
29 Berea - Recycling & Cu. Yd. Every Other Week
30 Toll Plaza 161 — Trash 2 Cu. Yd. Every Other Week
31 Toll Plaza 173 — Trash 2 Cu. Yd. Every Other Week
32 Boston M.B. — Recycling & Cu. Yd. Every Other Week
33 Toll Plaza 180 — Trash 2 Cu. Yd. Every Other Week
34 Toll Plaza 187 — Trash 2 Cu. Yd. Every Other Week
35 Toll Plaza 193 - Trash 2 Cu. Yd. Every Other Week
36 Hiram M.B. — Recycling 6 Cu. Yd. Every Other Week
37 Toll Plaza 209 — Trash 2 Cu. Yd. Every Other Week
38 Toll Plaza 211 — Trash (e prazq) 4 Cu. Yd. Every Other Week
39 Toll Plaza 215 — Trash 96 Gal. Tote | Every Other Week
40 Toll Plaza 216 — Trash 96 Gal. Tote Every Other Week




BID SCHEDULE

Scheduled Service

Lem OTIC Location - Material g_% Service Frequency (ft%%’%rﬁy) % (12 m‘% Rate)
41 Toll Plaza 218 — Trash 2 Cu. Yd. Every Other Week
42 Canfield M.B. — Recycling 6 Cu. Yd. Every Other Week
43 Toll Plaza 232 — Trash 2 Cu. Yd. Every Other Week
44 Toll Plaza 234 — Trash 2 Cu. Yd. Every Other Week
45 Toll Plaza 239 — Trash 2 Cu. Yd. Every Other Week
Scheduled Service Total $6,636.00
(Total of all Scheduled Service Annual Totals) y
On-Call Service
Column 4|  Column B Column C Column D Column £ Column £
Disposal Rate M
Item OTIC Location - Material Current Size _PLC%% Avg. Tons % (per ton ) ____HI(.::rs:;at;e): héaefhzeal?l\:lf:lrtgglagzgsl q
—_ be calculated)
46 Kunkle M.8. - Trash 0CuYd | 12 377 | Zzyee & Je= U94pc®
47 Swanton M.B. - Trash 30 Cu. Yd. 12 Calichn AT & e ed a4 °
48 Elmore M.B. - Trash 30 Cu. Yd. 12 4
49 Castalia M.B. - Trash 30 Cu. Yd. 12 5
50 Ambherst M.B. - Trash 30 Cu. Yd. 12 5
51 Boston M.B. - Trash 40 Cu. Yd. 12 6
52 Hiram M.B. - Trash 40 Cu. Yd. 12 6
53 Canfield M.B. - Trash 40 Cu. Yd. 12 6
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On-Call Service

Column A | Colimn 8 Lolumn C Column O Column £ Column F
. Annual Total*
Item OTIC Location - Material Current Size !?,l:_:;ip_s Avg. Tons ﬂma:“‘rl—;%tl‘)e Dl%%g%m%g ;(“:——:r—ss-jaﬁ—;? héfveshzegvr\:uf;rtgséiaifwga d
be calculated)
54 Kunkle M.B. - Tire Debris 12 Cu. Yd. 8 3
55 Swanteon M.B. - Tire Debris 12 Cu. Yd. 8 3
56 Elmore M.B. - Tire Debris 42 Cu. Yd. 6 8
57 Castalia M.B. - Tire Debris 12 Cu. Yd. 8 4
58 Ambherst M.B. - Tire Debris 12 Cu. Yd. 8 4
59 Boston M.B. - Tire Debris 20 Cu, Yd. 8 5
60 Hiram M.B. - Tire Debris 20 Cu. Yd. 8 5
61 Canfield M.B, - Tire Debris 15 Cu. Yd. 8 4
On-Call Service Total @ $10,164.00
Contract Total (Scheduled + On-Call) | $16,800.00
Notes:

* Annual Total Caleulation for On-Call Sites that do not include disposal of a specified number of tons per haul (e.g. Column C is Not Applicable):
Total Disposal Cost**

(Column A

Total Hauling Cost

x ColumnC) + (Column A

x Column B x Column. D)

6-5

Total Lease Cost

(Est. Pickups x Haul Rate) + (Est.Pickups x Avg.Tons x Disposal Rate} + (Lease Rate x 12 Months) = Est. Annual Total
+ (Column E x 12 Months) = Est. Annual Total (Column F)




* Bids shall contain only firm, net prices void of escalator or other contingent clauses, and shallnot
include any state and/or federal taxes.

Above prices shall be net thirty (30) days after delivery and acceptance of the Items covered by the
Contract and receipt of invoice for the same. Any term discount for payment within twenty days
after delivery and acceptance of the Items covered by the Contract and receipt of invoice shall be as
follows: % of Bid price. (See "Discount Terms" in the Additional
Terms.)




OHIO TURNPIKE AND INFRASTRUCTURE COMMISSION
682 PROSPECT STREET, BEREA, OHIO 44017
DEPARTMENT OF CONTRACTS ADMINISTRATION
440-234-2081

purchasing@ohioturnpike.org
BID INVITATION NO.: 4454 - REBID

ISSUED: MAY 1, 2024

FOR FURNISHING
WASTE CONTAINER SERVICE

OPENING DATE: 2:00 PM (EASTERN TIME) on MAY 15, 2024

LOCATION: MICROSOFT TEAMS LINK:

Bid Invitation No. 4454 - REBID - Click to Join

SUBMITTED BY:

COMPANY NAME: Heitsche TLD Dumpsters, LLC

CONTACT NAME:

STREET ADDRESS: 1422 US 20

CITY AND STATE: _Norwalk, OH ZIP: 44857

TELEPHONE NUMBER:

EMAIL:



BID SCHEDULE

Scheduled Service

Container Service Extra Pickup Monthly Rate Annual Total
Item OTIC Location - Material Size - (for reference only) (per month) (12 months x Monthly
_ Frequency Rate)
1 Toll Plaza 2 - Trash 4 Cu. Yd. Every Other
Week
2 Toll Plaza 4 - Trash (NEw PLAZA)| 4 Cu. Yd. Every Other
Week
3 Toll Plaza 13 - Trash 2 Cu. Yd. Every Other
Week
4 Kunkle M.B. - Recycling 6 Cu. Yd. Every Other
Week
5 Toll Plaza 25 - Trash 96 Gal. Tote | Every Other
Week
6 Toll Plaza 34 - Trash 2 Cu. Yd. Every Other
Week
7 Toll Plaza 39 - Trash 96 Gal. Tote | Every Other
Week
8 Swanton M.B. - Recycling 6 Cu. Yd. Every Other
Week
9 Toll Plaza 49 - Trash (NEW PLAZA) 4 Cu. Yd. Every Other Week
10 Toll Plaza 52 - Trash 2 Cu. Yd. Every Other
Week
11 Toll Plaza 59 - Trash 2 Cu. Yd. Every Other
Week
12 Toll Plaza 64 - Trash 2 Cu. Yd. Every Other
Week
13 Toll Plaza 71 - Trash 2 Cu. Yd. Every Other

Week




14 Elmore M.B. - Recycling 6 Cu. Yd. Every Other
Week
15 Toll Plaza 81 - Trash 96 Gal. Tote | Every Other
Week
16 Toll Plaza 91 - Trash 2 Cu. Yd. Every Other
Week
17 Castalia M.B. - Recycling 6 Cu. Yd. Every Other
Week
18 Toll Plaza 110 - Trash 2 Cu. Yd. Every Other
Week
19 Toll Plaza 118/Post 90 - Trash 6 Cu. Yd. Every Other
Week
20 Toll Plaza 135 - Trash 96 Gal. Tote 1/Month
6-2
BID SCHEDULE
Scheduled Service
Container Service Extra Pickup Monthly Rate Annual Total
Item OTIC Location - Material Size - (for reference only) (per month) (12 months x Monthly
_ Frequency Rate)
21 Toll Plaza 140 - Trash 2 Cu. Yd. 1/Month
22 Amherst M.B. - Recycling 6 Cu. Yd. Every Other
Week
23 Toll Plaza 142 - Trash 2 Cu. Yd. Every Other
Week
24 Toll Plaza 145 - Trash 2 Cu. Yd. Every Other
Week
25 Toll Plaza 151 - Trash 2 Cu. Yd. Every Other
Week
26 Toll Plaza 152 - Trash 2 Cu. Yd. Every Other
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WeekBID SCHEDULE

Week

27 Berea—Frash—#1 6-Cu—Yd- Every-Other

weseheduled Service

28 Berea - Trasi #2 6 CU. Yd. Every Other ;
Container Sdiadke Extra Pickup Monthly Rate Annual Total
—I-tem——Oﬂ-Gl:eeat-len—-—Mateﬂa' Size F— {forreference-only) tpermonth) 12 —months—x—Menthly

29 Berea - Recycling 6 Cu. Yd. |TEQAUERCY Rate)
41 Tol-Plaza-218—Trash 2 cuva— | WK Oher
30 Toll Plaza 161 - Trash 2 Cu. Yd. Wty Other
42 Canfield-M-B—Reeyeling 6-Cu—Yd- g\\l,%e,!;, Other
31 ToII PIaza 173 - Trash 2 Cu. Yd. Wty Other
43 Tol-Plaza 232 — Frash 2 cuvd— | BRES other
32 Boston M.B. - Recycling 6 Cu. Yd. Wreetly Other
44 Toll-Plaza-234—Trash 2 CuYd | PRSS Other
33 Toll Plaza 180 - Trash 2 Cu. Yd. ﬁ}e@y Other
45 JoH-Plaza239—Trash 2-Co—Yd- '\-l\"%% Other
34 Toll Plaza 187 - Trash 2 Cu. Yd. ﬁ}eeﬂy Other

~Sch l-ServiceTotal
35 Toll Plaza 193 - Trash 2 Cu. Yd W .

(¥ota| of, al cheduled Service Annual Totals)

36 Hiram M.B. - Recycling 6 Cu. Yd. Every Other

Week
37 Toll Plaza 209 - Trash 2 Cu. Yd. Every Other

Week
38 Toll Plaza 211 - Trash (NEW 4 Cu. Yd. Every Other

PLAZA) Week

39 Toll Plaza 215 - Trash 96 Gal. Tote | Every Other

Week
40 Toll Plaza 216 - Trash 96 Gal. Tote | Every Other

6-4




On-Call Service

Column Column B Column C Column D Column E Column F
A
Disposal Rate Annual Total*
(per ton) (See below for details on
Item OTIC Location - Material | Current Size PICSTtI.; Avg. Tons % (L;earsr(:]—;at:s how thihaonur}éjal total
be calculated)

46 Kunkle M.B. - Trash 20 Cu. Yd. 12 3 $600 $65.00/Ton  |$50 Rental Fee $10,140
After 30 Days of
No Activity.

47 Swanton M.B. - Trash 30 Cu. Yd. 12 4 $700 $65.00/Ton  |$50 Rental Fee $12,120
After 30 Days of
No Activity.

48 Elmore M.B. - Trash 30 Cu. Yd. 12 4 $700 $65.00/Ton  |$50 Rental Fee $12,120
After 30 Days of
No Activity.

49 Castalia M.B. - Trash 30 Cu. Yd. 12 5 $300 $65.00/Ton  |$50 Rental Fee $8,100
After 30 Days of
No Activity.

50 Ambherst M.B. - Trash 30 Cu. Yd. 12 5 $325 $65.00/Ton  |$50 Rental Fee $8,400
After 30 Days of
No Activity.

51 Boston M.B. - Trash 40 Cu. Yd. 12 6 $700 $65.00/Ton  |$50 Rental Fee $13,680
After 30 Days of
No Activity.

52 Hiram M.B. - Trash 40 Cu. Yd. 12 6 $800 $65.00/Ton  |$50 Rental Fee $14,880
After 30 Days of




No Activity.

53 Canfield M.B. - Trash 40 Cu. Yd. 12 $1000 $65.00/Ton  [$50 Rental Fee $17,280
After 30 Days of
No Activity.
Notes:

*Annual Total Calculation for On-Call Sites that do not include disposal of a specified number of tons per haul (e.g. Column C is Not Applicable):
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On-Call Service

Column | Column B Column C Column D Column E Column F
A
Disposal Rate Annual Total*
(per ton) (See below for details on
Item | OTIC Location - Material | Current Size P;STE s| Avg.Tons —"('pa:rl :aitl;e —'('S:rsri ;:E? how thihaonur:gal total
be calculated)
54 Kunkle M.B. - Tire Debris| 12 Cu. Yd. 8 3 $900 $65.00/Ton  [$75 Rental Fee $9,600
After 30 Days of
No Activity.
55 | Swanton M.B. - Tire 12 Cu. Yd. 8 3 $700 $65.00/Ton  [$75 Rental Fee $8,060
Debris After 30 Days of
No Activity.
56 Elmore M.B. - Tire Debris| 42 Cu. Yd. 6 8 $1,300 $65.00/Ton  |$75 Rental Fee $11,820
After 30 Days of
No Activity.
57 Castglia M.B. - Tire 12 Cu. Yd. 8 4 $500 $65.00/Ton  |$75 Rental Fee $6,980
Debris After 30 Days of
No Activity.
58 | Amherst M.B. - Tire 12 Cu. Yd. 8 4 $525 $65.00/Ton  |$75 Rental Fee $7,180
Debris After 30 Days of
No Activity.
59 Boston M.B. - Tire Debris| 20 Cu. Yd. 8 5 $1,000 $65.00/Ton  [$75 Rental Fee $11,500
After 30 Days of
No Activity.
60 Hiram M.B. - Tire Debris | 20 Cu. Yd. 8 5 $1000 $65.00/Ton  [$75 Rental Fee $11,500
After 30 Days of
No Activity.
61 Canfield M.B. - Tire 15 Cu. Yd. 8 4 $900 $65.00/Ton  [$75 Rental Fee $10,180
Debris After 30 Days of
No Activity.
On-Call Service Total
Contract Total (Scheduled + On-Call) $173,540




Notes:
* Annual Total Calculation for On-Call Sites that do not include disposal of a specified humber of tons per haul (e.g. Column C is Not Applicable):

Total Hauling Cost Total Disposal Cost* * Total Lease Cost
= EEEEEE. AATTTT

EEEEEE. PPPPPPPPPPPP xx HHHH HH RR RR ) + ( EEEEEE. PPPPPPPPPPPP xx AAAAAA. TTTTTT xx DD RRRR) + (LL RR RR xx 12 MM h
(CC CC AA xx CC CC CC) +(CC CC AA xx CC CC BB xx CC CCDD) + (CC CCEE xx 12 MM h ) = EEEEEE. AA TTTT (CC CC FF)
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* Bids shall contain only firm, net prices void of escalator or other contingent clauses, and shall
notinclude any state and/or federal taxes.

Above prices shall be net thirty (30) days after delivery and acceptance of the Items covered by the
Contract and receipt of invoice for the same. Any term discount for payment within twenty days
after delivery and acceptance of the Items covered by the Contract and receipt of invoice shall be as

follows: 0% of Bid price. (See "Discount Terms" in the Additional
Terms.)



OHIO TURNPIKE AND INFRASTRUCTURE COMMISSION
682 PROSPECT STREET, BEREA, OHIO 44017
DEPARTMENT OF CONTRACTS ADMINISTRATION
440-234-2081
purchasing@ohioturnpike.org

BID INVITATION NO.: 4454 - REBID

ISSUED: MAY 1, 2024

FOR FURNISHING
WASTE CONTAINER SERVICE

OPENING DATE: 2:00 PM (EASTERN TIME) on MAY 15, 2024

LOCATION: MICROSOFT TEAMS LINK:

Bid Invitation No. 4454 - REBID - Click to Join

SUBMITTED BY:

COMPANY NAME: _Lm D\S’Q 0S a\ S LYyl (‘A

CONTACT NAME:

STREET ADDRESS: ZOE} SE @‘HMA)\/)& Kd

CITY AND STATE:YOY{ Q\H*Dﬁl Ohid 2. 43452

TELEPHONE NUMBER:

EMAIL;




BID SCHEDULE

Scheduled Service

Item OTIC Location - Material @%2_2_21—“ Service Frequency (f&%y)- %%%g (12 m% Rate
1 Toll Plaza 2 - Trash 4 Cu. Yd. Every Other Week
2 Toll Plaza 4 — Trash (vew pLAZA) 4 Cu. Yd. Every Other Week
3 Toll Plaza 13 - Trash 2 Cu. Yd. Every Other Week
4 Kunkle M.B. - Recycling 6 Cu. Yd. Every Other Week T
5 Toll Plaza 25 — Trash 96 Gal. Tote Every Other Week
6 Toll Plaza 34 — Trash 2 Cu. Yd. Every Other Week
7 Toll Plaza 39 — Trash 96 Gal. Tote Every Other Week
8 Swanton M.B. - Recycling 6 Cu. Yd. Every Other Week
9 Toll Plaza 49 — Trash (Ve PLAZA) 4 Cu. Yd. Every Other Week
10 Toll Plaza 52 — Trash 2 Cu. Yd. Every Other Week
11 Toll Plaza 59 — Trash 2 Cu. Yd. Every Other Week
12 Toll Plaza 64 — Trash 2 Cu. Yd. Every Other Week
13 Toll Plaza 71 — Trash 2 Cu. Yd. Every Other Week
14 Elmore M.B. — Recycling 6 Cu. Yd. Every Other Week
15 Toll Plaza 81 — Trash 96 Gal. Tote Every Other Week
16 Toll Plaza 91 — Trash 20 Y. Every Other Week | ¥ Lla 00 ijs OD ﬂlﬁ(ﬂo 00
17 Castalia M.B. — Recycling 6 Cu. Yd. Every Other Week
18 Toll Plaza 110 — Trash 2€u.Vd. | BEyOteriess | _
19 | Toll Plaza 118/Post 90 - Trash 6Cu. Yd. | EveryOtherweek | P(J() OO0 /00 .00 ?LJ 200 .9¢
20 Toll Plaza 135 — Trash 96 Gal. Tote 1/Month




BID SCHEDULE

Scheduled Service

Item OTIC Location - Material QQH?E_Z—%IQ Service Frequency (f%té%y) M?p—';%r%t—e @m% Rate)

21 Toll Plaza 140 — Trash 2 Cu. Yd. 1/Month

22 Ambherst M.B. — Recycling 6 Cu. Yd. Every Other Week
23 Toll Plaza 142 — Trash 2 Cu. Yd. Every Other Week
24 Toll Plaza 145 — Trash 2 Cu. Yd. Every Other Week
25 Toll Plaza 151 — Trash 2 Cu. Yd. Every Other Week
26 Toll Plaza 152 — Trash 2 Cu. Yd. Every Other Week
27 o Berea — Trash #1 6 Cu. Yd. Every Other Week
28 Berea — Trash #2 6 Cu. Yd. Every Other Week
29 Berea - Recycling 6 Cu. Yd. Every Other Week
30 Toll Plaza 161 — Trash 2 Cu. Yd. Every Other Week
31 Toll Plaza 173 — Trash 2 Cu. Yd. Every Other Week
32 Boston M.B. — Recydling 6 Cu. Yd. Every Other Week
33 Toll Plaza 180 — Trash 2 Cu. Yd. Every Other Week
34 Toll Plaza 187 — Trash 2 Cu. Yd. Every Other Week
35 Toll Plaza 193 — Trash 2 Cu. Yd. Every Other Week
36 Hiram M.B. — Recycling 6 Cu. Yd. Every Other Week
37 Toll Plaza 209 — Trash 2 Cu. Yd. Every Other Week
38 Toll Plaza 211 — Trash (wew PLAZA) 4 Cu. Yd. Every Other Week
39 Toll Plaza 215 — Trash 96 Gal. Tote Every Other Week
40 Toll Plaza 216 — Trash 96 Gal. Tote | Every Other Week




BID SCHEDULE

Scheduled Service

Item OTIC Location - Material Cogner Service Frequency (fsrxrtel;:r::g_( :)’nly) M‘();::ethr;oﬁ%ma)—tg (12 mc?nl::su: :41?;'\?\! Rate)
41 Toll Plaza 218 — Trash 2 Cu. Yd. Every Other Week
42 Canfield M.B. —Recycling | 6Cu.Yd. | Every Other Week
43 Toll Plaza 232 — Trash 2 Cu. Yd. Every Other Week
Toll Plaza 234 — Trash B 2 Cu. Yd. Every Other Week
Toll Plaza 239 - Trash 2 Cu. Yd. Every Other Week
(Total of alfsigziﬂlgjggwsiclerﬁglTrgcgz: $1,860.00
On-Call Service :
Column A Column B Column C Column D Column E Column F
Disposal Rate M
Item OTIC Location - Material Current Size i_:—tg Avg. Tons —l'('::rl :; a;tl;a (per ton) —l('sgf::] :na;;()a hgi;eshze;?qu\]llf;rtg?;?I;i\ggl d
be calculated)
Kunkle M.B. - Trash 20 Cu. Yd. 12 3
Swanton M.B. - Trash 30 Cu. Yd. 12 4 . g
Elmore M.B. - Trash 30CuYd | 12 +  [3200.% [$52.00 -0- 42 0p O
Castalia M.B. - Trash 30 Cu. Yd. 12 5 M OO 00 s 6 2 00 — O - i 55 20 . 00
Ambherst M.B. - Trash 30 Cu. Yd. 12 5 - '
Boston M.B. - Trash 40 Cu. Yd. 12 6
Hiram M.B. - Trash 40 Cu. Yd. 12 6
Canfield M.B. - Trash 40 Cu. Yd. 12 6
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On-Call Service

ColumnA| Column B Column C Column D Column £ Column F
Disposal Rate Annual Total® Total"f
Item OTIC Location - Material Current Size Piﬁgg Avg. Tons —P('::rl :a autl;e (per ton ) l(_::rs ;gnis hc(y\s/ve(tehze;%vr\:uf:lrti?;?lic?unld
be calculated)
54 | Kunkle MB. - Tire Debris | 12Cu.Yd. | 8 3 N /K N B N/ A N/ A
55 | Swanton M.B. - Tire Debris | 12 Cu. Yd. 8 3 N/p ' '
| 56 | EmoreM.B.-TireDebris | 42Cu.Yd. | 6 8 N/
57 Castalia M.B. - Tire Debris 12 Cu. Yd. 8 4 M [A
58 | Amherst M.B. - Tire Debris | 12 Cu. Yd. 8 4 NI
59 Boston M.B. - Tire Debris 20 Cu. Yd. 8 5 N A \
60 Hiram M.B. - Tire Debris 20 Cu. Yd. 8 5 N/ A \
61 | Canfield M.B. - Tire Debris | 15 Cu. Yd. 8 4 N! A N 1 P
On-Call Service Total | $10,416.00
Contract Total (Scheduled + On-Call) | $12,276.00

Notes:
* Annual Total Calculation for On-Call Sites that do not include disposal of a specified number of tons per haul (e.g. Column C is Not Applicable):
Total Hauling Cost Total Disposal Cost** Total Lease Cost
(Est. Pickups x Haul Rate ) + ( Est.Pickups x Avg.Tons x Disposal Rate) + (Lease Rate x 12 Months) = Est. Annual Total
(ColumnA x ColumnC) + (ColumnA  xColumn B x Column D) + (Column E x 12 Months) = Est. Annual Total (Column F)




OHIO TURNPIKE AND INFRASTRUCTURE COMMISSION

682 PROSPECT STREET, BEREA, OHIO 44017
DEPARTMENT OF CONTRACTS ADMINISTRATION
440-234-2081
purchasing(@ohioturnpike.org

BID INVITATION NO.: 4454 - REBID

ISSUED: MAY 1, 2024

FOR FURNISHING
WASTE CONTAINER SERVICE

OPENING DATE: 2:00 PM (EASTERN TIME) on MAY 15, 2024

LOCATION: MICROSOFT TEAMS LINK:

Bid Invitation No. 4454 - REBID - Click to Join

SUBMITTED BY:
COMPANY NAME: OHIO aueY Waste Seqvice, ZMc.

— CONTACT NAME:

STREET ADDRESS: /0 45 'gZuga Y /)at
LYAAY [T

CITY AND STATE: (fow N (forsN . CHIO ZIP: _HYySsc G

TELEPHONE NUMBER:

EMAIL:

BN = = 5 &3

' 2 AEEE

I ZAEREE



FEE F

BID SCHEDULE

’

Scheduled Service,

’

Item OTIC Location - Material ggg.t"g"gm Service Frequency (f%f:_;ﬁy) %rﬁ% (12 m% Rate)
1 Toll Plaza 2 - Trash 4 Cu. Yd. Every Other Week
2 Toll Plaza 4 — Trash (wvewy PL424) 4 Cu. Yd. Every Other Week
3 Toll Plaza 13 - Trash 2 Cu. vd. Every Other Week
4 Kunkle M.B. - Recycling 6 Cu. Yd. Every Other Week
5 Toll Plaza 25 - Trash 96 Gal. Tote Every Other Week
6 Toll Plaza 34 — Trash 2 Cu. Yd. Every Other Week
7 Toll Plaza 39 - Trash 96 Gal. Tote | Every Other Week
8 Swanton M.B. - Recycling 6 Cu. Yd. Every Other Week
9 Toll Plaza 49 — Trash (e p1AZ4) 4 Cu. Yd. Every Other Week
10 Toll Plaza 52 — Trash 2 Cu. Yd. Every Other Week
11 Toll Plaza 59 - Trash 2 Cu. Yd. Every Other Week
12 Toll Plaza 64 — Trash 2 Cu. Yd. Every Other Week
13 Toll Plaza 71 - Trash 2 Cu. Yd. Every Other Week
14 Elmore M.B. — Recycling 6 Cu. Yd. Every Other Week
15 Toll Plaza 81 — Trash 96 Gal. Tote Every Other Week
16 Toll Plaza 91 — Trash 2 Cu. Yd. Every Other Week
17 Castalia M.B. — Recycling 6 Cu. Yd. Every Other Week
18 Toll Plaza 110 - Trash 2Cu.Yd, | EveryOther Week
19 Toll Plaza 118/Post 90 — Trash 6 Cu. Yd. Every Other Week

20 Toll Plaza 135 - Trash 96 Gal. Tote 1/Month

T I EXTJTETT
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BID SCHEDULE

Scheduled Service

fem leemE il wE st Q%ijn_a e (fc%rﬁy) %;ﬁ (12 m% Rate)
21 Toll Plaza 140 — Trash 2 Cu. Yd. 1/Month
22 Amherst M.B. — Recycling 6 Cu. Yd. Every Other Week
23 Toll Plaza 142 — Trash 2 Cu. Yd. Every Other Week
24 Toll Plaza 145 — Trash 2 Cu. Yd. Every Other Week
25 Toll Plaza 151 — Trash 2 Cu. Yd. Every Other Week
26 Toll Plaza 152 - Trash 2 Cu. vd. Every Other Week
27 Berea — Trash #1 6 Cu. Yd. Every Other Week
28 Berea — Trash #2 6 Cu. Yd. Every Other Week
29 Berea - Recycling 6 Cu. Yd. Every Other Week
30 Toll Plaza 161 — Trash 2 Cu. Yd. Every Other Week
31 Toll Plaza 173 — Trash 2 Cu. Yd. Every Other Week
32 Boston M.B. — Recycling 6 Cu. Yd. Every Other Week
33 Toll Plaza 180 — Trash 2 Cu. Yd. Every Other Week
34 Toll Plaza 187 — Trash 2 Cu. Yd. Every Other Week
35 Toll Plaza 193 - Trash 2Cu.Yd. | Every Other Week 58 %@ e nag™
36 Hiram M.B. — Recycling 6 Cu. Yd. Every Other Week j34 °° 9p °< /OO ¢
37 Toll Plaza 209 - Trash 2 Cu. Yd. Every Other Week Eywe o °° 720 o=
38  |Toll Plaza 211 - Trash (wvew 714z4) | 4 Cu. Yd. Every Other Week Q( °° 90 °° [080 °°
39 Toll Plaza 215 — Trash 96 Gal. Tote | Every Other Week | 3 j €€ A5 300 °°
40 Toll Plaza 216 — Trash 96 Gal. Tote | Every Other Week By o= s <° 300 o0
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BID SCHEDULE

Scheduled Service

Item OTIC Location - Material Con;ti;iner Servjce Frequency (f(%ﬁy) %ﬁ%ﬁ 13 mm:\‘;’s—m Rate

41 Toll Plaza 218 — Trash 2 Cu. Yd. Every Other Week 5 oe Lo ea 7 A0 e

42 Canfield M.B. — Recycling 6Cu.Yd. | Every Other Week i34 °° qp = 1080 °¢

43 Toll Plaza 232 - Trash 2 Cu. Yd. Every Other Week ng °° GO °° 30 °°

44 Toll Plaza 234 — Trash 2 Cu. Yd. Every Other Week 58 °° O o 720 °°

45 Toll Plaza 239 — Trash 2 Cu. Yd. Every Other Week 55’ e Lo @o 730

Scheduled Service Total 4 $/60. 00
(Total of all Scheduled Service Annual Totals) '
On-Call Service
Column A | Column B Column C Column D Column £ Column F
- Annual Tetal*
Item OTIC Location - Material Current Size Pi(%gs Avg. Tons T;:rl rlmzaautl)e D_ls(lzﬁrf)ate l(-sears:;gnatr:)2 hé\SNe?hZe;?\‘:uf;)lrtg(teat?isl.iSSId
be calculated)

46 Kunkle M.B. - Trash 20 Cu. Yd. 12 3

47 Swanton M.B. - Trash 30 Cu. Yd. 12 4

48 Elmore M.B. - Trash 30 Cu. Yd. 12 4

49 Castalia M.B. - Trash 30 Cu. Yd. 12 5

50 Ambherst M.B. - Trash 30 Cu. Yd. 12 5

51 Boston M.B. - Trash 40 Cu. Yd. 12 6

52 Hiram M.B. - Trash 40 Cu. Yd. 12 6 320" 60°° Joo 9360 °°

53 Canfield M.B. - Trash 40 Cu. Yd. 12 6 320 °° 6o °* /00 Q760 °°
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On-Call Service

Column A | Column B Column C Column D e f_ Column F
Item OTIC Location - Material Current Size ﬂggﬁpﬁ Avg. Tons %sgﬁﬁ;j (per ton ) - héiefhzemu?ftgg?'slic?& d
be calculated)
54 Kunkle M.B. - Tire Debris 12 Cu. Yd. 8 3
55 Swanton M.B. - Tire Debris 12 Cu. Yd. 8 3
56 Elmore M.B. - Tire Debris 42 Cu. Yd. 6 8
57 Castalia M.B. - Tire Debris 12 Cu. Yd. 8 4
58 Amherst M.B. - Tire Debris 12 Cu. Yd. 8 4
59 Boston M.B. - Tire Debris 20 Cu. Yd. 8 5
60 | Hiram M.B. - Tire Debris 20 Cu. Yd. 8 5 Yns 0o /0T /3, 000
61 | Canfield M.B. - Tire Debris 15 Cu. Yd. 8 4 $oC 200 /OO /O FoO
On-Call Service Total 4R, 520
Contract Total (Scheduled + On-Call) 506 80

Notes:

* Annual Total Calculation for On-Call Sites that do not include disposal of a specified number of tons per haul (e.g. Column C is Not Applicable):

Total Hauling Cost

Total Disposal Cost**

Total Lease Cost

(Est.Pickups x Haul Rate ) + ( Est.Pickups x Avg.Tons x Disposal Rate) + (Lease Rate x 12 Months) = Est.Annual Total
x Column B x Column D) + (Column E x 12 Months) = Est. Annual Total (Column F)

(ColumnA xColumnC) + (ColumnA
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* Bids shall contain only firm, net prices void of escalator or other contingent clauses, and shall not
include any state and/or federal taxes.

Above prices shall be net thirty (30) days after delivery and acceptance of the Items covered by the
Contract and receipt of invoice for the same. Any term discount for payment within twenty days
after delivery and acceptance of the Items covered by the Contract and receipt of invoice shall be as
follows: /\/,/ 4 % of Bid price. (See "Discount Terms" in the Additional
Terms.)
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OHIO TURNPIKE AND INFRASTRUCTURE COMMISSION
682 PROSPECT STREET, BEREA, OHIO 44017
DEPARTMENT OF CONTRACTS ADMINISTRATION
440-234-2081
purchasing(@ohioturnpike.org

BID INVITATION NO.: 4454 - REBID
ISSUED: MAY 1, 2024
FOR FURNISHING
WASTE CONTAINER SERVICE
OPENING DATE: 2:00 PM (EASTERN TIME) on MAY 15, 2024

LOCATION: MICROSOFT TEAMS LINK:

Bid Invitation No. 4454 - REBID - Click to Join

SUBMITTED BY:

COMPANY NAME: Republic Services

CONTACT NAME:

STREET ADDRESS: 8123 Jones Rd.

CITY AND STATE: _Cleveland, Ohio ZIP: __ 44105
TELEPHONE NUMBER:

EMAIL:



mailto:purchasing@ohioturnpike.org
https://teams.microsoft.com/l/meetup-join/19%3ameeting_ODgzNjY4ZDItZTgyNi00NTFkLTg4MjAtMjczZWRmMDNiNzkx%40thread.v2/0?context=%7B%22Tid%22%3A%2250f8fcc4-94d8-4f07-84eb-36ed57c7c8a2%22%2C%22Oid%22%3A%2268796240-52e9-4261-9c6c-c92e12be91c5%22%2C%22IsBroadcastMeeting%22%3Atrue%2C%22role%22%3A%22a%22%7D&btype=a&role=a

BID SCHEDULE

Scheduled Service

Item OTIC Location - Material Container Service Frequency Extra Pickup Monthly Rate Annual Total
Size (for reference only) (per month) (12 months x Monthly Rate)
1 Toll Plaza 2 - Trash 4 Cu. Yd. Every Other Week | o bid no bid no bid
2 Toll Plaza 4 — Trash (NEW PLAZA) 4 Cu. Yd. Every Other Week | no bid no bid no bid
3 Toll Plaza 13 - Trash 2 Cu. Yd. Every Other Week | no bid no bid no bid
4 Kunkle M.B. - Recycling 6 Cu. Yd. Every Other Week | no bid no bid no bid
5 Toll Plaza 25 — Trash 96 Gal. Tote Every Other Week | no bid no bid no bid
6 Toll Plaza 34 — Trash 2 Cu. Yd. Every Other Week | no bid no bid no bid
7 Toll Plaza 39 — Trash 96 Gal. Tote Every Other Week | no bid no bid no bid
8 Swanton M.B. - Recycling 6 Cu. Yd. Every Other Week | no bid no bid no bid
9 Toll Plaza 49 — Trash (NEW PLAZA) 4Cu.Yd. Every Other Week | no bid no bid no bid
10 Toll Plaza 52 — Trash 2 Cu. Yd. Every Other Week | no bid no bid no bid
11 Toll Plaza 59 — Trash 2 Cu. Yd. Every Other Week | no bid no bid no bid
12 Toll Plaza 64 — Trash 2 Cu. Yd. Every Other Week | no bid no bid no bid
13 Toll Plaza 71 — Trash 2 Cu. Yd. Every Other Week | no bid no bid no bid
14 Elmore M.B. — Recycling 6 Cu. Yd. Every Other Week | no bid no bid no bid
15 Toll Plaza 81 — Trash 96 Gal. Tote Every Other Week | no bid no bid no bid
16 Toll Plaza 91 — Trash 2 Cu. Yd. Every Other Week | no bid no bid no bid
17 Castalia M.B. — Recydling 6 Cu. Yd. Every Other Week | no bid no bid no bid
18 Toll Plaza 110 — Trash 2 Cu. Yd. Every Other Week | no bid no bid no bid
19 Toll Plaza 118/Post 90 — Trash 6 Cu. Yd. Every Other Week | no bid no bid no bid
20 Toll Plaza 135 - Trash 96 Gal. Tote 1/Month no bid no bid no bid
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BID SCHEDULE

Scheduled Service

Item OTIC Location - Material Container Service Frequency Extra Pickup Monthly Rate Annual Total
Size (for reference only) (per month) (12 months x Monthly Rate)
21 Toll Plaza 140 — Trash 2 Cu. Yd. 1/Month no bid no bid no bid
22 Amherst M.B. — Recycling 6 Cu. Yd. Every Other Week | no bid no bid no bid
23 Toll Plaza 142 — Trash 2 Cu. Yd. Every Other Week | no bid no bid no bid
24 Toll Plaza 145 — Trash 2 Cu. Yd. Every Other Week | no bid no bid no bid
25 Toll Plaza 151 — Trash 2 Cu. Yd. Every Other Week | no bid no bid no bid
26 Toll Plaza 152 — Trash 2 Cu. Yd. Every Other Week | no bid no bid no bid
27 Berea — Trash #1 6 Cu. Yd. Every Other Week | no bid no bid no bid
28 Berea — Trash #2 6 Cu. Yd. Every Other Week | no bid no bid no bid
29 Berea - Recycling 6 Cu. Yd. Every Other Week | no bid no bid no bid
30 Toll Plaza 161 — Trash 2 Cu. Yd. Every Other Week | no bid no bid no bid
31 Toll Plaza 173 — Trash 2 Cu. Yd. Every Other Week | no bid no bid no bid
32 Boston M.B. — Recycling 6 Cu. Yd. Every Other Week | no bid no bid no bid
33 Toll Plaza 180 — Trash 2 Cu. Yd. Every Other Week | no bid no bid no bid
34 Toll Plaza 187 — Trash 2 Cu. Yd. Every Other Week | no bid no bid no bid
35 Toll Plaza 193 — Trash 2 Cu. Yd. Every Other Week | no bid no bid no bid
36 Hiram M.B. — Recycling 6 Cu. Yd. Every Other Week | no bid no bid no bid
37 Toll Plaza 209 — Trash 2 Cu. Yd. Every Other Week | no bid no bid no bid
38 Toll Plaza 211 — Trash (NEW PLAZA) 4Cu. Yd. Every Other Week | no bid no bid no bid
39 Toll Plaza 215 — Trash 96 Gal. Tote Every Other Week | no bid no bid no bid
40 Toll Plaza 216 — Trash 96 Gal. Tote Every Other Week | no bid no bid no bid
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BID SCHEDULE

Scheduled Service

Item OTIC Location - Material Container Service Frequency Extra Pickup Monthly Rate Annual Total
Size (for reference only) (per month) (12 months x Monthly Rate)
41 Toll Plaza 218 — Trash 2 Cu. Yd. Every Other Week | n© bid no bid no bid
42 Canfield M.B. — Recycling 6 Cu. Yd. Every Other Week | no bid no bid no bid
43 Toll Plaza 232 - Trash 2Cu. Yd. Every Other Week | no bid no bid no bid
44 Toll Plaza 234 - Trash 2Cu. Yd. Every Other Week | o bid no bid no bid
45 Toll Plaza 239 - Trash 2 Cu. Yd. Every Other Week | o bid no bid no bid
Scheduled Service Total | no bid
(Total
On-Call Service
Column A Column B Column C Column D Column E Column F
" Disposal Rate Annual Total*_
Item OTIC Location - Material Current Size Est. Avg. Tons Haul Rate (per ton) Lease Rate (See below for details on
Pickups (per haul) (per month) how the annual total should
be calculated)
46 Kunkle M.B. - Trash 20 Cu. Yd. 12 3 no bid no bid no bid no bid
47 Swanton M.B. - Trash 30 Cu. Yd. 12 4 no bid no bid no bid no bid
48 Elmore M.B. - Trash 30 Cu. Yd. 12 4 no bid no bid no bid no bid
49 Castalia M.B. - Trash 30 Cu. Yd. 12 5 no bid no bid no bid no bid
50 Amherst M.B. - Trash 30 Cu. Yd. 12 5 no bid no bid no bid no bid
51 Boston M.B. - Trash 40 Cu. Yd. 12 6 no bid no bid no bid no bid
52 Hiram M.B. - Trash 40 Cu. Yd. 12 6 no bid no bid no bid no bid
53 Canfield M.B. - Trash 40 Cu. Yd. 12 6 no bid no bid no bid no bid
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On-Call Service

Column A| Column B Column C Column D Column E Column F
Est Haul Rat Disposal Rate L Rat Annual Total"f
Item OTIC Location - Material Current Size St Avg. Tons au’ Rate (per ton) ease Rate (See below for details on
Pickup (per haul) (per month) how the annual total should
be calculated)
54 Kunkle M.B. - Tire Debris 12 Cu. Yd. 8 3 no bid no bid no bid no bid
55 Swanton M.B. - Tire Debris 12 Cu. Yd. 8 3 no bid no bid no bid no bid
56 Elmore M.B. - Tire Debris 42 Cu. Yd. 6 8 no bid no bid no bid no bid
57 Castalia M.B. - Tire Debris 12 Cu. Yd. 8 4 no bid no bid no bid no bid
58 Amherst M.B. - Tire Debris 12 Cu. Yd. 8 4 no bid no bid no bid no bid
59 Boston M.B. - Tire Debris 20 Cu. Yd. 8 5 no bid no bid no bid no bid
60 Hiram M.B. - Tire Debris 20 Cu. Yd. 8 5 no bid no bid no bid no bid
61 Canfield M.B. - Tire Debris 15 Cu. Yd. 8 4 no bid no bid no bid no bid
On-Call Service Total| o bid
Contract Total (Scheduled + On-Call) |nobid
Notes:

* Annual Total Calculation for On-Call Sites that do not include disposal of a specified number of tons per haul (e.g. Column Cis Not Applicable):

Total Hauling Cost Total Disposal Cost** Total Lease Cost

(Est. Pickups x Haul Rate ) + ( Est. Pickups x Avg. Tons x Disposal Rate ) + (Lease Rate x 12 Months ) = Est. Annual Total
(Column A x Column C ) + (Column A x Column B x Column D) + (Column E x 12 Months ) = Est. Annual Total (ColumnF )




* Bids shall contain only firm, net prices void of escalator or other contingent clauses, and shallnot
include any state and/or federal taxes.

Above prices shall be net thirty (30) days after delivery and acceptance of the Items covered by the
Contract and receipt of invoice for the same. Any term discount for payment within twenty days
after delivery and acceptance of the Items covered by the Contract and receipt of invoice shall be as
follows: £~ % of Bid price. (See "Discount Terms" in the Additional
Terms.)
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OHIO TURNPIKE AND INFRASTRUCTURE COMMISSION
682 PROSPECT STREET, BEREA, OHIO 44017
DEPARTMENT OF CONTRACTS ADMINISTRATION
440-234-2081
purchasing(@ohioturnpike.org

BID INVITATION NO.: 4454 - REBID
ISSUED: MAY 1, 2024
FOR FURNISHING
WASTE CONTAINER SERVICE
OPENING DATE: 2:00 PM (EASTERN TIME) on MAY 15, 2024

LOCATION: MICROSOFT TEAMS LINK:

Bid Invitation No. 4454 - REBID - Click to Join

SUBMITTED BY:

COMPANY NAME: Stevens Disposal and Recycling Service Inc.

CONTACT NAME:

STREET ADDRESS: 16929 Ida West Rd.

CITY AND STATE: _Petersburg, MI ZIP: 49270
TELEPHONE NUMBER:

EMAIL:



mailto:purchasing@ohioturnpike.org
https://teams.microsoft.com/l/meetup-join/19%3ameeting_ODgzNjY4ZDItZTgyNi00NTFkLTg4MjAtMjczZWRmMDNiNzkx%40thread.v2/0?context=%7B%22Tid%22%3A%2250f8fcc4-94d8-4f07-84eb-36ed57c7c8a2%22%2C%22Oid%22%3A%2268796240-52e9-4261-9c6c-c92e12be91c5%22%2C%22IsBroadcastMeeting%22%3Atrue%2C%22role%22%3A%22a%22%7D&btype=a&role=a

BID SCHEDULE

Scheduled Service

Item OTIC Location - Material %t Frequency Extra Pickup Monthly Rate Annual Total
1 Toll Plaza 2 - Trash 4 Cu. Yd. Every Other Week
2 Toll Plaza 4 — Trash (wvew prLAzA) 4 Cu. Yd. Every Other Week
3 Toll Plaza 13 - Trash 2 Cu. Yd. Every Other Week
4 Kunkle M.B. - Recycling 6 Cu. Yd. Every Other Week
5 Toll Plaza 25 — Trash 96 Gal. Tote Every Other Week
6 Toll Plaza 34 — Trash 2Cu.Yd. | Every Other Week $50.00 $55.00 $660.00
7 Toll Plaza 39 — Trash 96 Gal. Tote | Every Other Week $50.00 $35.00 $420.00
8 Swanton M.B. - Recycling 6 Cu. Yd. Every Other Week $75.00 $85.00 $1,020.00
9 Toll Plaza 49 — Trash (vew PLAZA) 4 Cu. Yd. Every Other Week $65.00 $75.00 $900.00
10 Toll Plaza 52 — Trash 2 Cu. Yd. Every Other Week $50.00 $55.00 $660.00
11 Toll Plaza 59 — Trash 2 Cu. Yd. Every Other Week $50.00 $55.00 $660.00
12 Toll Plaza 64 — Trash 2 Cu. Yd. Every Other Week $50.00 $55.00 $660.00
13 Toll Plaza 71 — Trash 2 Cu. Yd. Every Other Week $50.00 $55.00 $660.00
14 Elmore M.B. — Recycling 6 Cu. Yd. Every Other Week $75.00 $85.00 $1020.00
15 Toll Plaza 81 — Trash 96 Gal. Tote | Every Other Week $50.00 $35.00 $420.00
16 Toll Plaza 91 — Trash 2Cu.Yd. | Every Other Week $50.00 $55.00 $660.00
17 Castalia M.B. — Recycling 6 Cu. Yd. Every Other Week
18 Toll Plaza 110 - Trash 2Cu.Yd, | EveryOther Week
19 Toll Plaza 118/Post 90 — Trash 6 Cu.Yd, | Every Other Week
20 Toll Plaza 135 — Trash 96 Gal. Tote 1/Month




BID SCHEDULE

Scheduled Service

ltem |  OTICLocation - Material %;ner Service Frequency (ﬂ%&rt_';f:%rﬁy) %a)’tg (12 m?n'lh"s"f—m Rate)

21 Toll Plaza 140 — Trash 2 Cu, Yd. 1/Month

22 Amherst M.B. — Recycling 6 Cu. Yd. Every Other Week
23 Toil Plaza 142 — Trash 2 Cu. Yd, Every Other Week
24 Toll Plaza 145 — Trash 2 Cu. Yd. Every Other Week
25 Toll Plaza 151 — Trash 2 Cu. Yd. Every Other Week
26 Toll Plaza 152 - Trash 2 Cu. Yd. Every Other Week
27 Berea — Trash #1 6 Cu. Yd. Every Other Week
28 Berea — Trash #2 6 Cu. Yd. Every Other Week
29 Berea - Recycling 6 Cu. Yd. Every Other Week
30 Toll Plaza 161 — Trash 2 Cu. Yd. Every Other Week
31 Toll Plaza 173 — Trash 2 Cu. Yd. Every Other Week
32 Boston M.B. — Recycling 6 Cu, Yd. Every Other Week
33 Toll Plaza 180 — Trash 2 Cu. Yd. Every Other Week
34 Toll Plaza 187 — Trash 2 Cu. Yd. Every Other Week
35 Toll Plaza 193 - Trash 2 Cu. Yd. Every Other Week
36 Hiram M.B. — Recyding 6 Cu, Yd. Every Other Week
37 Toll Plaza 209 — Trash 2 Cu. Yd. Every Other Week
38 Toll Plaza 211 — Trash (vew pLAZA) 4 Cu. Yd. Every Other Week
39 Toll Plaza 215 — Trash 96 Gal. Tote Every Other Week
40 Toll Plaza 216 — Trash 96 Gal. Tote | Every Other Week




BID SCHEDULE

Scheduled Service

Item OTIC Location - Material Co';;ii:e": Service Frequency (f%y) M?p—'g:\:%r::‘:% 12 m% Rate)

41 Toll Plaza 218 — Trash 2 Cu. Yd. Every Other Week

42 Canfield M.B. — Recycling 6 Cu. Yd. Every Other Week

43 Toll Plaza 232 — Trash 2 Cu. Yd. Every Other Week

44 Toll Plaza 234 - Trash 2 Cu. Yd. Every Other Week

45 Toll Plaza 239 — Trash 2 Cu. Yd. Every Other Week

Scheduled Service Total $7740.00
(Total of all Scheduled Service Annual Totals) '
On-Call Service
ColumnA | Column B Column C Column D Colurmn E Column F
: Annual Total*
Item OTIC Location - Material Current Size ﬁg Avg. Tons "‘——ﬂ—'l‘(l::: I:Z E:]tl;! gﬁ(%%rs%:_?ﬁ —"E;::;;at:s h(gsve?hzeala?\vr:ufglr t(:)‘ta;?i;j\gl:\l d
be calculated)

46 Kunkle M.B. - Trash 20 Cu. Yd. 12 3

47 Swanton M.B. - Trash CuYd | 12 4 $180.00 ) QLPErtan [ sq55%0 YEOuEtE

48 Elmore M.B. - Trash 30 Cu. Yd. 12 4

49 Castalia M.B. - Trash 30 Cu. Yd. 12 5

50 Ambherst M.B. - Trash 30 Cu. Yd. 12 5

51 Boston M.B. - Trash 40 Cu. Yd. 12 6

52 Hiram M.B. - Trash 40 Cu. Yd. 12 6

53 Canfield M.B. - Trash 40Cu.Yd | 12 6 $180.00 $50.00 perton | §125.00 $7.260.00
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On-Call Service

Column A| Column B Column C Column D Column £ Column F
Item OTIC Location - Material Current Size .& Avg. Tons Haul Rate 15(%:):?@ Lease Rate (Seeﬁggl‘:::;%tggls i
= ————————x Pickups (per haul) (per month) how the annual total should
be calaulated)
54 Kunkle M.B. - Tire Debris 12 Cu. Yd. 8 g $180.00 $50.00 per ton $125.00 $4,140.00
55 Swanton M.B. - Tire Debris 12 Cu. Yd. 8 3
56 Elmore M.B. - Tire Debris 42 Cu. Yd. 6 8
57 Castalia M.B. - Tire Debris 12 Cu. Yd. 8 4
58 Ambherst M.B. - Tire Debris 12 Cu. Yd. 8 4
59 Boston M.B. - Tire Debris 20 Cu. Yd. 8 5
60 Hiram M.B. - Tire Debris 20 Cu. Yd. 8 5
61 Canfield M.B. - Tire Debris 15 Cu. Yd. 8 4
On-Call Service Total $17,460.00
Contract Total (Scheduled + On-Call) $25,200.00

Notes:

* Annual Total Calculation for On-Call Sites that do not include disposal of a specified number of tons per haul (e.g. Column C is Not Applicable):

Total Hauling Cost Total Disposal Cost**

Total Lease Cost

(Est.Pickups x Haul Rate ) + ( Est.Pickups x Avg.Tons x Disposal Rate) + (Lease Rate x 12 Months) = Est.Annual Total
(ColumnA x Column(C) + (ColumnA x Column B x Column D) + (Column E x 12 Months) = Est.Annual Total (Column F)
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* Bids shall contain only firm, net prices void of escalator or other contingent clauses, and shallnot
include any state and/or federal taxes.

Above prices shall be net thirty (30) days after delivery and acceptance of the Items covered by the
Contract and receipt of invoice for the same. Any term discount for payment within twenty days
after delivery and acceptance of the Items covered by the Contract and receipt of invoice shall be as
follows: 0.00 % of Bid price. (See "Discount Terms" in the Additional

Terms.)
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OHIO TURNPIKE AND INFRASTRUCTURE COMMISSION
682 PROSPECT STREET, BEREA, OHIO 44017
DEPARTMENT OF CONTRACTS ADMINISTRATION
440-234-2081
purchasing(@ohioturnpike.org

BID INVITATION NO.: 4454 - REBID
ISSUED: MAY 1, 2024
FOR FURNISHING
WASTE CONTAINER SERVICE
OPENING DATE: 2:00 PM (EASTERN TIME) on MAY 15, 2024

LOCATION: MICROSOFT TEAMS LINK:

Bid Invitation No. 4454 - REBID - Click to Join

SUBMITTED BY:

COMPANY NAME: Waste Management of Ohio, Inc.

CONTACT NAME:

STREET ADDRESS: 6705 Richmond Rd.

CITY AND STATE: _Solon, Ohio ZIP: 44139
TELEPHONE NUMBER:

EMAIL:



mailto:purchasing@ohioturnpike.org
https://teams.microsoft.com/l/meetup-join/19%3ameeting_ODgzNjY4ZDItZTgyNi00NTFkLTg4MjAtMjczZWRmMDNiNzkx%40thread.v2/0?context=%7B%22Tid%22%3A%2250f8fcc4-94d8-4f07-84eb-36ed57c7c8a2%22%2C%22Oid%22%3A%2268796240-52e9-4261-9c6c-c92e12be91c5%22%2C%22IsBroadcastMeeting%22%3Atrue%2C%22role%22%3A%22a%22%7D&btype=a&role=a

Ohio Turnpike and Infrastructure Commission Bid

Invitation No.: 4454 - Waste Container Service

BID SCHEDULE

Scheduled Service
Item OTIC Location - Material m&g.l.guﬂ.t Service Frequency (for reference only) (per month) (12 months x Monthly Rate)
1 Toll Plaza 2 - Trash 4 Cu. Yd. Every Other Week N/A
2 Toll Plaza 4 — Trash (vew prLaz4) 4 Cu. Yd. Every Other Week N/A
3 Toll Plaza 13 - Trash 2 Cu. Yd. Every Other Week N/A
4 Kunkle M.B. - Recycling 6 Cu. Yd. Every Other Week N/A
5 Toll Plaza 25 — Trash 96 Gal. Tote Every Other Week N/A
6 Toll Plaza 34 — Trash 2 Cu. Yd. Every Other Week $100.00 $55.00 $660.00
7 Toll Plaza 39 — Trash 96 Gal. Tote Every Other Week N/A
8 Swanton M.B. - Recycling 6 Cu. Yd. Every Other Week $150.00 $85.00 $1,020.00
9 Toll Plaza 49 — Trash (vew Fraza) 4 Cu. Yd. Every Other Week $100.00 $75.00 $900.00
10 Toll Plaza 52 — Trash 2 Cu. Yd. Every Other Week $100.00 $55.00 $660.00
1 Toll Plaza 59 — Trash 2 Cu. Yd. Every Other Week $100.00 $55.00 $660.00
12 Toll Plaza 64 — Trash 2 Cu. Yd. Every Other Week $100.00 $55.00 $660.00
13 Toll Plaza 71 — Trash 2 Cu. Yd. Every Other Week $100.00) $55.00 $660.00
14 Elmore M.B. — Recycling 6 Cu. Yd. Every Other Week $150.00 $85.00 $1,020.00
15 Toll Plaza 81 — Trash 96 Gal. Tote Every Other Week N/A
16 Toll Plaza 91 - Trash 2 Cu. Yd. Every Other Week $100.00 $55.00 $660.00
17 Castalia M.B. — Recycling 6 Cu. Yd. Every Other Week N/A
18 Toll Plaza 110 — Trash 2 Cu. Yd. Every Other Week N/A
10 Toll Plaza 118/Post 90 — Trash 6 Cu. Yd. Every Other Week $100.00 $78.00 $936.00
20 Toll Plaza 135 - Trash 96 Gal. Tote 1/Month N/A
Highlighted Recycle Services: Cardboard only Recycling provided in this area.
6-2
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Ohio Turnpike and Infrastructure Commission Bid
Invitation No.: 4454 - Waste Container Service

BID SCHEDULE

Scheduled Service
liem OTIC Location - Material Lmﬁna;uﬂ Service Frequency. (for reference only) (per manth) (12 months x Manthly Rate)
21 Toll Plaza 140 — Trash 2 Cu. Yd. 1/Month N/A
22 Amherst M.B. — Recycling 6 Cu. Yd. Every Other Week N/A
23 Toll Plaza 142 — Trash 2 Cu. Yd. Every Other Week N/A
24 Toll Plaza 145 — Trash 2 Cu. Yd. Every Other Week $100.00 $77.00 $924.00
25 Toll Plaza 151 — Trash 2 Cu. Yd. Every Other Week $100.00 $73.00 $876.00
26 Toll Plaza 152 — Trash 2 Cu. Yd. Every Other Week $100.00 $73.00 $876.00
27 Berea — Trash #1 6 Cu. Yd. Every Other Week $100.00 $76.00 $912.00
28 Berea — Trash #2 6 Cu. Yd. Every Other Week $100.00 $76.00 $912.00
29 Berea - Recycling 6 Cu. Yd. Every Other Week $150.00 $90.00 $1,080.00
30 Toll Plaza 161 — Trash 2 Cu. Yd. Every Other Week $100.00 $73.00 $876.00
3 Toll Plaza 173 — Trash 2 Cu. Yd. Every Other Week $100.00 $74.00 $888.00
32 Boston M.B. — Recycling 6 Cu. Yd. Every Other Week $100.00 $90.00 $1,080.00
33 Toll Plaza 180 — Trash 2 Cu. Yd. Every Other Week $100.00 $74.00 $888.00
34 Toll Plaza 187 — Trash 2 Cu. Yd. Every Other Week $100.00 $76.00 $912.00
35 Toll Plaza 193 — Trash 2 Cu. Yd. Every Other Week $100.00 $76.00 $912.00
36 Hiram M.B. — Recycling 6 Cu. Yd. Every Other Week N/A
37 Toll Plaza 209 — Trash 2 Cu. Yd. Every Other Week $100.00 $81.00 $972.00
38 Toll Plaza 211 — Trash (vew FLaz4) 4 Cu. Yd. Every Other Week $100.00 $96.00 $1,152.00
39 Toll Plaza 215 — Trash 96 Gal. Tote Every Other Week N/A
40 Toll Plaza 216 — Trash 96 Gal. Tote Every Other Week N/A
6-3
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BID SCHEDULE

Scheduled Service
Ltem OTIC Location - Material mﬁi;m Service Frequency (for reference only) (per month) (12 months :-: Monthly Rate)
4 Toll Plaza 218 — Trash 2 Cu. Yd. Every Other Week $100.00) $67.00 $804.00
42 Canfield M.B. — Recyding 6 Cu. Yd. Every Other Week $150.00) $150.00 $1,800.00
43 Toll Plaza 232 — Trash 2 Cu. Yd. Every Other Week $100.00) $67.00 $804.00
44 Toll Plaza 234 — Trash 2 Cu. Yd. Every Other Week $100.00 $67.00 $804.00
45 Toll Plaza 239 — Trash 2 Cu. Yd. Every Other Week $100.00 $67.00 $804.00
Scheduled Service Total $26,112.00
(Total of all Scheduled Service Annual Totals)
On-Call Service
Column A Column B Column C Column D Column £ Column F
Disposal Rate AnnuaITotaI*_
Item OTIC Location - Material Current Size ﬁl& Avg. Tons m (per ton ) m hr;()fqeih:e ;?:uf;rtgi;?gic?ﬂl d
be calculated)
46 Kunkle M.B. - Trash 20 Cu. Yd. 12 3 N/A
47 Swanton M.B. - Trash 30 Cu. Yd. 12 4 $364.00 $58.00 $95.00 $8,292.00
48 Elmore M.B. - Trash 30 Cu. Yd. 12 4 $325.00 $58.00 $95.00 $7,824.00
49 Castalia M.B. - Trash 30 Cu. Yd. 12 5 N/A
50 Amherst M.B. - Trash 30 Cu. Yd. 12 5 N/A
51 Boston M.B. - Trash 40 Cu. Yd. 12 6 $297.00 $66.00 $95.00 $9,456.00
52 Hiram M.B. - Trash 40 Cu. Yd. 12 6 $440.00 $53.00 $95.00 $10,236.00
53 Canfield M.B. - Trash 40 Cu. Yd. 12 6 $295.00 $53.00 $95.00 $8,496.00
6-4
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Column A Column B Column € Column D Column £ Column F
Disposal Rate Annual Total*
. : . Est. Haul Rate 215posa’ Zate Lease Rate (See below for details on

Item OTIC Location - Material Current Size Pickups Avg. Tons (per haul) (perton ) (per month) how the annual total should

be calculated)
54 Kunkle M.B. - Tire Debris 12 Cu. Yd. 8 3 N/A
55 | Swanton M.B. - Tire Debris 12 Cu. Yd. 8 3 N/A
56 Elmore M.B. - Tire Debris 42 Cu. Yd. 6 8 N/A
57 Castalia M.B. - Tire Debris 12 Cu. Yd. 8 4 N/A
58 | Amherst M.B. - Tire Debris 12 Cu. Yd. 8 4 N/A
59 Boston M.B. - Tire Debris 20 Cu. Yd. 8 5 $730.00 $395.00 $95.00 $22,780.00
60 Hiram M.B. - Tire Debris 20 Cu. Yd. 8 5 $1,085.00 $395.00 $95.00 $25,620.00
61 | Canfield M.B. - Tire Debris 15 Cu. Yd. 8 4 N/A
On-Call Service Total $92,704.00
Contract Total (Scheduled + On-Call) $118,816.00

MNotes:

*Annual Total Calculation for On-Call Sites that do not include disposal of a specified number of tons per haul (e.g. Column C is Not Applicable):
Total Disposal Cost**
(Est. Pickups x Haul Rate ) + ( Est.Pickups x Avg.Tons x Disposal Rate) + (Lease Rate x 12 Months) = Est. Annual Total

(Column A

Total Hauling Cost

x ColumnC) + (Column A

x Column B x Column D)

Total Lease Cost

+ (Column E x 12 Months) = Est. Annual Total (Column F)
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Exception and Clarifications

WM, the Great Lakes Area, those at the WM - Cleveland Hauling District, and all the WM professionals who would provide services to the Ohio
Turnpike and Infrastructure Commission want to reiterate our commitment to you - that WM is prepared to meet the service expectations for Bid
Invitation No.: 4454. We aim to forge direct ties and a business relationship by implementing this proposal. We offer the following exceptions and
clarifications for your consideration and possible future negotiations.

Page Section Description of Exception
#
3-5 3.J. Contractor takes exception to the applicability of Ohio’s Prevailing Wage Rate because the waste removal

services requested by the Commission most likely do not apply this Act.
3 Line: Delete “the laws relating to the payment of wages”.

3-6 3.P. Contractor takes exception to a 14-day notice. Revise to 30-days.
3-7 3.S.(i)(a) Contractor takes exception to this provision as written. WM’s hold harmless obligation should be fault-based
3-8 3.S.(i(a) in that it is limited to claims, damages, or losses to the extent caused by WM’s negligence, breach of
Agreement, or violation of law.

3-9 3.Y. Wages and Contractor takes exception to the applicability of Ohio’s Prevailing Wage Rate because the waste removal
Hours and services requested by the Commission most likely do not apply this Act. This paragraph needs to be
subparagraphs revised so that it's clear we are not agreeing to comply with the Prevailing Wage Rate and that the

5-2 (@) - (c)(i.-v.) Prevailing Wage Rate does not apply. Any reference to the
4th Bullet Prevailing Wage Rate needs to be deleted

4-1 2.(a) & (b, 2 1)) Contractor takes exception to the Commission’s unilateral ability to renew or extend the contract. Any

option to renew or extend the contract shall be mutually agreeable by the parties.

7 Contractor takes exception to all inclusive fees. Contractor requests to charge pass through
uncontrollable increases due to increase in disposal, governmental, transportation) Overage Service
Charges at $150.00/per incident. Front Load Recycle Contamination Charges at
$12.00/yd under 30% contaminated. Front Load Recycle contamination charge of $260.00 for a 6yd if
over 30% contaminated. Roll off Trip charge: $275.00, Roll off Dig Out charge: $150.00.

8-1 Part 8, (a) Insert the attached Single Stream Specifications.
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SINGLE STREAM SPECIFICATIONS

RECYCLABLES must be dry, loose (not bagged), unshredded, empty, and include ONLY the following:

Aluminum cans Newspaper

PET bottles with the symbol #1 — with screw tops only Mail

HDPE plastic bottles with the symbol #2 (milk, water bottles detergent, and Uncoated paperboard (ex. cereal boxes; food and snack
shampoo bottles, etc.) boxes)

PP plastic bottles and tubs with symbol # 5 - empty Uncoated printing, writing and office paper

Steel and tin cans Old corrugated containers/cardboard (uncoated)

Glass food and beverage containers* — brown, clear, or green Magazines, glossy inserts and pamphlets

NON-RECYCLABLES include, but are not limited to the following:

Plastic bags and bagged materials (even if containing Microwavable trays

Recyclables)

Porcelain and ceramics Mirrors, window or auto glass

Light bulbs Coated cardboard

Soiled paper, including paper plates, cups and pizza Plastics not listed above including but not limited to those with symbols #3*, #4*,
boxes #6*, #7* and unnumbered plastics, including utensils
Expanded polystyrene Coat hangers

Glass and metal cookware/bakeware Household appliances and electronics,

Hoses, cords, wires Yard waste, construction debris, and wood

Flexible plastic or film packaging and multi- laminated Needles, syringes, IV bags or other medical supplies
materials

Food waste and liquids, containers containing such Textiles, cloth, or any fabric (bedding, pillows, sheets, etc.)
items

W ‘
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Excluded Materials or containers which contained Napkins, paper towels, tissue, paper plates, and paper cups
Excluded Materials

Any paper Recyclable materials or pieces of paper Propane tanks, batteries
Recyclables less than 4” in size in any dimension

Cartons* Aseptic Containers*

DELIVERY SPECIFICATIONS:

Material delivered by or on behalf of Customer may not contain Non-Recyclables or Excluded Materials. “Excluded Materials” means radioactive,
volatile, corrosive, flammable, explosive, biomedical, infectious, bio-hazardous or toxic substance or material, or regulated medical or hazardous
waste as defined by, characterized or listed under applicable federal, state, or local laws or regulations, materials containing information (in hard
copy or electronic format, or otherwise) which information is protected or regulated under any local, state or federal privacy or data security laws,
including, but not limited to the Health Insurance Portability and Accountability Act of 1996, as amended, or other regulations or ordinances or
other materials that are deleterious or capable of causing material damage to any part of Company's property, its personnel or the public or
materially impair the strength or the durability of Company's structures or equipment.

Company may reject in whole or in part, or may process, in its sole discretion, Recyclables not meeting the specifications, including wet materials,
and Customer shall pay Company for all increased costs, losses and expenses incurred with respect to such non-conforming Recyclables
including costs for handling, processing, transporting and/or disposing of such non- conforming Recyclable Materials which charges may include
an amount for Company's operating or profit margin (“Cost”).

Without limiting the foregoing, and Customer shall pay a contamination charge for additional handling, processing, transporting and/or disposing of
Non-Recyclables, Excluded Materials, and/or all or part of non-conforming loads and additional charges may be assessed for bulky items such as
appliances, concrete, furniture, mattresses, tires, electronics, pallets, yard waste, propane tanks, etc.

Company reserves the right upon notice to discontinue acceptance of any category of materials set forth above as a result of market conditions
related to such materials and makes no representations as to the recyclability of the materials. Collected Recyclables for which no commercially
reasonable market exists may be landfilled at Customer’s Cost.

* Glass may not be accepted in all locations. Cartons, aseptic containers and other plastics may be allowed if approved in writing by Company.

V6 February 2019
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BID INVITATION NO. 4454 - WASTE CONTAINER SERVICE

BID INVITATION NO. 4454 ITEMS 2-5, 46 & 47 AWARDED TO ARCHBOLD REFUSE
SERVICE

BID INVITATION NO. 4454 ITEMS 50, 54, & 56-61 AWARDED TO HEITSCHE TLD
DUMPSTERS, LLC

BID INVITATION NO. 4454 ITEMS 16, 48 & 49 AWARDED TO LAKE DISPOSAL
SERVICES

BID INVITATION NO. 4454 ITEMS 35-45 & 52 AWARDED TO OHIO VALLEY WASTE
SERVICES, INC.

BID INVITATION NO. 4454 ITEMS 6-15 & 55 AWARDED TO STEVENS DISPOSAL AND
RECYCLING SERVICE, INC.

BID INVITATION NO. 4454 ITEMS 19, 24-34, 51 & 53 AWARDED TO WASTE
MANAGEMENT
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